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FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 3, 1922.

Privy Council Office,
31st January, 1922.

GOVERNMENT OF IRELAND ACT, 1920.

Notice is hereby given, that after the expira-
tion of 40 days from the date hereof, it is
proposed to submit to His Majesty in Council
the draft of an Order in Council under section
69 of the above Act, entitled the Government
of Ireland (Adjustment of Payments) Order,
1922.

Notice is hereby further given, that, in
accordance with the provisions of the Rules
Publication Act, 1893, copies of the aforesaid
Order in Council can be obtained by any public
body within 40 days of the date of this Notice
at the Privy Council Office, Whitehall.

GOVERNMENT OF NORTHERN IRELAND.
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE.

"WHEREAS, by an Act passed in the first
year of the reign of His Majesty King George
the Fourth, entitled " An Act for granting a
certain sum of money towards improving the
Harbour of Donaghadee in Ireland, and render-
ing it a more fit situation for His Majesty's
packets," it was enacted that the several persons
theretofore appointed by the Lord Lieutenant
of Ireland for the time being, for the purpose
of carrying into execution the provisions of the
said Act, and such other person or persons as
should or might from time to time b& appointed
or were authorised by the Lord Lieutenant or

other Chief Governor or Governors of Ireland
for the time being, should be and they were
thereby appointed Commissioners for the pur-
poses of the said Act, and that it should be
lawful for the Lord Lieutenant or other Chief
Governor or Governors of Ireland fcr the- time
being to revoke the appointment of any such
person or persons to be so appointed, and from
time to time to nominate and appoint such
Commissioner or Commissioners as such Lord
Lieutenant or other Chief Governor or
Governors of Ireland for the time being shall
think fit.

And whereas the powers and duties of the
Lord Lieutenant of Ireland in relation to
Harbours were by the Ministry of Transport.
Act, 1919, and an Order in Council dated 26th
April, 1920, transferred to the Ministry of
Transport.

And whereas the functions hitherto dis-
charged by the Ministry of Transport in relation
to the matters hereinbefore mentioned are, by
the operation of the Government of Ireland
Act, 1920, and the Orders of His Majesty in
Council, and directions of the Lord Lieutenant,
made and given under the said Act, as from
the 1st day of January, 1922, transferred to
the Ministry of Commerce for Northern
Ireland, in so far as the said functions relate to
Irish Services in Northern Ireland.

The Ministry of Commerce hereby, in pursu-
ance of the powers vested in that Ministry as
aforesaid, revokes the Warrant whereby Sir
Philip Hanson, C.B.: Thomas Philip Lefami,
Esquire, C.B.; Andrew Robinson, Esquire.
C.B.E., M.V.O., Commissioners of Public
Works, were appointed Commissioners for the


