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FEIDAY, MAY 2, 1930.
Parliament Buildings,

Belfast, 30th April, 1930.

This day His Grace the Governor of Northern
Ireland was pleased, in the name of and on
"behalf of His Majesty the King, to give his
Assent to the following Bills agreed upon by
both Houses of the Parliament of Northern
Ireland: —

Housing;
Exchequer and Financial Provisions;
Criminal Law and Prevention of Crime

(Amendment) ;
Public Roads.

MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS FOR
NORTHERN IRELAND.
EXPLOSIVES ACT, 1875.

WHEREAS Sergeant R. M'Laughlin (1328),
of the Royal Ulster Constabulary, was, on the
25th day of September, 1925, appointed to be
an Inspector for Northern Ireland under the
Explosives Act, 1875;

And Whereas the said Sergeant R. M'Laugh-
lin has received an appointment in which he is
no longer available for the duties of Inspector;

Now, I, The Right Honourable Sir Richard
Dawson Bates, being the Minister of Home
Affairs for Northern Ireland, in virtue of the
power conferred on me by Section 53 of the said
Act, and of every other power enabling me in
this behalf, do hereby order that the said
Sergeant R. M'Laughlin shall, from this date,
cease to exercise the powers and perform the
duties of an Inspector under the said Act.

R. DAWS9N BATES,
Minister of Home Affairs for

Northern Ireland.
Belfast,

25th April, 1930.

MERCHANDISE MARKS ACT, 1926.
IMPORTED MALT PRODUCTS.

The draft of an Order in Council to require
imported malt products to be marked with an
indication of origin in accordance with the
Merchandise Marks Act, 1926, has been laid
before Parliament, as required by Section 7 of
the Act.

The text of the draft Order in Council appears
in the Board of Trade Journal of the 1st May,
1930, and copies of the draft Order can b&
obtained from His Majesty's Stationery Office,.
Adastral House, Kingsway, London, W.C.2,
and branches, either directly or through any
bookseller.

EXPLOSIVES ACT, 1875.
In virtue of the power conferred on me by

Section 53 of the Explosives Act, 1875, and of
every other power enabling me in this behalf, I,
the Right Honourable Sir Richard Dawson
Bates,being the Minister of Home Affairs for
Northern Ireland, hereby appoint Sergeant F.
Thornton (No. 3072), of the Royal Ulster
Constabulary, as an Inspector for Northern
Ireland under the said Act, and do hereby
direct him to exercise only such powers and to
perform such duties under the said Act as I shall
from time to time assign to him.

R. DAWSON BATES,
Minister of Home Affairs for

Northern Ireland.
Belfast,

25th April, 1930.

BANN DRAINAGE.
PUBLIC NOTICE.

NOTICE is hereby given that the Ministry of
Finance has prepared a draft Scheme for the
better drainage of Lough Neagh and the River


