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FKLDAY, JULY 21, 1922.

ORDER.

CIVIL AUTHORITIES ( S P E C I A L
POWERS) ACT (NORTHERN IRE-
LAND), 1922.

I, the Right Hon. Sir Richard Dawson Bates,
Minister of Home Affairs for Northern Irela.nd,
being the Civil Authority under the Civil
Authorities (Special Powers) Act (Northern
Ireland), 1922, by virtue of the powers vested
in me by the said Act, and the Regulations
made thereunder, and of all other powers
enabling me in this behalf, do hereby Order
and Require every person within the area
specified in the Schedule hereto to remain
within doors between the hours of 9-30 o'clock
p.m. and 6 o'clock a.m., unless provided with
a permit in writing from the Commissioner of
Police for the City of Belfast, or some person
duly authorised by him.

This Order shall come into force at 9-30
o'clock p.m. on this 20th day of July, 1922.

This Order varies the Order made by me on
the 8th day of June, 1922, in so far as that
Order prescribed the hours between which
persons should remain within doors within the
area specified in the Schedule hereto, but not
otherwise.

SCHEDULE.

The following area within the County of the
City of Belfast,—that is to say: The -area
enclosed by and including the following roads
and streets—Oldpark Road, from the south-
east corner of St. Silas's Church to Louisa
Street, Louisa Street, thence in a straight line
from the end of Louisa Street to the south-west

end of Ardilea Street, and thence in a straight
line to Oldpark Road at St. Silas's Church.
Provided that St. Silas's Church is not included
in the said area, and that through traffic shall
be allowed in Oldpark Road up to 11
o'clock p.m.

Given under my hand at Belfast this 20th day
of July, 1922.

R. DAWSON BATES,
Minister of Home Affairs for Northern

Ireland, Civil Authority.

NOTES.

1. The Order of the 8th June, 1922, imposed
Curfew from 11 p.m. to 6 a.m. within the
County of the City of Belfast.

2. Under this Order and the Regulations
above specified every person who is in the area
to which this Order, applies during . Curfew
hours must during those hours either remain in
his usual place of abode, or at a hotel or
registered lodging house where he* is duly
registered. If he intends to stay elsewhere
during Curfew hours he must give previous
notice to the Police at the Police Station nearest
to the house where he intends to stay of his
intention t-o stay therein.

3. Inmates of, or persons engaged at schools,
hospitals, or other charitable or religious insti-
tutions during Curfew hours may remain there-
in during those hours.

4. This Order will not affect persons convey-
ing to a hospital .a person requiring treatment
thereat.


