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TUESDAY, MAY 9, 1911.

By The KING.

A PROCLAMATION

For removing doubts as to the Effect of a Royal
Proclamation of the 22nd March last appoint-
ing Friday, the 23rd June next, a Bank Holiday
and Public Holiday in the County of London.

GEORGE R.I.

WHEREAS We, by Our Royal Proclama-
tion, dated the 22nd day of March

1911, by and with the advice of Our Privy
Council, and in pursuance of the provisions of
the Acts recited in the said Proclamation, did
command that Thursday, the 22nd day of June
next, be observed as a Bank Holiday and
Public Holiday throughout the United King-

•dom, and that Friday, the 23rd day of June
next, be observed as a second Bank Holiday
and Public Holiday in the County of London :
And whereas doubts might arise whether the
second Holiday appointed in the County of
London by the said Proclamation should be
observed in the City of London as well as in the
rest of the Administrative County of London :
Now, therefore, We do hereby, by and with
the advice of Our Privy Council and in exercise
of the powers conferred by the said Acts so far
as the same are severally applicable, appoint
Friday, the 23rd day of June next, as a special
day to be observed as a Bank Holiday and
Public Holiday throughout the area of the
Administrative County of London, including
the City of London.

Given at Our Court at Buckingham Palace
this fourth day of May, in the year of our Lord
one thousand nine hundred and eleven, and in
the First year of Our Reign.

GOD SAVE THE KING.

At the Council Chamber. Whitehall, the 4th
day of May 1911.
By a Committee of the Lords of His Majesty's

Most Honourable Privy Council for the arrange-
ment of Preparations necessary upon the
occasion of Their Majesties' Coronation.

PRESENT,

Lord President,
' Duke of Norfolk.

Earl Beauchamp.
Earl Carrington.
Viscount Haldane.

riTHE Right Honourable Winston Spencer-
I Churchill, one of His Majesty's Principal

Secretaries of State, having caused the Com-
missioner of Police to prepare a plan for the
access and regress of carriages on the day of
the Coronation of Their Majesties, and the
Executive Committee for the purposes of Their
Majesties' Coronation having submitted the
same to this Committee, Their Lordships are
pleased to approve thereof and to authorize tlie
Right Honourable Winston Spencer-Churchill
to take all such measures as shall be necessary
for carrying the said plan (of which a copy is
hereunto annexed) into effect, and also for
securing the passage of the carriages in the
several routes therein set forth, and he is further
authorized to make such alterations in the said
plan as he may deem necessary and proper.

ALMERIC FiTzRoY.

REGULATIONS TO BE OBSERVED OX
THE DAY OF THE CORONATION.

1. In pursuance of an Order of His Majesty's
Most Honourable Privv Council, the following


