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Sequestration of the Estate of

VARINDAR KUMAR BHALLA

THE Estate of Varindar Kumar Bhalla a sole trader carrying on
business as The Sportsman Bar and having a place of business at 1
Wide Close, Lanark ML117LX, and formerly residing at 6 Southbrae
Drive, Jordanhill, Glasgow was Sequestrated by the Sheriff at
Glasgow on 16th October 1990 and Gerald Ian Rankin, Chartered
Accountant, Cork Gully, Kintyre House, 209 West George Street,
Glasgow G2 2LW has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim
Trustee on the Sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee. For the purpose of
formulating claims, Creditors should note that the date of
Sequestration is 13th September 1990.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

G Ian Rankin, C.A.,
Interim Trustee.

30th October 1990. (104)

Sequestration of the Estate of

WILLIAM CRAIGIE ROBERTSON DECEASED

THE Estate of William Craigie Roberston Deceased who resided at
24 Montrave Crescent, Leven, Fife and formerly trading as Robertson
& Sons, was Sequestrated by the Sheriff of Tayside, Central and Fife at
Kirkcaldy on 9th October 1990 and Dugal Hepburn Beedie,
Chartered Accountant, City House, 16 Overgate, Dundee DD1 9PN
has been appointed by the Court to act as Interim Trustee on the
Sequestrated Estate.

Any Creditor of the Debtor named above is invited to submit his
statement of claim in the prescribed form with any supporting
accounts or vouchers to the Interim Trustee.

Any Creditor known to the Interim Trustee will be notified of the
date, time and place of the Statutory Meeting of Creditors to elect a
Permanent Trustee.

Douglas James Watt, Chartered Accountant, both of 76 George
Street, Edinburgh EH2 3BU to be Joint Administrators ad interim of
the said company for the purposes specified in Section 8(3a) and (d)
of the Insolvency Act 1986.

J.D. Laurie,
Joint Administrator ad interim.

Cork Gully,
76 George Street,
Edinburgh.

DJ Watt,
Joint Administrator ad interim.

(31)

RE: ERIC ROY MILLS DECEASED

NOTICE is hereby given pursuant to Section 27 of the Trustee Act
1925 that any person having a claim against or an interest in the estates
of Eric Roy Mills of 14 Huntley Cottages, Aboyne, Scotland formerly
of 84 Roewood Lane, Hurdsfield, Macclesfield, Cheshire, England
who died on the llth May 1990 is hereby required to send in
particulars in writing of his claim or interest to the Executrix Yvonne
Anne Mills on or before 10th January 1991 after which date the estate
of the deceased will be distributed by the Executrix amongst the
persons entitled thereto having regard only to claims and interest of
which she has had notice.

Towns Needham & Co.,
Solicitors.

6/8 Albert Road,
Levenshulme,
Manchester M19 3PJ.
Solicitors for the Executrix

Dated this 24th day of October 1990. (28)

D H Beedie,
Interim Trustee.

Ernst & Young,
City House,
16 Overgate,
Dundee DD1 9PN.

26th October 1990. (8)

OLD TOWN LEISURE LIMITED

(In Administration)

NOTICE is hereby given that on 23rd October 1990 the Court of
Session, Edinburgh made an Administration Order in respect of Old
Town Leisure Limited, a company incorporated under the Companies
Acts and having its Registered Office at 11 Blair Street, Edinburgh
and appointed. John Dickson Laurie, Chartered Accountant and


