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to me, Michael James Meston Reid, Meston Reid & Co, 12 Garden
Place, Aberdeen AB10 1UR as Trustee for the benefit of her Creditors
generally.

If a creditor wishes to object to the trust deed for the purposes of
preventing it becoming a protected trust deed (see notes below on the
objections required for that purpose) notification of such objection
must be delivered in writing to the Trustee within 5 weeks of the date
of publication of this Notice in The Edinburgh Gazette.

Notes:

The trust deed will become a protected trust deed unless within the
period of 5 weeks of the date of publication of this Notice in The
Edinburgh Gazette a majority in number or not less than one third in
value of the creditors notify the Trustee in writing that they object to
the trust deed and do not wish to accede to it.

The effect of this is that paragraphs 6 and 7 of Schedule 5 to the
Act will apply to the trust deed. Briefly, this has the effect of restricting
the rights of non-acceding creditors to do diligence (ie to enforce court
decrees for unpaid debts) against the debtor and confers certain
protection upon the trust deed from being superseded by the
sequestration of the debtor's estate.

Michael J'MReid
Trustee

Meston Reid & Co
12 Garden Place
Aberdeen AB10 1UR
10th December 1997 (77)

The effect of this is that paragraphs 6 and 7 of Schedule 5 to the
Act will apply to the trust deed. Briefly, this has the effect of restricting
the rights of non-acceding creditors to do diligence (ie to enforce court
decrees for unpaid debts) against the debtor and confers certain
protection upon the trust deed from being superseded by the
sequestration of the debtor's estate.

Christine Convy
Trustee

(64)

RITCHIE BROTHERS

Old Rows, Seafield, Bathgate

THE partners of the firm of Ritchie Brothers give notice of the
dissolution of the partnership, by mutual consent, on 24th November
1997.

This notice does not relate to the long established business of civil
engineers and public works contractors carried on by Ritchie Brothers
Holdings Ltd and its subsidiaries from the above address.

N. Ritchie
JH Ritchie

Partners
(42)

Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act 1985: Section 5 Paragraph 5(3)

Notice by Trustee Under a Trust Deed for the Benefit of Creditors

Trust Deed for Creditors by

STUART WISHART

A Trust Deed has been granted by Stuart Wishart, 3 School Lane,
Cardenden, Fife, KY5 OBS on 12th December 1997 conveying (to the
extent specified in Section 5 4(a) of the Bankruptcy (Scotland) Act
1985) his estate to me, Christine Convy, Anderson & Menzies, 3 High
Street, Kinross, KY13 7AW as Trustee for the benefit of his creditors
generally.

If a creditor wishes to object to the trust deed for the purposes of
preventing it becoming a protected trust deed (see notes below on the
objections required for that purpose) notification of such objection
must be delivered in writing to the Trustee within 5 weeks of the date
of publication of this Notice in The Edinburgh Gazette.

Notes:

The trust deed will become a protected trust deed unless within the
period of 5 weeks of the date of publication of this Notice in The
Edinburgh Gazette a majority in number or not less than one third in
value of the creditors notify the Trustee in writing that they object to
the trust deed and do not wish to accede to it.

Petition of

PETER FREDERICK MACDONALD

For appointment of a Judicial Factor to the Estates of

THE LATE CATHERINE JANET MACDONALD

NOTICE is hereby given that a Petition has been presented to the
Court of Session, Parliament House, 2 Parliament Square, Edinburgh
by Peter Frederick Macdonald, WS, 9 Ardross Street, Inverness,
Curator Bonis to the late Miss Catherine Janet Macdonald, formerly
residing at Bankhead, Dores Road, Inverness, and latterly residing at
Craig Dunain Hospital, la Leachkin Road, Inverness for the
appointment of a Judicial Factor to the Estates of the said late Miss
Catherine Janet Macdonald and that by an Interlocutor dated 9th
September 1997 and 3rd December 1997 the Lord Ordinary, Lord
Phillip appointed all parties having an interest to lodge Answers
thereto within 21 days after intimation, advertisement and service of
all which notice is hereby given.

Derek R. Reekie, S.S.C.
Drummond Miller W.S.
31/32 Moray Place
Edinburgh EH3 6BZ
Solicitor for the Petitioner (25)


