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ed above to tho Faculty of Divinity, and Four-
eevenths to the Faculty of Arts ; One-tenth
of the said Sum of Seven Hundred Pounds,
Leretofore annually voted by Parliament as
additional Allowance to the Principal and Pro-
fessors of King's College, and of which Sum the
like Proportion has heretofore been paid to the
Professor of Civil Law in that College; the
Sum of Sixty Pounds, Eight Shillings, and
Eight Pence, being the Aggregate of the Sums
heretofore annually voted by Parliament in
Continuance of Royal Grants to the Professor
of Civil Law in King's College and the Pro-
fessor of Church History in Marischal College ;
and, in addition, the amount of such Fees as
the Professor may, from Time to Time, be
authorised to exact from the Students.

5. In the Faculty of Medicine :—
To the Professorship of the Institutes of

Medicine shall be attached a Salary of Two
Hundred Pounds, to be annually voted by Par-
liament ; and the Amount of such Fees as the
Professor may, from Time to Time, be autho-
rised to exact from the Students.

To the Professorship of the Practice of Medi-
cine shall be attached the annual Proceeds of
the Bequest by the Reverend John Paterson
to the Professorship of the Practice of Medi-
cine in Marischal College; the Sum of One
Hundred Pounds, heretofore annually voted by
Parliament to that Professorship ; the addi-
tional Sum of Fifty Pounds, to be annually
voted by Parliament; and the Amonnt of such
Fees as tho Professor may, from Time to Time,
be authorised to exact from the Students.

To the Professorship of Chemistry shall
be attached One-seventh of that portion of the
Revenues of the University, which shall be
derived from the said present endowed Funds
of King's College, applicable as aforesaid (other
than the said Lands of Cairntradlin, the said
Sum of One Hundred and Twenty Pounds,
payable through the Office of Her Majesty's
Woods, Forests, and Land Revenues, and the
Deductions hereinbefore specifically made for
the Professorship of Systematic Theology), and
of which Portion One-seventh has been assign-
ed above to the Faculty of Divinity, Four-
sevenths to the Faculty of Arts, and One-
ceventh to the Professorship of Law; the
yearly Sum of Forty Pounds from the Lands
of Pulmuir, as heretofore Payable to the Pro-
fessor of Chemistry in Marischal College, in
Terms of the Bequest by Mrs Barbara Mack-
well; the Sum of Forty Pounds, Eight Shil-
lings, and Eight Pence, Portion of the Sums
heretofore annually voted by Parliament to
the Professorship of Medicine and Chemistry
in King's College and the Professorship of
Chemistry in Marischal College; and the
Amount of such Fees as the Professor may,
from Time to Time, be authorised to exact
from the Students. To the Professorship of
Chemistry there shall be attached a teaching
Assistant and a Laboratory Attendant, who
shall receive respectively the Sums of One
Hundred Pounds and Fifty Pounds a Year,
Portions of the Sums heretofore annually voted
by Parliament to the Professorship of Medi-
cine and Chemistry in King's College and the
Professorship of Chemistry in Marischal Col-
lege. To provide Materials, and meet other
Class Expenses of the Professor of Chemistry,
there shall be applied One-tenth of the said
Sam of Seven Hundred Pounds, heretofore

annually voted by Parliament as additional
Allowance to the Principal and Professors of
King's College, and of which Sum the like
Proportion has heretofore been paid to the
Professor of Medicine and Chemistry in that
College ; and, in addition, the Sum of Thirty
Pounds, Portion of the Sums heretofore annu-
ally voted by Parliament to the Professorship
of Medicine and Chemistry in King's College,
and the Professorship of Chemistry in Mariichal
College.

To the Professorship of Anatomy shall be
attached the Sum of One Hundred and Fifty
Pounds, heretofore annually voted by Parlia-
ment to the Professorship of Anatomy in
Marischal College; and the Amount of such
Fees as the Professor may, from Time to Time,
be authorised to exact from the Students. To
the Professorship of Anatomy there shall be
attached an Assistant, who shall receive a
Salary of One Hundred Pounds, to be annually
voted by Parliament.

To the Professorship of Surgery shall be
attached the Sum of One Hundred Pounds,
heretofore annually voted by Parliament to the
Professorship of Surgery in Marischal College;
the additional Sum of Fifty Pounds, to be
annually voted by Parliament; and tbe
Amount of such Fees as the Professor may,
from Time to Time, be authorised to exact
from the Students.

To the Professorship of Materia Meilica shall
be attached a Salary of One Hundred and
Fifty Pounds, to be annually voted by Par-
liament ; and the Amount of such Fees as the
Professor may, from Time to Time, he autho-
rised to exact from the Students. To the Pro-
fessorships of Materia Medica and Medical
Jurisprudence there shall be attached a joint
Assistant, who shall receive a Salary of Fifty
Pounds, to be annually voted by Parliament.
To provide Materials, and meet other Class
Expenses of the Professor of Materia Medica,
there shall be applied the Sum of Fifty Pounds,
to he annually voted by Parliament.

To the Professorship of Midwifery shall be
attached a Salary of One Hundred and Fifty
Pounds, to be annually voted hy Parliament;
and the Amount of such Fees as the Professor
may, from Time to Time, be authorised to
exact from the Students.

To the Professorship of Medical Jurispru-
dence shall be attached the annual Proceeds
of the Sum bequeathed in the Year Eighteen-
hundred and Fifty-seven, by Doctor Alexander
Henderson, for the Support of a Professorship
of Medical Logic and Medical Jurisprudence
in Marischal College; the Sum of Seventy-
five Pounds, to be annually voted hy Parlia-
ment ; and the Amonnt of such Fees as the
Professor may, from Time to Time, he autho-
rised to exact from the Students. To provide
Materials, and meet other Class Expenses of
the Professor of Medical Jurisprudence, there
shall be applied the Sum of Thirty-fire
Pounds, to be annually voted by Parliament.

To the Professorship of Botany shall be
attached a Salary of Three Hundred Pounds,
to be annually voted by Parliament; and the
Amount of such Fees as the Professor may,
from Time to Time, be authorised to exact
from the Students.

6. There shall be in the University of Aberdeen
Three Lectureships under the Bequest of the
late Reverend Doctor Alexander Murray of
Philadelphia in the United States of America ;


