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fyxity. 
From Cue0tiap June.24, to ©attirtHlg June 28, 1806a 

AT the Cour t at the Queen's Palace, the 25th 
of June l §o6 , 

P R E S E N T , " 

, T h e K I N G ' S Moil Excellent Majesty in Council. 

W H E R E A S by tlie Second Section of His 
Majesty's Order in Council of the Fifth Day 

of April One thousand eight hundred and five, certain 
Stations for the-Performance of Quarantine by cer­
tain Ships and Vessels in the said Order specified, 
furnished with Clean Bills of Health, are assigned to 
such Ships 3nd Vessels according to the Ports to 
vvhich they are respectively "bound; and Doubts 
have arisen at what Stations Quarantine ought to 
be performed by Ships and Vessels with-Clean Bills 
of Heal th , captured or detained and brought into 
the Ports, of Great Britain as Prize : His Majesty 
is thereupon pleased, by and with the Advice of 
His- Privy Council, to declare and order, that all 
such Ships and Vessels (hall, for the Purpose of per-0 

forming Quarantine, be deemed, and taken to be 
bound to the Ports into which they have been, or 
shall be so brought, and shall, together with all 
Persons, Goods, Wares , and Merchandize, and other 
Articles on board thereof, pet form Quarantine ac­
cordingly : A n d the Lords Commissioners of Hi s 
Majesty's Treasury, the Commiflioners for executing 
the Office of Lord H i g h Admiral of Great Britain, 
the Lord Warden of the Cinque Ports , the Master-
General and the Rest of the Principal Officers o f the 
Ordnance,-His Majesty's Secretary at War , and the 
-Governors and Commanders in Chief for the T ime 
.being of the Ifles of Guernsey, Jersey, Alderney, 
Sai;k, and Man, fare to give the necessary Directions 
Jierein, as to them may refpedively appertain. 

IV. Fawkener. 

AT the Court at the Queen's Palace, the 18th 
of June 1806, 

P R E S E N T , 
T h e K I N G ' s Most Excellent-Majesty in Council. 

I S Majesty, taking into'Consideration the Re­
presentations that have been made on Behalf 

0? the Inhabitants of the Town of Papenbiirgh, is 
pleased, by and with the Advice of His Privy 
Council, to order, and it is hereby ordered, Tha t all 
Vessels under the Papenburgh Flag,- which were-
destined to, and had arrived in, any of the Ports, of 
the United Kingdom before the Fourteenth Day of 
May last, being =the Day on which the Order for 
granting General Reprisals against the Ships, Goods, 
and Subjects of the. Town of Papenburgh was 
issued, or which were detained at Sea before 1 he 
fame Period, not trading between Port and Port in 
Hostility with 'His Majesty, (h^ll-be restored, *oi. 
gether with their Freight and Cargoes, upon Proof 
being made to the Satisfaction of :the Court of Ad­
miralty, that such,.Vessels, and any Good* I<*,derijdn 
board the fame, d o really belong to Inhabitant* of 
the Town of Papenburgh, o r other Subjects of: t W 
Ditke of Arenbe rg ; and that such Ships, witK 
their Crews, and thesaid Goods, be permitted to 
proceed to any Port 00't blockaded. And the Right 
Honourable the Lords Commiflioners of His* Ma­
jesty's Treasury, the Lords Commissioners' of the 
Admiralty, the Lord Warden of the Cinque Ports, 
and the Judge of the High Court of. Admiralty, are 
to give the necessary Directions herein, as to them 
may respectively appertain. . IV. Fawkener. 

Whitehall, June 26, 1806. 

DI S P A T C H E S from Sir.George Hilaro Bar-
low, Bart. Governor-General of Bengal, dated 

the 2d and ?th February 1806,. have been' received 
at the East India -House, of which the following a r e : 

Extracts : ' -

Extras? of a Le/ter from Sir G. H. Barlow, to the 
Secret Committee ofthe Court of Diredors, dated on 
the River Culna, id February 1806. -

I H A V E great Satisfaction in apprizing your-
Honorable Committee, that, on t h e 2 2d Decem­

ber, a ratified Copy of the Treaty concluded be­
tween the Right Honorable Lord Lake and the 
accredited Vakeel of Dowlut Rao J Scindiah, (3 
Copy of ivhich was inclosed in my Despatch to your 
Honorable Committee.of "the 4th of that Month , ) 
was received by his Lordstiip, with a flight and 
unobjectionable A Iteration in the Sixth Article, 
namely, the Omission' of the Renunciation of t ha t 
Chieftain's Claims to T b n k ' Rampoofah -and Ba-> 


