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next, at Eleven o'clock in. the Forenoon each day, for ex-
amining the Bankrupt, in the Sheriff-clerk's Office, Cupar.
Meetings of his Creditors will be held in Carnagie's Sun Inn,
Cnpar, at the same hour, on the 17th and 31st days of De-
cember next, for electing Commissioners, &c. The Creditors
neglecting to produce to the Trustee their claims, grounds of
debt, and oaths of verity, at or previvous to the said first
meeting, (17th,) or between and 20th July following, can
hare HO share in the first dividend.

Notice to the Creditors of John Stewart and Company, Mer-
chants and Manufacturers, in Paisley, and of John Stewart
and James White, the individual Partners of the said
Company.

^Edinburgh,November 18, 1817.

UPON the application of the said John Stewart aud
Company, and the individual partners forcsaid,

with concurrence of Creditors to the extent required by
law, the Lords of Council and Session (Second Division), of
this date, sequestrated their whole estate and effects, herit-
able and moveable ; and appointed their Creditors to meet

'at Paisley, within the Renfrewshire Tontine there, on Friday
the 28th day of November current, at Two of the. Clock in
the Afternoon, for the purpose of naming an Interim Factor;
and to meet again, at the same place and hour, upon Friday
the 19th day of December next, to elect a Trustee on'the
said sequestrated estate.—All in terms of the Statute.

The Creditors of Thomas Blagden, late of Lime Kiln Hill,
J/ime-house, in the County of Middlesex, Timber Rafter and
Lighterman, recently discharged under the Insolvent Acts, are
requested to meet at the Counting-house of Messrs. Bonltons
and Pelly, No. 14, Chatham Place, Blackfriars, London, on
the 4th day of December next, at Eleven o'clock precisely,
for the choice of an Assignee or Assignees of the estate and
effects of the said Thomas Blagden.

The Creditors of Jobn.Wogd, late of Sherrard-Street,
Golden-Square, in the County of Middlesex, Watch-Maker
and Dealer in Jewellery, are requested to meet at the Cham-
Tjers of Mr. David Jones, Solicitor, No. 1, New Inn, Strand,
on Monday next the 24th instant, at Seven o'clock in the
Evening precisely, for the purpose of naming an Assignee or
Assignees of the estate and effects of the said John Wood,
•who was declared to be entitled to be discharged under the Act
«>f the $M of his present Majesty, intitled " an Act for the
Keli«f of certain Insolvent Debtors in England," and of an

amendment of the same Act passed i» tbe 56th year of th?
reign of His present Majesty.

The Creditors of David Evans, late of the Parish of Tre-
lach, in the County of Carmarthen, Farmer, who was lately
discharged from the- Gaol of Carmarthen, in the County of
Carmarthen, by virtue of an Act of Parliament made and
passed in the 53d year of the reign of His present Majesty,
intituled " an Act for the Relief of Insolvent Debtors in Eng-
land." are requested to meet at the Office of Mr. David Rees,
of Carmarthen aforesaid, Solicitor, on Wednesday tbe 3d day
of December next, at the hour of Eleven of the Clock in the
Forenoon, for the purpose on choosing Assignees OF an Assig-
nee of tbe said Insovent's estate and effects.

THE Creditors of William Augustus Grobocker, late of
Kew Green, in the County of Surrey, fate a Clerk in the
AVar Office, who hath taken tbe benefit of tbe Insolvent Act,
are requested to meet the Assignee of his estate asd effects,
on Wednesday [the 8d day of December next, at the Strat-
ford Coffee-House, in Oxford-Street, in the County of Mid-
dlesex, at Twelve o'clock at Noon, to assent to or dissent
from the Assignee commencing or prosecuting any suit or
suits in law or equity, for the recovery of any part of the In-
solvent's estate, or otherwise relating thereto.

THE Assignee of the estate and effects of William Augustas
Grobecker, late of Kew-Green, in the County of Surrey, late
a Clerk in the War-Office, who hath taken the benefit of the
Insolvent Act, does hereby give notice, that he will, after
thirty days from the. date hereof, make a First and Final
Dividend of all the monies in his bands belonging to tbe
estate of the said Insolvent, amongst such of the Creditors of
the said Insolvent from whose demands he has obtained a
discharge, as shall prove their debts in the manner by the said
Act required.—Dated the 22d day of November 1817.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS.
THE Creditors of Robert Chesworth, late of Stockport, in

the County of Chester, Spirit Merchant, who was discharged
out of the gaol of Chester, April 1315, under the Act of Par-
liament made and passed in the 53 year of the reign of the
present King, intituled, < c An Act for the Relief of Insolvent
Debtors," are requested to meet at the House of Mary Da-
vics, known by the sign of the White Cross Tavern, Tythe
13ani Street, in Liverpool, on Saturdriy the 2.9th day of No.
vember instant, at Twelve o'clock at Noon, for the purp<>se
of chusiugan Assignee or Assignees of his estate audeffect^
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