
[ 1274 ]
Commercial-Road, in - the County of Middlesex, to assent to
or dissent from the said Assignee submitting to arbitration,
compounding, or otherwise agreeing a certain matter now in
controversy between the said Assignee and William. Black-
lock, of Broad-Street, Old Gravel-Lane aforesaid, Builder,
relating to the said Insolvent's estate and effects; and on

: «ther special affairs.

.THE Creditors of Thomas Egerton Cannel, late of Hano-
ver-Street, Liverpool, in the County of Lancaster, Lieute-
nant in the Army, who hath been discharged from from His
Majesty's Borough Gaol of Liverpool, in the County of Lan-
caster, under and by virtue of an Act of Parliament, made

. and passed in the 53d year of the reign of His present Ma-
jesty, intituled " An Ace for the Relief of Insolvent Debtors
in England," are requested to meet at the,. Office of Mr.
James Crewe, Solicitor, Jubilee-Buildings, Lord-Street, in

Liverpool aforesaid, oh Saturday the 31st day of July instant,
at Twelve o'clock at Noon, for the 'purpose of choosing an
Assignee or Assignees'of the estate and effects of the said
Thomas Egerton Cannel.

THE Assignee of the estate and effects of Thomas Char-
nock, late of SwiU-Hill-Top, in the Parish of Halifax, York-
shire, Farmer and Manufacturer, an Insolvent Debtor, intends
to meet at the Old Cock Inn, in Halifax aforesaid, on Monday
the 16th day of August next, at Four o'Cl6ck in the After-
noon, in order to make a first and final dividend of'the estate
of the said Thomas Charnock; when and where the Creditors,
who have not already proved their debts according to the pro-
visions of the Insolvent Debtors'Act, are to come prepared
with the necessary proofs, or they will be excluded the benefit
of the said dividend. And all claims against the said estate
not then proved will be disallowed. .
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