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rupts, in Basinghall-Strect, in the City of Lond'on, for the
purpose of assenting to or dissenting from the said Assignees
employing the said Bankrupt, or any other person or-persons,
iu 'making out the accounts, and also in finishing goods now
on the premises, and carrying on the trade until the preinisei
are sold, and for that purpose to retain the workmen now em-
ployed thereon, or such' other persons as may be necessary,
and' to pay the said Bankrupt such allowance or compensation
.for his services in that behalf as the said Assignees shall think
proper ; and also to employ a proper person to collect and re-
ceive the debts due, and to become due, to the estate ; and also
to authorise the Assignees to pay the salaries and wages now
due to the foreman, workmen, and servants employed by the
Bankrupt, before his Bankruptcy; and also to assent to or
dissent from the said Assignees selling, by appraisement, to
the said Bankrupt, the whole or part of his furni ture and other
household effects, and to give him a reasonable time for the
payraentx)f the purchase money thereof, or to sell and dispose
of the said household furniture by public auction or private
contract; and also to assent to or dissent from the said As-
signees paying.(if the Assignees shall be so advised), out of the
Bankrupt's estate, -a sum of money to a person, to be named
at the meeting,- to redeem the'lease of the Bankrupt's premises
in Coleman-Street, in his possession,' on which he claims to
have an equitable lien; and also to assent to or dissent from
the said Assignees selling and disposing of, by public sale or
private -contract, the lease of the said Bankrupt's premises
whereon he carried on his trade or business of a Cloth-Dresser,
Calenderer, and Packer, together with the steam engine and
machinery connected-therewith, and the fixtures and other
effects on the said premises; and also to assent to or dissent
from the said Assignees commencing, prosecuting, or defend-
ing any actions or suits, action or suit, at law or in equity,
for the recovery or protection of any part of the said Bank-
rupt's estate and effects, or otherwise in relation to his affairs;
and to compound, submit to arbitratian, or otherwise agree
any debt that shall be due, or any matter or dispute relating
thereto; and take any reasonable part of any debts or debt in
discharge of the whole, or give time and take security for pay-
ment of the same, or any part thereof; and on other special
affairs relating to the said Bankrupt and his estate.

fTlHE Creditors who have proved their debts under a Com-.
1 mission of Bankrupt awarded and" issued forth against

John. Dickinson, of No. 5, Church-Passage, Guildhall, in the
City of London, Woollen-Warehouseman, are requested to
meet the Assignees of the estate and effects of the said Bank-
rupt, .on Saturday the 12th day of July next, at Twelve
o'clock at Noon precisely, at-the Court of Commissioners of
Bankrupts, in Basinghall-Stre«t, in the City of London, in
order' to assent to or dissent from the said Assignees selling
and disposing of the said Bankrupt's stock in trade, fixtures,
household goods, furniture and other effects, either by public
auction or private contract, in such manner as they shall see
fit, and either for ready money or on credit; and also to assent
to of dissent from the said Assignees commencing, prosecuting,
or .defending Any- suit or suits at law or in equity, for the re-
covery or preservation of all or any part of the said Bankrupt's
estate and- effects ; or to the compounding, submitting to ar-
bitration,, or otherwise agreeing any matters relating to the
said Bankrupt's estate and effects; and on other special matters.

fTTHE Creditors who have proved their debts under^a Coin-
JL mission of Bankrupt, bearing date the 23d day of Sep-

tember 1801j awarded and issued forth against Richard King
Thomas, late of Evesham, in the County of Worcester, Mercer,
Dealer and Chapman, are requested to meet on Monday the
l'4th day of July next, at Twelve o'Clock at Noon precisely,
at the Office of Mr. J. M. G. Cheek, Solicitor to the Assignees,
in Evesham aforesaid, to assent to or dissent from the sale by
auction under the said Commission made by the said Assignees
pn the 13th of November 1801, to one Joseph Thomas, since
deceased, of a certain freehold messuage, garden, and. pre-
mises, in the Bridge-Street, Evesham, then or late jn the
occupation of the Bankrupt, of which a small part of the
garden was leasehold for years, at the sum of £°1,12(H and also
to,assent to or dissent from the conveyance of the said pre-
jiiises by certain indentures of lease and release, Tjearing date
the 29th and 30tb days of April 1802 (already executed), the
release containing also an assignment, whereby, in pursuance
jpf and'under such purchase, the said Assignees, by the direc-
tion of the said Joseph Thomas, released and conveyed the
said' messuage or tenement, and so much of the said garden as
>yas freehold, uutp one George Holland, his heirs and assigns y
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to-the use of, or in trust fof', John Kynnslon (who wa»^>ne of
the Assignees of the said Bankrupt, and who was jx Creditor,
by mortgage of the premises, for the sum of ^£1,437 4s. 1 \$d.
exceeding- such'purchase money by the sum of ^317 4s. 11§<1.J,
his heirs, appointees, and assigns for ever, in manner in Mich
indenture of release mentioned ; and whereby, in further pur-
suance of such purchase at such auction, the said Assignees,
by such direction as aforesaid, assigned so much of the said
garden as was leasehold unto the said George 'Holland, his ex-
ecutors and administrators, for the remainder of the' term of
99 years therein, if Richard King Thomas and John Thomas
should so long live, subject to the annual payment of lOsv-
therein mentioned ; which said messuage, garden, and pre-
mises-have been since sold and conveyed by the said John
Kynaston to one Abraham Hathaway, who is now seized and
possessed of the same ; and on other special affairs.

THE Creditors who have proved their debts under a Com-
mission of Bankrupt awarded and issued forth against

Robert Walker, of Manchester, in the County of Lancaster,
Woollen Shawl-Manufacturer, Dealer and Chapman, are re-
quested to meet the Assignee of the.said Bankrupt's estate and
effects, on Saturday the 12th day of July next, at Twelve
o'Clock at Noorf precisely, at the Office of Messrs. Cooke and
Beever, Solicitors, in Salford, in the said County, iii order to
assent to or dissent from the said Assignee selling and dispos-
ing of the Bankrupt's stock in trade, fixtures, household fur-
niture, and other effects, by public sale or private contract as
the said Assignee shall judge proper, and to confirm such sak
or sales thereof, or of any part thereof, as may have been
made previous to such meeting ; and also to assent to or dissent
from the said Assignee continuing to employ the accountant
already employed by him, or to his employing any other ac-.
countant he may think proper, to investigate the books and.
affairs of the said Bankrupt; and to the said Assignee making,
such accountant such compensation for his services as he may
judge proper ; and also to assent to or dissent from the said
Assignee commencing, prosecuting, or defending any action or
actions, suit or suits, at law or in equity, for the recovery or
protection of any part of the Bankrupt's estate and effect? ; or
to thejjompounding, submitting to arbitration, or otherwise
agreeing any matter or thing relating thereto; and on other
special affairs. '. .

THE Creditors who have proved their debts under a i'pm*
mission of Bankrupt awarded and issued forth against.

George Mills, of Saint James's-Street, Westminster, iu the
County of Middlesex, Bookseller, Dealer and Chapman, are
requested to meet the Assignees of the estate' and eflects of
the said Bankrupt, on Saturday the 12th day of July next, at.
Twelve o'clock at Noon precisely, at the Court of Commis-
sioners of Bankrupts, in Basinghall-Street, inthe.Cityof Lon-
don, on several important matters, arising out of the estate of
the said Bankrupt; and particularly to assent to or dissent
from the adoption of such measures as will authorise and.em-
power the Assignees of the said Bankrupt (if they shall decin
it expedient), .out of ' the assets of the said estate, to payoff
and satisfy the several mortgages made by the said Bankrupt to
Mr. Jainei Adams, to Mr. M;illiain Vines, to Mr. James Sadler,
and to the. Trustees of Mr. Thomas Sandys and wife, or so
much and such part or parts of the said several mortgages as
they shall think proper, and to indemnify such proceedings of
the said Assignees, by or out of the proceeds of the said estate/
as far as the. same will extend ; and also as to the expediency,
of authorising and empowering the Assignees to sell and dis-
pose of the said mortgaged estates, in such lots, and in such
manner, either by releasing the equity of redemption to the
several mortgagees, or otherwise disposing of such estates by
public auction or private contract; and, in like manner,, to
sell and dispose of any other part or portion of the, said Bank-
rupt's estate, as the said Assignees shall deem expedient; and
also to assent to or dissent from the expediency of authorising
arid empowering the said Assignees to indemnify (as they the
said Assignees shall think fit) all or any of the purchasers of
the freehold estates of the said Bankrupt against a fee farm
rent running -over and. issuing and payable thereout, and
against all .other incumbrances affecting tuc same, with a view
of facilitating the sale or sales of any small lots which may be
sold as aforesaid, and for that purpose to save harmless and
indemnify the said. Assignees in all proceedings they may adopt
under the direction of the said Creditors, out of the asset? of
the said Bankrupt's estate, as fur as the same will extend ; and
also to nssuut to or dissent from the said Assignees employing
the said Bankrupt, either jointly with, or" in lieu df, any


