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Commissioners did" draw up and -frame such

general rules as . therein mentioned for the appor-
tionment of the compensation money therein men-
tioned amongst the persons seized of, or entitled to,
or having, any mortgage, charge, incumbrance. judg-
ment, or lien upon, Or any claim to, or right or in-
terest in, any slave or slaves so to be manumitted,
as in the said Act is mentioned, at the .time of such
their manumission; • -

And whereas, in pursuance, of the said Act, the
said Commissioners .did also.frame such general rules
ps in the said Act are . mentioned, prescribing • the
form and manner of proceeding to be observed by
any claimant or claimants preferring any such claims

- as are therein mentioned:

And whereas the said general rules when so
framed, being subscribed with the respective hands
and seals of the said Commissioners, were .by them
on the fir,st day of April last transmitted to the Lord
President of. His Majesty's Council to be. by him
}aid before His Majesty in Council.

And whereas the said rules so transmitted as afore-
said to the Lord President have been' published in
^he manner and form in-the said Act in that behalf
required, together with a notice that all persons in-
terested in or. affected by any such general rules
plight, within six months from the date of such
notice, appeal against any such rules to His Majesty
in Council r • ' •

And whereas such notice bore date the seven-
teenth day of April one thousand eight hundred and
thirty-four, and the said term of six months expired
<on the seventeenth day of October -one thousand
eight hundred and thirty-four:

And whereas certain appeals have been-preferred
to His Majesty in Council against certain of the be-
fore-mentioned rules,"but against others of.the said
rules no such appeal hath been preferred :

• And'whereas His Majesty hath this day taken into
consideration the'pfopriety of confirming and allow-
ing such of the rules aforesaid as are not the subject
of and as are not affected by any such appeal as'afore.

And whereas His Majesty hath seen fit, in certain
respects, in'pursuance of the power in Him in that
behalf vested, to amend, alter, and yarVi some^oi
such general rules as aforesaid though, not so nppeakc
against: •

-Now, therefore, in pursuance of the sai3 Act Qf
Parliament, and in execution of the power in His
Majesty in. that behalf vested; His. Majesty, by- and
with the advice of His .Privy Council, doth order,
and it is hereby ordered, that, subject to such alter-
ation and amendment as aforesaid, such of the gene-
ral rules made as aforesaid as are not the subject of
or affected by any such appeal as aforesaid, shall be,
and the same are, hereby confirmed and allowed :

And in further pursuance of the said Act of Par-
liament the said .rules, with .such alterations and
amendments as aforesaid, are recited at length in the
schedule subjoined to this present Order, which sche-
dule .His Majesty doth hereby declare is and shall be
taken as part of this Order:

And the Lord President is to giye the peccs--?
sarv directions herein accordingly. '

W.*L. Bathitrst.

SCHEDULE .TO WHICH THE FOREGOING

REFERS,

RULES for the Conduct of the Proceedings vndcr
the said Commission, in so jar cs relates to all the
Colonies or Possessions mentioned and enumerated
in the said Act, except the Cape of Good -Hop? and
Mauritius^ ..

" ' *

1st. That all persons in 'possession, of and claiming
compensation for any slave or slaves to be manu-
mitted under the said Act, shall prefer their claims
before the Assistant Commissioners in the respective
colonies in which the said slave or slaves may be regis-
tered or settled, on or before the first day of March
one thousand eight hundred and thirty-five, in the
form hereunto annexed, marked (B),

2d-. That every such claim shall be accompanied by
a certificate signed by the Registrar of Slaves of tfce
colony in which snch .claim shall be made, that the
number of slaves mentioned in snch claim (except
any increase by birth sijiee the last. registry, as men-
tioned at the foot of such clai;u)/are duly. registered,
together with the name or nanies of the person or
persons by whom such slaves have been registered ;
and in case the property in any slave ov slaves
shall have been changed, between. the last regis-
tration and 'the first- day' of Au^jsi one thousand
eight hundred nnd thirty -IQ.VST. the -ch-uf.^vpt j^ust
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