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NOTICE is hereby given, that a meeting of the creditoi-s

of William Cheek Bousfield, late of Etloe-hall, in the county
of Essex, -who was discharged from Her Majesty's Prison
of the Fleet, in the month of June 1839, -will be held at the
office of Mr. Thomas Jones, No. ~i, King's Anas-yard,
Coleman-street, in the city of London, on Wednesday the
2d day of June, at the hour of twelve at noon precisely, to
assent to or dissent from the assignees of the estate and
effects of the said William Cheek Bousfield relinquishing
to, or for the benefit of, the wife of the said William Cheek
BousSeld, the household furniture and effects, late the pro-
perty of the said William Cheek Bousfield, at Warborough,
and certain other articles of furniture and apparel, over and
above the excepted articles allowed by law ; and at the same
time and place, the said assignees will take the instructions
and directions of the said creditors as to retaining, relin-
quishing, or otherwise disposing of any interest which they
may have, either in law or equity, in certain policies of in-
surance effected on the life of a person to be named at the
said meeting.

NOTICE is hereby given, that a meeting of the creditors
of John Jones, formerly of the town of Tregaron, in the
county of Cardigan, Cooper, since of Trewernfach, in the
parish of Llanbadarnodyn, in the same county, Farmer and
Cooper, and late of Foeshalog, in the parish of Caron, in the
said county of Cardigan, Cooper, an insolvent debtor, who
was discharged from the Gaol at Cardigan, in and for the
county of Cardigan, in or about the year 1834, under and
by virtue of the provisions of the Actor Acts of Parliament
then in force for the relief of insolvent debtors in England,
will be held on Monday the 7th day of June next, at two '

o'clock in the afternoon precisely, at the office of Messrs.
John and Hugh Hughes, Solicitors, North-parade, Aberyst-
wyth, in the said county of Cardigan, to approve and direct
in what manner, and at what place or places, the real estate
of the said insolvent shall be sold.

Insolvent Debtor.—Dividend.
WHEREAS the. assignees of the estate and effects of

Benjamin Edward Pote, late of No. 13, Francis-street, Tot-
tenham-court-road, in the county of Middlesex, Gentleman,
an insolvent debtor, whose petition is numbered 34,120,
have caused an account of the said estate and effects, duly
sworn.to, to be filed in the Court for Relief of Insolvent
Debtors; the creditors of the said insolvent are requested
to meet the assignees at the oflice of Mr. George Samuel
Ford, 8, Henrietta-street, Covent-garden, in the said county
of Middlesex, on the 23d day of June next, at eleven in the
forenoon precisely, when and where the assignees will
declare the amount of the balance in their hands, and proceed
to make a dividend with the same amongst the creditors
whose debts are admitted in the schedule sworn to by the
insolvent, in proportion to the amount thereof, subject to
such correction of the rights to receive dividends as may be
made according to the -Statute. If any person has a demand,
which is stated in the schedule, but is disputed therein,
cither in whole or in part, or if the said insolvent, the said
assignees, or any creditor objects to any debt mentioned,
therein, such claims and objections must be brought forward
at the said meeting, in order that proceedings may be had
for the examination and decision of the same, according te
the Statute.
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