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"OTICE is hereby given, that application is

intended to be made to Parliament in the next
session, for leave to bring in a Bill for better supply-
ing with pure and wholesome water the inhabitants
of the city of Westminster, and the liberties thereof,
and the several parishes or places of St. Luke Chel-
sea, Hammersmith, St. Mary Abbot's Kensington,
Brpmpton, Knightsbridge, St. Mary-le-bone, St.
Pancras, Somers'-town, Camden-tovvn, Paddington,
St. Giles in the Fields, St. George Bloomsbury,
St. George the Martyr Queen-square, St. Andrew
Holborn, St. James's Clerkemvell, Ely-place, Glass-
house-yard, the liberty of the Rolls, Saffron-hill,
Hatton-garden, part of St. Sepulchre, St. Luke
Middlesex, and parts and places adjacent thereto,
respectively, in the county of Middlesex ; and also
the inhabitants of the borough of Southwark, and
the liberties thereof, and the several parishes or places
of All Saints Wandsworth, St. Mary Putney, St. Mary
Barnes, St. Mary Battersea, Holy Trinity Claphani,
Saint Mary Lambeth, South Lambeth, Kennington,
Brixton, Stockwell, Walvvorth, St. John Waterloo,
St. Mary Newington-butts, St. Mary Magdalen Ber-
mondsey, St. John Bermondsey,- St. Giles Camber-
well, and St. Mary Hotherhithe, arid parts and places
adjacent thereto, respectively, in the county of Surrey;
and for that purpose to incorporate a company, and
to give them the necessary powers to take and use
the waters of the river Wandle, in the county of
Surrey, and to convey the same, by means of pipes
and aqueducts, from or near to the Lower Mill-dam,
in the parish of All Saints Wandsworth, in the said
county of Surrey, in the occupation of James Wat-
ley, Esq. to a reservoir or reservoirs in the parishes
of Battersea and Clapham, or one of them, in the
said county of Surrey, and from thence by pipes or
aqueducts, and by pipes under the river Thames, to
or near to the Marquis of Westminster's Dock, in
the parish of St. George Hanover-square, in the
county of Middlesex, and to or near to the Suspen-
sion-bridge, at Hammersmith, in the same county,
or one of them 5 and to make, coi%'.ruct, and main-
tain all.proper and necessary cuta, reservoirs, pipes,
conduits, drains, lunnels, aqueducts, bridges, feeders,
and oiher works, for carrying the said purposes into
full and complete execution; and which works are to
be situate in, or to pass through or into the several
parishes, townships, or extra parochial places afore-
said, or some of them.

• And notice is hereby also given, that a plan of the
said works, and a duplicate thereof, and a section and
a duplicate, together with books of reference thereto,
•will be 'deposited, for public inspection, with the
Clerk of the Peace for the county of Surrey, at his
office, in North-street, Bridge-road, Lambeth, in the
said county, and with the Clerk of the Peace for the
county of Middlesex, at his office, at the Sessions-
house, Clerkenwell, on or before the 30th day of
November instant; and, on or before the 31 st day of
December next, a copy of so mach of the said plans
and sections as relates to each of the hereinbefore
mentioned parishes in or through which the said
works, or any of them, are intended to be made,
together with a book of reference thereto, will be
deposited with the parish clerk of each such parish ;
.and copies of the said plans and sections of the sai'd

works, with books of reference, will be deposited in
the Parliament-office, and also in the Private Bill-
office of the House of Commons, on or before the
said 31st day of December next.—Dated this 11th .
day of November 184 I .

IVctson and Wix, Solicitors to the said Under-
taking.

Hughendon Inclosure.

T^OTICE is hereby given, that application is in-
-^ tended to be made to Pailiament in the ensuing
session, for leave to bring in a Bill for divid-
ing, allotting, and inclosing the open commons,
commonable heath, wood, and waste lands ami
grounds within the several manors in the parish of
Hughendon, otherwise Hitchendon,. in the county
of Buckingham ; and for providing for the expences
of the said inclosure by a sale of land, or by a rate
upon the proprietors, or by such other means ?.s may
be thought expedient.—Dated this ninth day of No-
vember 18 11.

OTICE is hereby given, that application is in--
tended to be m;ide to Parliament in the next

session, for leave to bring in a Bill for making and
maintaining a turnpike road from and out of the pre-
sent turnpike road leading from Whitchurch to Win-
chester, in the county of Southampton, commencing
at a certain part thereof, namely, at the end of a lime
called Southrield lane, near unto the town of Whit-
church,in the said county of Southampton; and which
said road is intended to pass from, in, through, or
into the several parishes or pi ices of Whitchurch
aforesaid, Freefolk, and Mitcheldever, or some or one
of them, all in the said county of Soulhampton ; in
which said Bill provision is intended to be made for
levying lulls on the said roads.

And notice is hereby given, that, on or before the
thirtieth day of November next, a map or plan and
section, describing the line or situation of the said
intended turnpike-road, and the lands in, through, or
over which the same road is intended to pass, to-
gether with a book of reference, containing the names
of the owners or reputed owners, lessees or reputed
lessees, and occupiers of such laud, and ;ilso a dupli-
cate thereof, and a copy ot so much, of the standing
orders of the House of Lords as is required, will be
deposi'ed at the office of the Clerk of the Peace for
the said county of Southampton, and also, on or be-
fore the thirty-first day of December next, a copy of
so much of the said map or plan and section as re-
lates to each of the aforesaid parishes,, together with
a book of reference thereto, and a copy of so much
of the standing orders of the House of Lords as
aforesaid, wil l be deposited with the parish clerks of
the said several parishes; and notice is hereby fur-
ther given, that, on or before the said thirty-first day
of December' next, duplicates of the said map or
plsin and section, and book of reference thereto, will
be deposited in the office of the Clerk of the Parlia-
ments, and in the Private Bill Office of the. House of
Commons. — Dated the twelfth day of November
1841.

T. E. Weston, Solicitor for the Bill.


