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estate at Blackball, otherwise Blackwell, near the said city
of Carlisle, or to approve and direct in what manner, and
at what place or places, the said real estate shall be put up
to be resold.

NOTICE is hereby given, that a meeting of the creditors
of Thomas Armstrong, formerly of Nos. 22 and 23, Fisher-
street, Carlisle, Cumberland, Chymist and Druggist, Dry-
salter, and Oil Merchant, at the same time occupying a
Warehouse in Castle-street, Carlisle aforesaid, and last in
Lodgings in Lowther-street, Keridal, Westmorland, in no
business, an insolvent debtor, lately discharged from Her
Majesty's Gaol at the city of Carlisle, under and by virtue
of an Act o£ Parliament, made and passed in the first and
second years of the reign of Her present Majesty, intituled
" An Act for abolishing arrest on mesne process in civil
actions, except in certain cases, for extending the remedies
of creditors against the property of debtors, and for amend-
ing the laws for the relief of insolvent debtors in England,"
will be held on Monday the 15th day of July next, at the
hour of three in the afternoon precisely, at the office of Mr.
Bendle, Solicitor, in the city of Carlisle aforesaid, to approve
and direct in what manner, and at what place or place, the
real estate of the said insolvent shall be sold.

NOTICE is hereby given, that a meeting of the creditors
of Lionel Creasy, formerly of Stowmarket, afterwards of
Ipswich, and late of Dry-bridge-hill, Woodbridge, all in the
county of Suffolk, not following any business or employ-
ment, an insolvent debtor, confined in the County Gaol at
Ipswich aforesaid, are requested to meet the assignee of his
estate and effects, at the house of Mr. John Williams,
known as the White Lion Inn, situate in Stowupland-street,
Stowmarket aforesaid, on Monday the 15th day of July
next, at five o'clock in the afternoon precisely, to approve
and direct in what manner, and at what place or places, the

annuity or life interest of the said insolvent, derived by him
under the will of his late father, William Creasy, late of
Stonham A spall, in the said county of Suffolk, Farmer,
deceased, shall be sold by public auction ; and also to assent
to or dissent from the said assignee commencing and prose-
cuting one or more suit or suits in equity against the sur-
viving trustees and executors under the will of said William
Creasy, to compel the performance of the trusts thereunder,
and also to render an account of all moneys received and
paid from the death of the said William Creasy.

NOTICE is hereby given, that a meeting of the creditors
of Richard Cox, of Burnham, near Bridgewater, in the
county of Somerset, Fisherman, an insolvent debtor, •will be
held on Thursday the llth day of July next, at twelve of
the clock at noon, at the office of Mr. Benjamin Tuthill
Allen, Solicitor to the assignee of the estate and effects of
the said insolvent, at Bridgewater, in the said county, for
the purpose of the creditors approving and directing at what
place or places, at what time or times, and in what manner,
the real and personal estate of the said insolvent, or any
part or parts thereof, shall be advertised and sold, and
whether by public auction or private contract; and also for
empowering the said assignee to commence and prosecute
actions at law or suits in equity against any person or per-
sons whomsoever for the recovery of any part of the estate
and effects of the said insolvent, or to compromise, submit
to arbitration, or otherwise agree to any matter or thing re-
lating to the affairs of the said insolvent, or any debt or
demand claimed thereout, as he may be advised or think
beneficial •, and to authorize the said assignee to take and
adopt such proceedings in or relating to the estate and
effects of the said insolvent as the creditors assembled at
such meeting, or the major part in value of them, shall think
proper; and on other special affairs.—Dated Burnham,
18th June 1844.
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