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tile Virgin, and which have been separately
commuted at the annual sum of sixty-one pounds
twelve shillinga, should belong and be paid to the
Vicar of such last-mentioned parish of Saint Mary
the Virgin for the time being:

" And your Majesty's said Commissioners beg
leave further to represent, that the estimated
amount of the relative proportions of tithes,
moduses, and endowments, belonging or accruing
to the Vicar of each of the said two parishes, will
be one hundred and six pounds one shilling and
seven pence to the Vicar of the said parish of
Saint John the Baptist^ and sixty-one pounds
twelve shillings to the Vicar of the said parish of
Saint Mary the Virgin:

" And your Majesty's said Commissioners beg
leave further to represent, that it is estimated that
the annual amount of fees, oblations, offerings, or
other ecclesiastical dues or profits, including pew
rents, which will arise and accrue to the Vicar
of the said parish of Saint John- the Baptist will
be about pne hundred and one pounds sixteen
shillings, and that the annual amount of those
which will arise and accrue to the Vicar of the
said parish, of Saint Mary the Virgin will be about
one hundred and thirty-eight pounds thirteen
shillings and four pence:

" And your Majesty's said Commissioners beg
leave further to represent, that it will be expedient
that a certain annual payment of two pounds three
shillings and four pence to Captain Penrice, and
his heirs, now charged upon the united benefices
of Saint John the Baptist and Saint Mary the
Virgin, in Cardiff aforesaid, should, from and after
the proposed disunion and division of the said two
parishes shall have taken effect, be borne and paid
in equal moieties by and out of the revenues of
the respective benefices of Saint John the Baptist
and Saint Mary the Virgin, Cardiff:

" That the consent of the Right Reverend
Edward Bishop of Llandaff, as Bishop of the
diocese, and of the Dean and Chapter of the said
cathedral church of Gloucester, as the patrons of
the said united vicarages or parishes of Saint John
the Baptist and Saint Mary the Virgin, Cardiff,
have been severally obtained thereto, as required
by the sixteenth section of the said Act, passed
in the fifty-eighth year of the reign of His said
Majesty King George the Tliird; in testimony
whereof, the said Edward Bishop of LlanclufF has

signed and sealed this representation; and the said*
Dean and Chapter of the said cathedral church of
Gloucester have caused their common or chapter
seal to be hereunto affixed:

" Your Majesty's said Commissioners, therefore,
beg leave to lay before your Majesty the above-
mentioned circumstances, and humbly pray, that
your Majesty will be graciously pleased to take
the premises into your royal consideration, and
to make such order in respect thereto as to your
Majesty in your royal wisdom shall seem meet."

Her Majesty, having taken the said representa-
tion into consideration, was pleased, by and with
the advice of Her Privy Council, to approve
thereof, and to order, as it is hereby ordered, that
the proposed division be accordingly made, and
the recommendations of the said Commissioners,
in respect of glebe land, tithes, moduses, and
endowments, fees, oblations, offerings, and other
ecclesiastical dues or profits, be carried into effect,
agreeably to the provisions, of the said Acts.

Wm. L. Bathurst.

AT the Court at Buckingham-Palacet the
6th day of April 1846*

PRESENT,

The QUEEN's Most Excellent Majesty in Council.

"OTTHEREAS an Act was passed in the session
Y ? of Parliament held in the eighth and ninth

years of Her Majesty's reign, intituled " An -Act
" for the general regulation of the Customs/'
whereby it is, amongst other things, enacted, that
the several sortsvof goods enumerated in the table
therein following, denominated " a table of pro-
hibitions and restrictions inwards," shall either
be absolutely prohibited to be imported, or shall
be imported only under the restrictions mentioned
in such table :

And whereas, among other sorts of goods, the
following are enumerated in the said table, viz.

" Goods of places within the limits of the East
India Company's charter, unless into ports
approved of by the Lords of the Treasury, and
declared, by Order in Council, to be fit and proper
for such importation :"

And whereas the port of Preston has been
approved of by the Lords of Her Majesty's
'1 reasury for that purpose :

Now, therefore, Her Majesty, by and with the
advice of Her Privy Council, is pleased to'declare,
and it is hereby declared, that the port of Pres.tou


