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one thousand eight hundred. and fifty, and duly
gazetted, ratifying a scheme, bearing date the
sixth day of the same month, prepared by us
under 'the provisions of the secondly recited
Act, for determining the portion of the improved
value to be made payable to us in a certain
mining lease therein stated to be about to be
granted by the Reverend Thomas Pearce, Rector
of the said parish of Roche, one moiety of the
whole net amount of the i-eservation or reservations
to be made by such lease was ordered to be made
directly payable to us; and it was further ordered
that nothing in the same scheme contained should
prevent us from recommending and proposing any
other measures relating to the matters aforesaid,
or any of them, in conformity with the provisions
of the said recited Acts, or of any other Act of
Parliament.

"And whereas the proposed lease referred to
in the said Order in Council has not yet been
granted; and, with a view to making additional
provision for the cure of souls in the said parish,
we deem it expedient that the arrangements con-
templated by the said Order should be varied in
manner hereinafter mentioned.

" We therefore humbly recommend and propose
that the share of the reservation or reservations
under such lease, so directed to be made payable
to us as aforesaid, shall be increased from one
moiety to two third parts of such reservation 'or
reservations, and that the remaining one third
part, and no more, shall be made payable to the
Rector for the time being of the said rectory of
Roche.

" And we further recommend and propose that
one half of the balance of all monies which shall,
from time to time, be received by us in respect of
such two third parts so to be made payable to us,
shall, after deducting thereout a fair proportion of
all costs, charges, and expences incurred by us in
respect of the said lease or in receiving the said
monies, be invested in the purchase of three
pounds per centum Consolidated Bank Annuities,
and such annuities shall be held by us, in trust,
for the said rectory of Roche, and the dividends
arising therefrom shall from time to time be paid
over by us to the Rector of Roche for the time
being ; provided always, that when the principal
sums so invested shalLarnount in the aggregate to
the sum of five thousand pounds sterling, such in-
vestments shall cease, and any further monies
which shall become payable to us under or by
virtue of the said lease, shall thenceforth be appli-
cable to the purposes of the first recited Act.

"And we further recommend and propose,
that nothing herein contained shall prevent us
from recommending and proposing any other
measures relating to the matters aforesaid, or any
of them, in conformity with the provisions of the
said recited Acts, or of any other Act of Par-
liament."

And whereas the said scheme has been approved
by Her Majesty in Council; now, therefore, Her
Majesty, by and with the advice of Her said
Council, is pleased hereby to ratify the said scheme,
and to order and direct that the same and every part
thereof shall be effectual in law immediately from
and after the time when this Order shall have
been duly published in the London Gazette, pur-
suant to the said Acts ; and Her Majesty, by and
with the like advice, is pleased hereby to direct
that this Order be forthwith registered by the
litegistrar of the diocese of Exeter.

Wm. L. Bathurst.
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Board of Green Cloth, Buckingham-Palace,
July 23, 1851..

The Queen has been pleased to appoint
George-Augustus-Constantine, comnionry called
Earl of Mulgrave, to be Comptroller of Her
Majesty's Household, vice the Eight Honourable
William Sebright Lascelles, deceased.

War-Office, 25th July 1851.
5th Regiment of Dragoon Guards, Assistant Staff-

Surgeon John Wyatt to be Assistant-Suj;gcon,
vice Arden, promoted on the Staff. Dated 25th.
July 1851.

11th Light Dragoons, Lieutenant William Gilfred
Baker Cresswell to be Captain, by purcl.ia.se,
vice the Honourable G. J. Noel, who retires..
Dated 25th July 1851. .

Cornet William Drury Nathaniel Lowe to be
Lieutenant, by purchase, vice Cresswell. Dated

. 25th July 185,1.
] 5th Light Dragoons, Lieutenant Henry Brett to

be Captain, by purchase, vice Keown, who
retires. Dated 25th July 1851.

Cornet Thompson Donovan to be Lieutenant, by
purchase, vice Brett. Dated 25th July 1851.

17'tli Regiment of Foot, Staff-Surgeon of the
Second Class Robert Allan to be Surgeon, vice
William Smith, who retires on half-pay. Dated
25th July 1851.

20th Foot, Captain Lord Mark Kerr to be Major,.
by purchase, vice Gordpn, who retires. Dated
25th July 1851.

Lieutenant William Pollexfen Radcliffe to be
Captain, by purchase, vice Lord Mark Iverr.
Dated 2.5th July 1851.

Ensign GJeoi'ge Hewish Adams to be Lieutemmt,
by purchase, vice Radcliffe. Dated 25th July
1851.

30th Foot, Captain Robert Dillon, from the 97th
Foot, to be Captain, vice Burton, who exchanges.
Dated 25th July 1851.

53rd Foot, Gentleman Cadet Thomas Acton, from
the Royal Military College, to.be Ensign, wi th-
out purchase, vice Maude, appointed to the
77th Foot. Dated 25th July 185.1.

77fh Foot, Lieutenant John Hackett to be Captain,
without purchase, vice Philip Bolton, who re-
tires upon full-pay. Dated 25th July 185L

Lieutenant Henry Robert Garden to be Captain,
by purchase, vice Fellowes, who retires. Dated
25th July 1351.

Ensign William Ronalds to be Lieutenant, vice
Hackett. Dated 25th July 1851.

Ensign William Henry Cecil George Pechell to
be Lieutenant, by purchase, vice. Bertram, \vho
retires. Dated 25th July 1851.

Ensign William Felix Tollemache fo be Lieu-
tenant, by purchase, vice Garden. Dated 25th
July 1851.

Ensign James Arthur Maude, from the 53rd Foot,
to be Ensign, vice Ronalds. Dated 25th July
1851.

97th Foot, Captain Fowler Burton, from the 30th
Foot, to be Captain, vice Dillon, who exchanges.
Dated 25th July I.Sol.

HOSPITAL STAFF.
Assistant-Surgeon William Arden, from the 51 h

Dragoon Guards, to be Staff-Surgeon of the
Second Class, vice Allan, appointed to the I T i h
Foot. Dated 2'>th July 1851.

Acting Assistant-Surgeon James McGrigor Laing
to be Assistant Staff-Surgeon,-vice Wyatt, ap-
pointed to the 5th Dragoon Guards. Dated
25th July 1851. •


