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Majesty's reign, intituled "An Act for the further
" amendment of the Church Building Acts," or
under and by virtue of any and every other power
or authority vested in them by the Church Build-
ing Acts, duly prepared and laid before Her
Majesty in Council a representation, bearing date
the twenty-seventh day of May one thousand eight
hundred and fifty-two, in the words following;
viz.:

"Your Majesty's Commissioners for building
new churches beg leave humbly to represent to
your Majesty that on or about the twenty-third
day of October one thousand eight hundred and
thirty-eight, your Majesty's said Commissioners
(with the consent of the Right Eeverend Charles
Richard, Bishop of the diocese of Winchester)
made a representation to your Majesty in Council
that it appeared to them to be expedient, and
therefore humbly prayed that a particular district
might be assigned to the consecrated church of
Saint John, situate in the parish of Richmond, in
the county of Surrey, and in the diocese of Win-
chester, under and by virtue of the power or
authority for such purpose contained in the six-
teenth section of an Act of Parliament passed in
the fifty-ninth year of the reign of His Majesty
King George the Third, intituled 'An Act to
' amend and render more effectual an Act passed
* in the last session of Parliament, for building
' and promoting the building of additional churches
* in populous parishes,' and that the district so
proposed to be assigned to the said church of Saint
John should be named ' Saint John's District,'
and that the boundaries thereof should be those
set forth in the said representation, and next
hereinafter mentioned; that is to say: It com-
mences on the west side of the high road leading
from Richmond Hill, by Home Castle, east, to a
boundary line of Richmond parish, north, north-
east, and north along that line, west to Green-
lane, so as to include a place called the Conduit
and premises occupied by Legg, Esq. on
the east side of Green-lane and Blind-lane, to
Sandy-lane, continues westward down Sandy-
lane, south side of Kew Heath, south-west down
Kew-lane to a mark X on the south-west angle
of the boundary wall of Kew or Richmond Gar-
dens, from thence proceeds west-south-west and
north-west to part of the Royal Gardens, east to
Duke's-court and a house and garden in the occu-
pation of the Misses Millaken, marked X, which
house is not included in Saint John's District,
south-east to Old Flower Garden, Little Green,
Duke's-lane, south side of late Town Pond and
World's End, continuing north side of road lead-
ing from Richmond to Marsh-gate and Spring-
terrace, south-west to Paradise-row, south-east to
Mount Ararat, Warple Way, and Friar's Stile,
south-west to a footway leading from the Vine-
yard to Friar's Stile, and south-east to a point
where it commenced on the west side of the high
road, near Home Castle, and which district was
more particularly delineated on the plan annexed
to the said representation, and thereon coloured
pink.

" That, by an Order of your Majesty in Council,
bearing date the twenty-ninth day of November
one thousand eight -hundred and thirty eight,
your Majesty was graciously pleased, by and with
the advice of your Privy Council, to approve of
the proposed assignment of the said distinct, and
to order that the same should be accordingly made
and effected, agreeably to the provisions of the
said Act.

" Your Majesty's said Commissioners beg leave
further to represent, that having taken into con-
sideration the present circumstances of the said

parish of Richmond, and also of the said district
which was so assigned to the said church of Saint
John, it appears to them to be expedient that the
boundaries of such district should be altered under
or by virtue of the power or authority for such
purpose contained in the sixth section of an Act
passed in the session of Parliament hold en in the
third and fourth years of your Majesty's reign,.
intituled ' An Act to further amend the Church
' Building Acts,' as enlarged and extended by the
sixteenth section of an Act passed in the session
of Parliament holden in the eighth and ninth
years of your Majesty's reign, intituled ' An Act
' for the further amendment of the Church Build-
' ing Acts,' or under and by virtue of any and
every other power or authority in this behalf
vested in your Majesty's said Commissioners by
the Church Building Acts, and that the boundaries
next hereinafter set forth should be substituted
for those comprised in the said Order of your
Majesty in Council of the twenty-ninth day of
November one thousand eight hundred and thirty-
eight ; that is to say:

" The boundary line of Saint John's district to
commence on the west side of the high road lead-
ing from Richmond Hill, on the east side of Home
Castle, to a boundary line of Richmond parish,
north, so as to include the conduit, and also that
part of the ground in Richmond parish, which is
occupied by William Frederick Gostling, Esquire,
north-east along the boundary line separating the
parishes of Richmond and Mortlake, as far as
Sandy-lane, then westward down Sandy-lane, into
Kew-road, south-west along the middle of Kew-
road, to the boundary fence separating the Royal
Gardens from part of the old Deer Park, then
running westerly along such fence for about three
hundred yards, then running south-westerly to the
corner of the wall of the footpath, and continuing
along such boundary wall, until it reaches the
bridge, over the line of the Windsor, Staines, and
South Western Railway, near the north corner of
Richmond Green, and entrance into the old Deer
Park, then easterly along the north side of the line
of that railway, up to the railway bridge in Park
Shot-road, formerly called Kew Foot-lane, and
passing thence south-westerly along the road to
the corner of Duke-street, then up that street,
eastwardly along the south side of the late
Mechanics Institution, (formerly the site of the
Old Town Pond), and along the middle of the
road leading from Richmond to Marsbgate, as far
as Spring-terrace, south-west to the end of Spring-
terrace, and the corner of a road formerly a worple
way, leading to Mount Ararat, then southerly
along that road to Friar's Stile, then south-easterly
along the north-east side of the footway, through a
field leading to Home Castle, to the point where
the boundary commences, as the same is more
particularly delineated in the plan hereunto
annexed, and thereon coloured pink.

" That the consents of the said Charles Richard,
Bishop of Winchester, of the Provost and Fellows
of King's College, within the University of Cam-
bridge, (patrons of the parish church of the said
parish of Richmond,) and of the Reverend Harry
Dupuis, Bachelor of Divinity, (Vicar and Incum-
bent of the said parish church), have been severally
obtained to such proposed alteration of boundaries
as aforesaid, as required by the two Acts and
sections lastly hereinbefore mentioned, in testi-
mony whereof, the said Charles Richard, Bishop
of Winchester, has hereto set his hand and seal the
twenty-sixth day of May one thousand eight hun-
dred and fifty-two, the said Harry Dupuis has
also hereto set his hand and seal, the twenty-fourth
day of May in the same year, and the said provost


