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tember, 1863. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the
17th day of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the fore-
noon precisely.

Matthew Scott, of Bradford, in the county of York, Stuff
Manufacturer, adjudicated bankrupt on the 15th day of
March, 1864. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the
17th day of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the fore-
noon, precisely.

Ann Breareliffe, of Harrogafe, in the county of York,
Hotel Keeper, adjudicated bankrupt on the 12th day of
May, 1864. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the 17th
day of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the forenoon
precisely.

At the Court of Bankruptcy for the Liverpool District, at
Liverpool, before a Registrar:

William Snelson, of Roscoe-street, Liverpool, in the
county of Lancaster, Joiner and Builder, adjudicated bank-
rupt on the 2nd day of March, 1864. A Dividend Meeting
will be held on the 17th day of October instant, at eleven
o'clock in the forenoon precisely.

At the County Court of Oxfordshire, holdeu at Chipping
Norton, before the Registrar:

John Day Johnson, of the parish of Chadlington, in the
county of Oxford, Blacksmith and Grocer, adjudicated
bankrupt on the 28th day of February, 1862. A Dividend
Meeting will be held on the 20th day of October instant,
at eleven o'clock in the forenoon precisely.

Battin Harrison, of C.harlbury, in the county of Oxford,
Grocer and Draper, adjudicated bankrupt on the 10th day
of March, 1862. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the
20th day of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the fore-
noon precisely.

At the County Court of Nottinghamshire, holden at
' Nottingham, before the Registrar:
John Buxton Beeson, in lodgings at Henry Dunston's,

Arkwright-street, Nottingham, previously of Arkwright-
street aforesaid, Book-keeper (sued as John Beeston), adju-
dicated bankrupt (in formd, pauperis) ou the 22nd day of
April, 1863. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the 25th
day of. October instant, at ten o'clock in the forenoon pre-
cisely. v,

Isaac Steele, of Mornington-street, in the town of Not-
tingham, Dealer in Lace and Linen Collars, adjudicated
bankrupt on the 1st day of October, 1862. A Dividend
Meeting will be held on the 25th day of October instant,
at ten o'clock in the forenoon precisely.

Thomas Roulstohe, of Saint George's-hall, near Chapel-
bar, Parliament-street, in the town and county of the town
of Nottingham, Basket and Brush Manufacturer, adjudi-
cated bankrupt on the 5th day of March, 1862. A Divi-
dend Meeting will be held on the 25th day of October
instant, at ten o'clock in the forenodn precisely.

Samuel Wells, of Great Alfred-street, in the town of
Nottingham, Baker, Grocer, Tea Dealer,, and General-shop
Keeper, adjudicated bankrupt on the 3rd day of October,
1862. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the 25th day
of October instant, at ten o'clock in the forenoon precisely.

At the County Court of Durham, holden at Seaham
Harbour, before the Registrar:

George Mitcheson, of Hawthorn, in the county of Dur-
ham, Farmer, adjudicated bankrupt on the 25th day of
January, 1864. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the
25th day of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the fore-
noon precisely.

At the County Court of Worcestershire, holdeu at Wor-
cester, before the Registrar:

Mary Ann Clutterbuck, of Belle Vue, London-road, in
the parish of Saint Peter the Great, in the city of Worces-
ter, Widow, living in lodgings, previously oi the Tything,
in the city of Worcester aforesaid, Widow, living in lodg-
ings, adjudicated bankrupt on the 2nd day of June, 1864.
A Dividend Meeting will be held on the 18th day of Octo-
ber instant, at eleven o'clock in the forenoon precisely.

George William Haden, of the Union Inn, Garden-street,
in the parish of the Blockhouse, in the city of Worcester,
Licensed Victualler, adjudicated bankrupt on the 12th day
of March, 1864. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the
18th day of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the fore-
noon precisely.

Thomas Harris, of Saint Clement-street, in the parish of
Saint Clement, in the city of Worcester, Rope and Sail
Maker, adjudicated bankrupt on the 25tu day of August,
1863. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the 18th day
of. October instant, at eleven o'clock in the forenoon pre-
cisely.

Joseph Pitt the younger, of Broad-street, i:i the oarish of
All Saints, in the city of Worcester, Coopir, adjudicated
bankrupt on the 4th day of July, 1863. A Dividend Meet-
ing will be held on the 18th day of October instabt, at
eleven o'clock in the forenoon precisely.

Edward Perks, of Bank-street, in the parish of Saint
Swithin, in the city of Worcester, Licensed Victualler, keep-
ing the Rising Sun Public-house, adjudicated bankrupt on
the 3rd day of February, 1863. A Dividend Meeting will
be held on the 18th day of October instant, at eleven
o'clock in the forenoon precisely.

James Holder, of Clifton-on-Teme, in the couuty of.
Worcester, Plumber,' Glazier, Painter, Paper Hanger, and
Dealer in Paper, previously thereto of Bewdley, in the said
county of Worcester, Plumber, Glazier, and Painter, and
also Grocer, Provision Dealer, and Licensed to Deal in Tea
and Tobacco, adjudicated bankrupt on the 5th day of Jan-
uary, 1863. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the 18th
day of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the forenoon
precisely.

William Watluns, of the parish of Saint John, in Bed-
wardine, in the city of Worcester, Baker and Confectioner,
previously of the Brockamine, in the. parish-of Leigh, in
the county of Worcester, Publican, adjudicated bankrupt
on the 4th day of September, 1862. A Dividend Meeting
will be held on the 18th day of October instant, at eleven
o'clock in the forenoon precisely.

Thomas Bourn, of Upper Howsell, in the parish of Leigh;
in the county of Worcester, Brickmaker and Huckster
Shopkeeper, adjudicated bankrupt on the 14th day of July;
1862. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the 18th day
of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the forenoon pre-
cisely.

At the County Court of Warwickshire, holdeu at Stratford*
on-Avon, before R. H. Hobbes, Esq., Registrar:

Thomas Edkins, of Court No. 1, Wood-street, .Stratford*
on-Avon, in the county of Warwick, Currier and.Leather
Cutter, adjudicated bankrupt on the 25th day of January,
1862. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the 17th day
of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the forenoon pre-
cisely.

William Coldicott, of Stratford-npon-Avon, in the county
of Warwick, Tailor and Clothier, adjudicated bankrupt on
the 27th day of March, 1862. A Dividend Meeting
will be held on the 17th day of October instant, at eleven
o'clock in the forenoon precisely.

Charles Gopsill, of Stratford-upon-Avon, in the county
of Warwick, Tailor, Clothier, Hosier, Draper, and Dealer
in Fancy .Pipes, adjudicated bankrupt on the 9th day of
April, 1862. A Dividend Meeting will be held on. the
17th day of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the fore-
noon precisely.

William Wright Chamberlain (sued as William Walker
Chamberlain), of Stratford-npon-A von, in the county of
Warwick, Coal Dealer, adjudicated bankrupt on the 13th
day of February, 1863. A Dividend Meeting will be held
on the 17th day of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the
forenoon precisely.

James Hopes and John Hopes, of Snitterfield, in the
county of Warwick, Farmers and Corn Thrashers for Hire,
adjudicated bankrupts on the 2nd day of March, 1863. .A
Dividend Meeting will be held on the 17th day of October
instant, at eleven o'clock in the forenoon precisely. _..:

John Meades, of Stratford-upon-Avon, in..jthe- county of
Warwick, Carpenter and Joiner, and Builder, adjudicated
bankrupt on the 19th day of October, 18G3. A Dividend
Meeting will be held on the 17th day of October instant^
at eleven o'clock in the forenoon precisely. . , . .:

George Payne, of Stratford-upon-Avon, in the county of
Warwick, Beerhouse Keeper and Cooper, adjudicated- banE-
rupt on the 25th day of February, 1864. A Dividend
Meeting will be held on the 17th day of October instant, at
eleven o'clock in the forenoon precisely.

At the County Court Hampshire, holden at Portsmouth,
before John Howard, Esq., Registrar.

Henry Hatch, of No. 6, Victoria-terrace, Lake-road,
Landport, Hants, a Gunner in the Royal Navy, adjudicated
bankrupt on the 13th day of November, 1861. A Dividend
Meeting will be held on the 17th day of October instant,
at eleven o'clock in the forenoon precisely.

Mary Earwaker, of No. 4, Duke-street, Lake-road, Land-
port, Hants, Grocer, adjudicated bankrupt on the 12th day
of March, 1862. A Dividend Meeting will be held on the
17th day of October instant, at eleven o'clock in the fore-
noon precisely.

George Frederick Gauntlett, of No. 30, St. Mary-street,
Portsmouth, Hants, Tailor and General Outfitter,: adfudl-


