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Robert Roberts, of the Grosvenor's Arms. Cefnmawr, in
the parish of Ruahon, in the county of Denbigh, Innkeeper
and Mining Labourer, adjudicated bankrupt on the 13th
day of May, 1867. An Order of Discharge was granted by
the County Court of Denbighshire, holden at Wrexbam,
on the 19th day of June, 1867.

Henry Howarth, of No. 15, Bury-street, Salford, in the
county of Lancaster, Butcher, and late a Prisoner for Debt
in the Manchester City Gaol, adjudicated bankrupt on the
16th day of April, 1807. An Order of Discharge was
granted by the County Court of Lancashire, liolden at
Salford, on the 20th day of June, 1867.

Henry Shepherd, of No. 36, Great Jackson-street, Hulme,
in the county of Lancaster, Clothier and General Dealer,
and late a Prisoner for Debt in the Manchester City Gaol,
adjudicated bankrupt on the 16th day of April, 1867. An
Order of Discharge was granted by the County Court of
Lancashire, holden at Salford, the 20th day of June, 1867.

Marmaduke Langdale, of No. 62, Camp-street, Lower
Brouglitoti, recently carrying on business at Stanley-street,
Post-street, Manchester, both in the county of Lancaster,
as an Iron and Tin-plate Worker, but now out of business
and employment, adjudicated bankrupt on the 16th day of
May, 18f>7. An Order of Discharge was granted by the
County Court of Lancashire, holden at Salford, on the 20th
day of June, 1867.

Henry Collinge, at present and during seven months now
last past residing at No. 14, Ducie street, Liverpool-street,
Salford, in the parish of Manchester, and county palatine of
Lancaster, following the occupation of a Commercial Tra-
veller on Commission, for four weeks previously thereto at
No. 11, Sutherland-place, Cross-lane, in Salford aforesaid,
following no employment, and for four years previously
thereto at No. 13, Wainwright-street, Ardw:ck, in Man-
chester aforesaid, carrying on business as Goods Porter, at
No. 61, Bedford-street, in Ardwick aforesaid, adjudicated
bankrupt on the 13th day of April, 1867. An Order of
Discharge was granted by the County Court of Lancashire,
holden at Salford, on the 20th day of June, 1867.

Henry Rodgers, of No. 17. Cook-street, and No. 219,
Stretford-road, both in Hulme, in the county of Lancaster,
Hairdresser, adjudicated bankrupt on the llth day of April,
1867. An Order of Discharge was granted by the County
Court of Lancashire, holden at Salford, on the 20th day
of June, 1867.

Daniel Bowers, of No. 24, Owen-street, Hulme, hi the
county of Lancaster, Beerseller and Provision Dealer,
adjudicated bankrupt on the 26th day of March, 1867. An
Order of Discharge was granted by the County Court of
Lancashire, holden at Salford, on the 20th day of June,
1837, to be delivered to the bankrupt at the expiration of
three months from the above date.

William Makinson, of Chester-road, Stretford, in the
county of Lancaster, Warehouseman, adjudicated bankrupt
on the 8th day of May, 1867. An Order of Discharge was
granted by the County Court of Lancashire, holdeu at
Salford, on the 20th day of June, 1867.

Robert Wolstenhulme, of No. . 85, Dunkerly-street,
Oldliam, in the county of Lancaster, Pattern Designer, and
late a Prisoner for Debt in Her Majesty's Prison at Lan-
caster, having been adjudged bankrupt by a Registrar of
the Court of Bankruptcy, attending at Lancaster Castle, on
the 20th day of February, 1867, and the adjudication being
directed to be prosecuted at the County Court of Lancaster,
holden at Oldliam. An Order of Discharge was granted
by the County Court of Lancashire, holdeu at Oldham, on
the 21st day of June, 1867.

Alfred Albert Phipps, of Clewer New Town, near
Windsor, in the county of Berks, Journeyman Butcher,
adjudicated bankrupt,>on the 11th day of December, 186G.
An Order of Discharge was granted by the County Court
of Berkshire, holden at Windsor, on the 18th day of June,
1867.

James Aubury, of Bracknell, in the county of Berks,
Boot and Shoe Maker and Publican, adjudicated bankrupt

^on the 9th day of May, 1867. An Order of Discharge
'was granted by the County Court of Berkshire, holdeu at
Windsor, on the 18th day of June, 186?.

Thomas Tubb, of Cippenham Green, in the county of
Bucks, Wheelwrijjht, adjudicated bankrupt on the 28tti
d;iy of Mu-cli, ltit>7- An Order of Discharge was granted
by the County Court of Lancashire, holden at Windsor, on
the I8tb. day of June, 186?.

Mary Summers, of Bury St. Edmunds, in the county of
Suffolk, Widow, Laundress, adjudicated bankrupt on the
4th day of April, 1867. An Order of Discharge was
granted by the County Court of Suffolk, holden at Bury
St. Edmunds, on the 10th day of May, 18(>7.

Henry Last, of Norton, in the county of Suffolk, Rake-
maker, adjudicated bankrupt oa the llth day of April,

1867. An Order of Discharge was granted by the County
Court of Suffolk, holden at Bury St Edmunds, on the 7th
day of June, 1867.

John Scattergood, now and for five years last past residing
at Ilkeston, in the county of Derby, and during the whole
of that time carrying on business as a Grocer and Shoe*
maker, adjudicated bankrupt ou the 14th day of March,
1867. An Order of Discharge was granted by the County
Court of Derbyshire, holden at Belper, on the 13th day of
June, 1867.

Isaac Cordon, now and for these twelve months past
residing in Regent-street, Ilkeston, in the county of Derby,
and working as a Labourer, and for six months previously
thereto residing at Middlesborough, in the county of York,
and working as a Furnace-man, and for three years before
that period residing at Ripley, in the said county of Derby,
aud working as an Ironstone and Coal Contractor, adjudi-
cated bankrupt on the 15th day of March, 1867. An Order
of Discharge was granted by the County Court of Derby-
shire, holden at Belper, on the 13th day of June, 1867.

Samuel Shaw, of Ilkeston, in the county of Derby, Boot
and Shoe Maker, adjudicated bankrupt on the 28th day of
November, 1866. An Order of Discharge was granted by
the County Court of Derbyshire, holden at Belper, on the
13th day of June, 1867.

George Booth, of Runcorn, in the county of Chester,
Butcher, adjudicated bankrupt on the 30th day of April,
1867. An Order of Discharge was granted by the County
Court of Cheshire, holden at Runcorn, on the 18th day of
June, 1867.

Alban William Caldwel), of Runcorn, in the county of
Chester, out of business, adjudicated bankrupt on the 12th
day of April, 1867. An Order of Discharge was granted by
the County Court of Chester, holden at Runcorn, on the
Itithday of June, 1867.

Jaraes Whalley, of Greenway-road, Runcorn, hi the
county of Chester, Contractor, adjudicated bankrupt on the
15th day of November, 1866. An Order of Discharge was
granted by the County Court of Chester, holden at Runcorn,
on the 18th day of June, 1867.

Betsy Hutchings Sherrin, commonly called Bessie Sherrin,
and Eliza Sherrin, trading at Bridgwater, in the county of
Somerset, in copartnership as B. and E. Sherrin, adjudicated
bankrupt on the 18th day of March, 1867. An Order of
Discharge was granted by the County Court of Somerset-
shire, holden at Bridgwater, on the 21st day of June, 1867.

Edward Gresty, of Partington, near Altrinchani, in the
county of Chester, Market Gardener, adjudicated bankrupt
on the 16th day of April, 1867. AD Order of Discharge
was granted by the County Court of Cheshire, holden at
Altrincham, on the 19th day of June, 1867.

Cornelius Guest, of Red Hall, Gornal-wood, in the parish
of Sedgley, in the county of Stafford, formerly carrying on
business as a Charter Master, but now and for the last two
months following the occupation of a Miner, adjudicated
bankrupt ou the 6th day of May, 1867. An Order of Dis-
charge was granted by the County Court of Worcestershire,
holden at Dudley, on the 18th day of June, 1867.

John Mounsey, in lodgings in Springfield-lane, Salford,
Carver and Waiter, formerly of the Cockpit Hill-entry,
Market-street, Manchester, Beer Retailer and Carver and
Waiter, adjudicated bankrupt on the 10th day of May,
1867- An Order of Discharge was granted by the County
Court of Lancashire, holden atj Manchester, on the 26th
day of June, 1867-

William Ambler, at present and for four years and a-half
last past of Bridge-street, Attorney and Solicitor, and dnring
one year and nine months of that period residing at No. 1,
Strand-avenue, Cheetwood, both in the city of Manchester,
aud previously for two years residing at No. 50, Ordsall-lane,
aud previously for nine months residing at No. 23,
St. Stephens-street, both in Salford, in the county of Lan-
caster, adjudicated bankrupt on the 18th day of April,
1867. An Order of Discharge was granted by the County
Court of Lancashire, holden at Manchester, on the 26th
day of June, 1867.

Joseph Sullivan, of No. 4, Charles-street, off Lower
Byrom-street, Manchester, in the county of Lancaster,
formerly of Wesley-place, Scarborough, and of No. 17*
Griuision-street, Hull, both in tho county of York, and of
London, iu the county of Middlesex, and of Blackburn, in
the said county of Lancaster, Music Hall Proprietor and
Instrumentalist and Vocalist, adjudicated bankrupt on the
22ud day of May, 1867* An Order of Discharge was
granted by the County Court of Lancashire, holden at
Manchester, ou the 26ch day of June, l«6'7.

Phillip Christian Stortz, for six months last past in
lodgings at No. 7, Eosamond-place, and previously thereto
at No. 38, Booth-street East, and at Chaucer-street, all in
the city of Manchester, aud previously thereto residing at


