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limited for the said bankrupt to surrender. Mr. John Hart,
.of Dorking, is the Official Assignee, and Mr. M. Head, of
Beigiite, Surrey, is the Solicitor acting in the bankruptcy.

John BuHey Mason, living in lodgings at No. 132, High.
croes-str» et, Leicester, and forme' ly earn ing o"> hu*in«-8*
as an fronfnunder, in Elbnw-lane, Leicester, wi th Joseph
Argyle, under the name of Masnn and Argyle, and now
carrying on the same business at the same place, on his own
account, having been adjudged bankrupt under a Petition
for adjudication of Bankruptcy, filed in the County Court
of Leicestershire, holden at Leicester, on the 2nd day of
October, 1869,' a public sitting, for the said bankrupt to
pass his Last Examination, and make application ;for his
Discharge, will he held at the said Court, at the Castle at
Leicester aforesaid, on the 17th day of November next, at
ten o'clock in the forenoon precisely, the day last aforesaid
being the day limited for the said bankrupt to surrender.
Mr. Thomas Ingram, of Leicester, is the Official Assignee,
and Mr. Hiram Abiff Owston, of Friar-lane, Leicester^ is
the Solicitor acting in the bankruptcy.

William Bambury, of Brannton, in the county of Devon,
C'Tdwainer, having been adjudged bankrupt under a Pe-
tition for wdjudication of Bankruptcy, filed in the County
Court of Devonshire, holden at Barnstaple, on the 9th day
of October, 1869, a. public sitting, for the said bankrupt to
pass his Last Examination, and make application for his
Discharge, will be held at the said Court, at the Guildhall,
Barnstaple, on the 9th day of November next, at twelve at
noon precisely, the day last aforesaid being the day limited
for the said bankrupt to surrender. The Registrar of the
Court is the Official Assignee, and Mr. R. J. Rencraft, of
Barnstaple. is the Solicitor acting in the bankruptcy.

Su«an Williams, of Ottery Saint Mary, .in the county of
Deion, Widow, lately earning on the trnde of a Grocer
and B-ker, but npw out of business, having been adjudged
bankrupt under a Petition for adjudication of Bankruptcy,
filed in the County Court of Devonshire, holden at Honiton,
on the 7.h day of October, 1869, a public sitting,- for the
said bankrupt to pass her Last Examination, and make
application for her Discharge, will be held at the said Court,
at the Court-house, in Honiton, on the 9ih day of De-
cember next, at eleven o'clock in the forenoon precisely, the
day last aforesaid being the day limited fur the said bank-
rupt to surrender. Edmund Stamp, Esq., is the Official
Assignee, and Francis Robert Jeffery, Esq., of Ottery,
Saint Mary, is the Solicitor acting in the bankruptcy.

Alfred Pearse, of Saltram View, Laira Egg, Buckland,
in the county of Devon, Ale and Porter Merchant, carrying
on bisiness at Station-road, PU mouth, having been ad-
judged bankrupt under a Petition for adjudication of Bank-
ruptcy, tiled in the County Court of Devonshire, holien
at East Stnnehouse, on the 17th day of September 1869, a
public sitting, for the said bankrupt to pass his Last Exa-
mination, and make application for his Discharge, will be
held at the said Court, at St, George's Hall, East Stone-
house, on the 10th day of November next, at ten o'clock in
the forenoon precisely, the day last aforesaid being the day
limited for .the said bankrupt to surrender. Parnmenas
Pearce, Esq, is, the Official Assignee, and John Gard
Edmonds. Esq., of Plymouth, is the Solicitor acting in the
bankruptcy.

James May, late of Merlin's-place, Clerkenwell, in the
county of Middlesex, Labourer, then of Lower College-
street, m the city of Bristol, Milkman, and uow of the
Albion Tavern, Upper Maudlin-sireer,. Bristol aforesaid,
Beerhouse Keeper, having been adjudged bankrupt under a
Petition'for adjudication of Bankruptcy, filed in the County
Court ot Gloucestershire, holden at Bristol, on the 29th day
of September, 1869, a public sitting, for the said bankrupt
to pass ms Last Examination,,and-make application for his
Discharge, will be.held.at the said Court, at Bristol, on the
15th day of November next, at ten o'clock in the forenoon
precisely, the day las.t aforesaid being the day limited for
the said bankrupt to surrender. Edward Harley and James
Gibbs, Esqrs., is the Official Assignee, and Mr. H. H.
Bcckir.ghaiu is the Solicitor acting-in the bankruptcy,

John Moniiner, of No. 52, Meadow-lane, Leeds, in the
count) of York, Stationers and Dealers in Picture Frames
and Moulder, having been adjudged bankrupts under a
Petition for' adjudication of Bankruptcy, filed in the
County Court "of Yoikshire, holden at Leeds, on the 4th
day of October, 1869. a public'sitting, for the said bank-
rupt 10 puss bis Last Examination, will be held at the said
Court, on the 11th day of November next, at twelve o'clock
at noon precisely, the day last aforesaid being the day
limited for the said bankrupt to surrender. Mr. Thomas
Marshall, of No. 11, Albion-street, Leeds, is the Official
Assignee, and Mix Charles Whiteley, of Leeds, is the
Solicitor acting in the bankruptcy.

Richard Spence, of Call-lane, Leeds, in the county of
York, Painter and Grocers' Outfitter, having been ad-

judged bankrupt nnder a Petition for adjudication of
Bankruptcy, filed in the County Court of Yorkshire,
holden at Leeds, on the 30th day of September, 1869,
a public sitting, for the said bankrupt to pass his Last Ex-
amination, will he held at the said Court, on the l l th day
of November next, at twelve o'clock at noon precisely,
the day last aforesaid being the day limited for the said
bankrupt to surrender. Mr. Thomas Marshall, of No. 11,
Albion-street, Leeds, is the Official Assignee, and Messrs.
Granger and Son, of Leeds, are the Solicitors acting in the
bankruptcy.

Mark Feel, of the Miner's Arms Inn, Saint Peter's-street,
Leeds, in the county of York, Beerhouse Keeper and Cloth
Fuller, .having been adjudged bankrupt under a Petition tor
adjudication of Bankruptcy, filed in the County Court of
Yorkshire, bolden at Leeds, on the 28th day of September,
1869, a public sitting, tor the said bankrupt to pass his
Last Examination will be held at the'said Court, on the 11th
day of November next, at twelve o'clock at noon precisely,
the day last aforesaid being the day limited for the said
bankrupt to surrender. Mr. Thomas Marshall, of No. 11,
Albion-street, Leeds, is the Official Assignee, acd Messrs.
Granger and Son, of Leeds, are the. Solicitors acting in the
bankruptcy.

John Hudson and Thomas Pybus Hudson, both of Arm-
ley, near Leeds, in the county of York, carrying on business
in copartnership as Joiners and Builders, under the name
of J. and T. Hudson, having been adjudged bankrupts under
a Petition for adjudication ot Bankruptcy, filed in the
County Court of Yorkshire, holden at Leeds, ou the 26th of
September, 1869, a public sitting, for the said bankrupts to
pass their Last Examination, will be held at the said Court,
on the llth day of November next, at twelve o'clock at
noon precisely, the day last aforesaid being the day limited
f"r the said bankrupt to surrender. Mr. Thomas Marshall,
of No. 11, Albion-street, Leeds, is the Official Assignee,
and Mr. Henry Boulton Harle, of Leeds, is the Solicitor
acting in the bankruptcy.

John Lamb, of Leeds, in the county of York, out of
business, previously of Leeds aforesaid, Currier, having
been adjudged bankrupt under a Petition for adjudication
o.f Bankruptcy, filed in the County Court of Yorkshire,
holden at Leeds, on the 22nd day of September, 186'J, a
public sitting, for the said bankrupt to pass his Last Exa-
mination, will be held at the said Court, on the l l th day
of November next, at twelve o'clock at noon precisely, the ,
day last aforesaid being the day limited for the said bank-
rupt to surrender. Mr. Thomas Marshall, of No. 11,
Albion-street, Leeds, is the Official Assignee, and Mr.
Henry Boulton Harle, of Leeds, is the Solicitor acting in
the bankruptcy.

Thomas Lancaster, of Altrincham, in the county of
Chester, Dyer, having been adjudged bankrupt under a
Petition for adjudication of Bankruptcy, filed in the County
Court of Cheshire, holden at Altrmcham, on the 5th day of
October, 1869, a public sitting, for the said bankrupt to
pass his Last Examination, and make application for his
Discharge, will bn held at the said Court, at Altrincham, on
the 15th day of November next, at eleven of the clock in
the forenoon precisely, the day last aforesaid being the day
limited for the said bankrupt to surrender. • The Registrar .
of the Court is the Official As-ignee, and Mr, James
Brownall, of Altrincham, is the Solicitor acting in the
•bankruptcy.

James Paul, of Bridgwater, in the county of Somerset,
formerly a Beerhouse Keeper, but now a Labourer, having
been adjudged bankrupt under a Petition for adjudication
of .Bankruptcy, filed in the County Court of Somersetshire,
holden at Bridgwater, on the 12th day of October, 1869. a
public sitting, for the said bankrupt to pass his Last Exa-
mination, and make application for his Discharge, will be
held «t the said Court, at Bridgwater, on the 10th day of
December next, at nine o'clock in the forenoon precisely,
the day last aforesaid being the day limited for the said
bankrupt to surrender. Henry Lovibond, of Bridgwater,
is the Official Assignee, and John W. Veysey, of Bridg-
water, is the Solicitor acting in the bankruptcy.

James Groves, of Bawdrip, in the county of Somerset,
Shopkeeper, Baker, and Labourer,, having been adjudged
bankrupt under a Pet tion for adjudication of Bankruptcy,
filed in the County Court of Somers< thsh're, bolden at
Bridge water, on tbe 7th day of October, 1869, a public
sitting, for the said bankrupt to pass bis Last Examination,
and make application for his Discharge, will be held at tbe
said Court, at Bridgwater, on the 10th of December next,
at nine in the forenoon precisely, the day last aforesaid
being the day limited for the said bankrupt to surrender.
Henry Lovibond, of Bridgwater, is the Official Assignee,
and Messrs. Reed and Cook, of Bridgwater, are the Soli-,
tutors acting in the bankruptcy.

William Bailey Meaker, of Huntspill, in the county of "
Somerset, Baker, having been adjudged bankrupt under a .


