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said Richard Vincent and Julia his wife and his
heirs and assigns'for ever.

" And whereas the said benefice of Wrotham
and the said benefice of Woodlands are (each of
them) now full of a Clerk.

" And whereas the endowments of the said
rectory and vicarage forming the benefice of
"Wrotham arc of considerable amount.

'•And whereas it has been proposed to us
by the Right Honourable and Most Reverend
Archibald Campbell Archbishop of Canterbury
acting as patron of the said rectory and vicarage
of Wrotham and with the consent of the Reverend
William Frederick Erskine Knollys Clerk in Holy
Orders, now incumbent of the said rectory and
vicarage of Wrotham and by the said Julia
Vincent and Richard Dacre Vincent acting as
such patrons.as aforesaid of the said vicarage and
benefice of Woodlands that the endowments of
the said rectory and vicarage of Wrotham shall
be apportioned as is hereinafter recommended and
proposed and that in order to render such ap-
portionment legally practicable the transfer of
patronage hereafter recommended and proposed
shall be effected.

" And whereas it has been made to appear to us
that such apportionment is expedient and under
the circumstances aforesaid we are of opinion that
the transfer of patronage hereinbefore mentioned
and hereinafter recommended and proposed will
tend to make better provision for the cure of souls
in the parish or district in or in .respect of which
the right of patronage to be transferred arises or

. exists that is to say in the said parish of Wood-
lands.

" Now therefore with the consent of the said
Archibald Campbell Archbishop of Canterbury
(in testimony of which consent he has signed this
scheme and sealed the same with his episcopal
seal) and with the consent of the said William
Frederick Erskine Knollys and of the said Julia
Vincent and of the said Richard Dacre Vincent
(in testimony of which consent they also have
respectively signed and sealed this scheme) we
humbly recommend and propose that upon -and
from the day of the date of the publication in the
London Gazette of any Order of your Majesty in
Council ratifying this scheme and without any
conveyance or assurance in the law other than
such duly gazetted Order the whole advowson or
perpetual right of patronage of the said vicarage
and benefice of Woodlands shall be transferred
from the said Julia Vincent and Richard Dacre
Vincent according to their respective estates and
interests therein as aforasaid and shall thereupon
become and be absolutely vested in the said
Archibald Campbell or other the person -then,
being Archbishop of Canterbury and his succes-
sors Archbishops of-Canterbury for ever. •,

" And we further recommend and propose with
the like consents testified as aforesaid that with-
out any conveyance or assurance in the law other
than as aforesaid and as from the day aforesaid
all and singular the lands tithes rent-charges in
lieu of tithes and other (if any other) endowments
which now belong or which may hereafter belong
to the said rectory and vicarage of Wrotham shall
lae chargeable and for ever thereafter be charged
with one clear annual sum of one hundred pounds
•in favour of the vicar or incumbent of the said
benefice of Woodlands and his successors to whom
the same annual sum or yearly charge of one
'hundred pounds shall be due and payable and that
the same annual sum or yearly rent-charge of one
hundred pounds shall be apportionable between
any outgoing vicar or incumbent of the-said bene-
•fice of Woodlands or his representatives or repre-

sentative and:his successors in the same vicarage
or incumbency and be receivable by each such
vicar or incumbent by equal half-yearly payments
on the twenty-fifth day of March and the twenty-
ninth day of September in every year and that
the first of such half-yearly payments calculated
up to the twenty-fifth day of March now last past
shall be made immediately after the publication in,
the London Gazette of.any Order of your Majesty
in Council which may be made ratifying this
scheme and-that the said annual sum or yearly
rent-charge shall be recoverable as against the
person or-persons who for the time being shall be
beneficially entitled to the endowments of-the said
rectory, and vicarage of Wrotham, and that to that
end the incumbent for the time being of the said
vicarage and benefice-of Woodlands shall have the-
following powers for recovering the said rent-
charge (that is to say) Power if and whenever
any part of the said rent-charge shall at any time
be unpaid for twenty-one days after any of the-
times appointed for the payment-thereof (although
there shall not have -been any legal demand made
thereof) to enter into the receipt of the endow-
ments charged therewith or any part thereof and
to receive and take the same until he shall thereby
or otherwise be paid and satisfied the same rent-
charge and the arrears thereof due at the time of
such -entry or afterwards to become due during
his being in possession of the same premises toge-
ther with all costs and expenses occasioned by the
non-payment thereof and for the purpose of col-
lecting receiving and recovering such endowments
or any of them to use exercise and enjoy all such
powers and remedies for collecting recovering and
enforcing payment thereof and of the-annual sums
payable for or towards the raising or making up
the same as may be statutably exercised or ex-
ercisable by him under the law then in force.

"Provided always that if at any time the
incumbent for the time being of the said rectory
and vicarage of Wrotham shall by any deed duly
executed by him under his hand and seal in
accordance with the provisions of any statute in,
that behalf enabling him grant convey and annex
to the said benefice of Woodlands any part or
parts of the rectorial or vicarial endowments
belonging to the said benefice of Wrotham which
shall in the opinion of the Archbishop of Canter-
bury for the time being be a just and fair equiva-
lent or not less than an equivalent for the said
annual sum or yearly charge of one hundred
pounds the same annual sum or yearly charge of
one hundred pounds shall thereupon and thence-
forth cease and determine and be no longer pay-
able as hereinbefore recommended and proposed.

" And we further recommend and propose that
nothing herein contained shall prevent us from
recommending and proposing any other measures
relating to the matters aforesaid or any of them
in accordance with the provisions of the said
Acts or of either of them or of any other Act of
Parliament."

And whereas the said scheme has been approved
by Her Majesty in Council; now, therefore, Her
Majesty, by and with the advice of Her said
Council, is pleased hereby to ratify the said
scheme, and to order and direct that the same and
every part thereof shall be effectual in law imme-
diately from and after the time when this Order
shall have been duly published in the London
'Gazette pursuant to the said Acts ; and Her
Majesty, by and with the like advice, is pleased
hereby to direct that this Order be forthwith
registered by the Registrar of the said diocese of
Canterbury. C. L. Peel.


