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road to Goodman-street and thence along Good-
man-street to the point first described.

."And I do hereby determine that the East
Hunslet Ward shall comprise such portions of the
townships of Hunslet, Hoi beck and Beeston as
are contained within a line commencing at a point
where the Leeds and Dewsbury-road crosses the
parliamentary boundary of the borough of Leeds,
thence passing along the said borough boundary
eastwardly to the centre of the River Aire, thence
along the centre of the said river to a point oppo-
site Goodman-street, thence along Goodman-street,
across Hunslet-road, to and along Glasshouse-
street to where the same is crossed by Jack-lane,
thence along Jack-lane to the point where it
is crossed by the tramway of the Middletoo
Colliery Company, thence southwardly along the
said tramway to the point where it is crossed by
a road which leads from Hunslet Railway Station
across the Hunslet Moor to Dewsbury-road at
Drayton Manor otherwise Junction Inn, thence
along the said road to Dewsbury-rpad at Drayton
Manor otherwise Junction Inn and thence along
the Dewsbury-road to the point first described.

" And I do hereby determine that the West
Hunslet Ward shall comprise such portions of the
townships of Hunslet, Holbeck and B,eeston as
are contained within a line commencing? at a point
where tlje Leeds and Dewsbury-road crosses the
boundary of the borough of Leeds, thence passing
towards Leeds along the said Dewsbury-road to
where it is met at Drayton Manor otherwise
Junction Inn, by a road from Hunslet Railway
Station to the aforesaid point in Dewsbury-road
at Drayton Manor, thence turning and passing
aloqg the said road towards Hunslet Bailway
Station until it is met by the Middleton Colliery
Tramway, thence towards Leeds along the said
tramway to a point where it is met by the boun-
dary of the township of Holbeck, thence along
the last-mentioned township boundary to the point
where the boundaries of the townships of Leeds,
Hunslet and Holbeck meet, theuce along the
boundary of the township of Leeds to the point
where the same crosses Meadow-lane at the junc-
tion of the latter with Dewsbury-road, thence
southwardly passing along Meadow-lane and
Beeston-road to the point in Beeston-road where
it is met and crossed by the boundary line of the
townships of Beeston and Holbeck, thence north-
westwardly along the said township boundary and
the boundary of Hunslet detached (otherwise
Littletown) thence continuing along the southern
$fl'd western boundary of the township of Holbeck
to the ppint where the latter is met by the boun-
dary of the township of Wortley, thence along
the boundary of the township of Wortley until
Ihe latter is met by the boundary of the township
of Farnley, thence along the last-mentioned town-
ship boundary to the point where it is met by the
•parliamentary boundary of, the borough of Leeds
thence along the latter boundary to the point first
described.

" And I do hereby determine that the Holbeck
•Ward shall comprise such portions of the town-
ships of Holbeck and Hunslet, including Hunslet
detached (otherwise Littletown) as are contained
within a line commencing at a point in Beeston-
road where the boundary line dividing the town-
ship of Beeston from that of Holbeck crosses the
said road, proceeding towards Leeds along the
aforesaid Beeston-road and along Meadow-lane to
the point where it is met by the boundary line of
the township of Leeds, thence northwestwardly
•along the said boundary .of the township of Leeds
to the centre of the River Aire and continuing
•along the said township boundary in the centre of

the river to the point where it is met by the boun-
dary of the township of Wortley, thence along
the said boundary of the township of Wortley to
the point where the boundaries of the townships
of Wortley, Holbeck and Becston- meet together,
and thence eastwardly along the boundary of the
townships of Beeston and Holbeck with Hunslet
detached to the point first described.

"And I do hereby determine that the New
Wortley Ward shall comprise such portion of the
township of Wortley as is comprised in the.parish
of St. John's, New Wortley.

" And I do hereby determine that the.Armley
and Wortley Ward shall comprise such, portion of
the township of Wortley as remains after the
parish of St. John's New Wortley has been
deducted, which portion is otherwise kno^n as
Upper and Lower Wortley and also shall comprise,
the whole of the township of Armiey.

u And I do hereby determine that the Bramley
Ward shall comprise the townships of Bramjey
and Farnley.

"And I do hereby determine that the Head-;
ingley Ward shall comprise the township of Head-
ingley-cum-Burley, and suQh "portion of the town-
ship of Chapel Allerton as is situated south-west
of so much of Stainbeck-lane as lies between the
parliamentary boundary of the borough of Leeds,
and the junction of Stainbeck-lane with the bouji-
dary of the township of Potter Newton.

"And I do hereby declare that whenever $n
the description of the boundary lines of the several
wards so set out as aforesaid any line is said, to
pass along.or to be drawn to or from any street,
road, lane, bridge, river, stream, wa.tercou.rse or
channel, such line shall be considered- to pass
along or to be drawn .to or from the middle of
such street, road, lane, bridge, river, stream,
watercourse or- channel; and that whenever in
such description the point at which any street,
road, lane, bridge, boundary, river, stream, water-
course or channel, is said to meet or cross any
street, road, lane, bridge, boundary, river, stream, .
watercourse or channel, that point shall be con-
sidered to be described at which a line passing
alqng the middle of the street, road, lane, bridge,
boundary, river, stream, watercourse .or channel,
so met or crossed, would be intersected by a line
drawn along the middle of the street, road, Jane,,
bridge, boundary, river, stream, watercourse or
channel, so meeting or crossing if such lines were
prolonged sufficiently far.

" And I the said Vincent Thomas Thompson do
hereby in further pursuance, of the said Acts and
of the powers given me under the game by virtue
of the said appointment assign and apportion three
Councillors to each and every of the said several
Wards as follown, that is to say :—rTo the. Mill
Hill Ward, Councillors Henry Dufton, John
Hardwick and Joseph Walley. To the West
Ward, Councillors Frederick Robert Spark, John
William Petty, and William North. To the
North-west Ward Councillors Booty Georgq
Baker, Joseph Edward Binns and Adam Brown.
T.6 the Brunswick Ward, Councillors Titus
Bennett Stead, William Hudson, and James
Scarborough Loe. To the Central Ward, Coun-
cillors William Clayton, William Nicholson and
William Metcalfe. To the North Ward, Coun-
cillors George Irwin, Benjamin Binks and Joseph
Buckton. To the North East Ward, Councillors
George Clay.Cutler, Henry Slater Whitham and
Thomas Smith. To the East Ward, Councillors
James Richardson, William Scuphatn and Owen
John Ceenty. To the South Ward, Councillors
William Lynd, Edwin William B,atley and Joljp
Hunt. • TO the East Hunslet Ward, Councillors


