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every other power enabling them in this behalf,
do order, and it is hereby ordered, as follows:

1. This Order shall take effect from and imme-
diately after the sixth day of April, one thou-
sand eight hundred and eighty-two.

2. The following area (namely),—so much of
the township of Heck, in the West Biding of the
county of York, as lies within the following boun-
daries, that is to say, the Hull and Barnsley Rail-
way on the west j the Aire-and Calder Canal on
the south ; the Doncaster and Selby Railv/ay on
the east; and the Fontefract and Snaith highway
on the north,—which was declared by Order of
Council dated the eighteenth day of February,
one thousand eight hundred and eighty-two, to be
an area infected with foot-and-mouth disease, is
hereby declared to be free from foot-and-mouth
disease, and that area shall, as from the commence-
ment of this Order, cease to be 'an area -infected
with foot-and-mouth disease. C. L. Peel.

A'T the Council Chamber, Whitehall, the 5th
day of April, 1882.

By Her Majesty's Most Honourable Privy
Council.

THE Lords and others of Her Majesty's Most
Honourable Privy Council, by virtue and in

exercise of the powers in them vested under The
Contagious Diseases (Animals) Act, 1878, and of
every other power enabling them in this behalf,
do order, and it is hereby ordered, as follows :

1. Each of the areas described in the Schedule
to this Order is hereby declared to be an area
infected with foot-and-mouth disease.

2. This Order shall take effect from and imme-
diately after the sixth day of April, one thou-
sand eight hundred and eighty-two.

C. Z. Peel.

SCHEDULE.
(1.) An area comprising so much of the town-

ship of Hooton, in the county of Chester, as lies
within the following boundaries, that is to say,
New Chester-road commencing in the township
of Hooton at the boundary of Hooton Hall farm
and lands of J. Aspinal Tobin to Hooton Toll
Gate,.a lane known as Hooton Green to Hooton
Cottages, the boundary fence between lands in
the occupation of Richard Littler to Hooton
Church, the boundary fence on the south side of
Hooton Park dividing the Park from lands in the
occupation of Joseph Howard and James Kellet to
the river Mersey, and from the river Mersey the
boundary fence of Hooton Park to Chester-road.

(2.) An area comprising so much of the town-
ship of Siddington, in the county of Chester, as
lies within the following boundaries, that is to
say, Siddington Old Toll Bar site along Congle-
ton-road to and along Occupation-road by Enoch
Massey's farm, Mar ton to Marton brook, the
permanent fence between William Slack's and
Thomas Adshead's farms, across Blackdair-lane
to Old Mere Wood side to Congleton-road and
Old Toll Bar aforesaid.

AT the Council Chamber^ Whitehall, the 5th
dny of April) 1882,

By Her Majesty's Most Honourable Privy
Council.

fipHE Lords and others of Her Majesty's Most
JL Honourable Privy Council, by virtue and in
exercise of the powers in them vested under The
Contagious Diseases (Animals) Act, 1878, and of

every other power enabling them in this behalf,
do order, and it is hereby ordered, as follows : .

1. The area described in the Schedule to this
Order is hereby declared to be an area infected
with foot-and-mouth disease.

2. This Order shall take effect from and imme-
diately after the sixth day of April, one thou-
sand eight hundred and eighty-two.

C. L.Peel.

SCHEDULE.
An area comprising so much of the township

of Linton, in the county of Derby, as lies within
the following boundaries, that is to say, the
Burton and Measham main-road on the east,
from Highcross Banks to Linton Drift, the fence
along the boundary of the counties of Leicester
and Derby to a point opposite Tilly's Beer House
on'the south, the main-road through the village
of Linton to Brooky-lane on the west, and along
Brooky-lane to Highcross Banks on the north.

T the Council Chamber, Whitehall, the 5th
day of April. 1882.

By Her Majesty's Most Honourable Privy
Council.

Lords and others of Her Majesty's Most
JL Honourable Privy Council, by virtue and in
exercise of the powers in them vested under The
Contagious Diseases (Animals) Act, 1878, and of
every other power enabling them in this behalf,
do order, and it is hereby ordered, as follows :

1. Each of the areas described in the Schedule
to this Order is hereby declared to be an area
infected with foot-and-mouth disease.

2. This Order shall take effect from and imme-
diately after the sixth day of April, one thou-
sand eight hundred and eighty-two.

C. L. Peel.

SCHEDULE.
(1.) An area comprising so much of the parish

of Noseley, in the county of Leicester, as lies
within the following boundaries, that is to say,
Noseley-road and brook on the south and east,
Rollestone Wood and Village road leading to
New Inn and Noseley on the north and west.

(2.) An area comprising so much of the parish
of Theddingworth, in the county of Leicester, as
lies within the following boundaries, that is to say,
the road from Lubenham to Mowsley on the
north, the London and North- Western railway on
the south, the' road from Theddingworth to
Laughton on the east, and the road from Thed-
dingworth to Mowsley on the west.

AIT the Council Chamber, Whitehall, the 5th
day of April, 1882. ' *;

By Her Majesty's Most Honourable Privy
Council.

fTIHE Lords and others of Her Majesty's Most
JL Honourable Privy Council, by virtue and in
exercise of the powers in them vested under The
Contagious Diseases (Animals) Act, 1878, and of
every other power enabling them in this behalf,
do order, and it is hereby ordered, as follows:

1. The area described in the Schedule to this
Order is hereby declared to be an area infected
with foot-and-mouth disease.

2. This Order shall take effect from and imme-
diately after the sixth day of April, one thou-
sand eight hundred and eighty-two.

C, L. Peel


