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NOTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership hereto- 1 "VTOTTCE is hereby given, that the Partnership hereto-
fore subsisting1 between Robert Bonar and John 11 fore subsisting between Thomas Brook and Francisfore subsisting between Robert Bonar and John

Henry Binnington, carrying on business at Nos. 106,
112, and 114, High-street, Peckham, Surrey, as Ladies'
and Children's Outfitters, Fancy and General Drapers,
under the style of Bonar and Binnington, has been
dissolved, by mutual consent, as from the 1st May
instant; and that the said business at 106, High-street,
Peckham aforesaid, will in future be carried on by
Robert Bonar alone, and the business at 112 and 114,
High-street, Peckham aforesaid, will be carried on by
John Henry Binnington alone. All debts due to and
owing by the late firm will be received and paid by
John Henry Binnington.—Dated 25th May, 1887.

Robert Sonar.
John Henry Binnington.

NOTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership hereto-
fore subsisting between us the undersigned,

Benjamin Hannan, Henry Thomas, and George Mooney,
carrying on business as Brokers and Commission Mer-
chants in Grain and Grain Futures, at Leadenhall-
buildings, in the city of London, under the style or firm
of Hannan and Company, was this day dissolved, by
mutual consent, so far as regards the said George
Mooney. The business will henceforth be carried on at
the above address by the said Benjamin Hannan and
Henry Thomas, by whom and to whom all debts due by
or owing to the late firm will be paid and received
respectively.—Dated this 24th day of May, 1887.

B. Hannan.
Henry Thomas.
George Mooney.

NOTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership hereto-
fore existing between us, the undersigned John

Wood and Frederick Todtenhaupt, carrying on business
as Metal Workers, at No. 72, London-wall, in the city of
London, and 43, Clarence-road and Clarence-mews,
Hackney, in the county of Middlesex, under the style or
firm of Wood and Todtenhaupt, has been dissolved, by
mutual consent, as from the 20th day of May, 1887.
All debts due to or owing by the said late firm will be
received and paid by the said Frederick Todtenhaupt.—
Dated this 20th day of May, 1887.

John Wood.
F. Todtenhaupt.

NOTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership hereto-
fore subsisting between us the undersigned, Claude

Lewis Cope, Alexander Agnew, and John Ear mar Smith,
carrying on business as Tea Dealers, at No. 9, Mincing-
lane, in the city of London and in Dublin, under the
style or firm of Cope, Agnew, and Smith, has been dis-
solved, by mutual consent, as from the 31st day of
December last; and the said Claude Lewis Cope will
receive and pay all debts due to or from the late firm,
and will carry on the said business under the style of
Cope and Co.—Dated this 20th day of May, 1887.

Claude Lewis Cope.
Alexander Agnew.
John Harmar Smith.

NOTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership hereto-
fore subsisting between us the undersigned, Henry

Duve and Ferdinand Seeck, carrying on business as
Confectioners, at 7, North-parade, Bradford, in the
county of York, under the style of Duve and Seeck, has
been dissolved, by mutual consent, as and from the 20th
.day of May, 1887 ; and the business will henceforth be
carried on by the said Ferdinand Seeck alone at the
same address, who will pay and discharge all debts and
liabilities, and receive all moneys payable to the said
late firm.—Dated this 20th day of May, 1887.

Henry Duve.
Ferdinand Seeck.

"VT OTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership hereto-
ll fore subsisting between the undersigned, Alfred
Henry Allen and Thomas Bayley, at Birmingham, in the

.county of Warwick, as Analytical Chemists, has been
this day dissolved by mutual consent.—Dated this 18th
day of May, 1887. Alfred ff. Allen.

Thomas Bayley.

"VJ OTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership hitherto
i\ subsisting between the undersigned, Thomas
Fawler Thatcher and William Thatcher, in the business
of Grocers and Provision Dealers, at No. 8, West-street,
Sunderland, in the county of Durham, under the style or
firm of T. F. Thatcher and Son, has this day been dis-
solved by mutual consent.—As witness our hands this
12th day of May, 1887.

Thomas Fawler Thatcher.
William Thatcher.

No. 25704. C

11 fore subsisting between Thomas Brook and Francis
Cliffe Brook, carrying on business at the Polygon,
Bowdon, in the county of Chester, as Grocers and
Provision Dealers, under the style or firm, of Thomas
Brook and Company, was dissolved, on the 16th day of
May, 1887, by mutual consent. All debts due to or
owing by the late firm will be received or paid by the
said Francis Cliffe Brook, who will in future carry on the
said business on his own account.—Dated the 24th day
of May, 1887. Thomas Brook.

Francis Cliffe Brook.

NOTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership which
has for some time past been carried on by George

Parkin and John Clark Barclay, under the firm of Parkin
and Barclay, at 95, Town-lane, Dukinfield, in the county
of Chester, in the trade or business of Grocers and
Provision Dealers, was this day dissolved by mutual
consent. All debts due to or owing by the said firm will
be received and paid by the said John Clark Barclay,
who will continue to carry on the said business.—As
witness our hands this 23rd day of May, 1887.

George Parkin.
Jo An Clark Barclay.

NOTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership hereto-
fore subsisting between us the undersigned, John

William Wright and Henry Whitaker, carrying on
business as Cotton Manufacturers, at Albion Shed,
Whittlefield, Burnley, in the county of Lancaster, under
the style or firm of Wright and Whitaker, has this day
been dissolved by mutual consent. All debts due to or
owing by the said late firm will be received or paid by
the said Henry Whitaker, who will henceforth carry on
the said business on his own account.—Dated this 18th
day of May, 1887. John William Wright.

Henry Whitaker.

NOTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership hereto-
fore subsisting between us the undersigned, John

William Henry Warren and Henry Booth, carrying on
business as Practical Tailors, at No. 46, King-street,
South Shields, in the county of Durham, under the style
or firm of Warren and Booth, has been dissolved, by
mutual consent, as and from the 20th day of May, 1887.
All debts due to and owing by the said late firm will be
received and paid by the said John William Henry
Warren, who will in future carry on the business on his
own account, under the style or firm of Warren and
Company.—As witness our hands this 21st day of May,
1887. Jno. Wm.Hy. Warren.

Henry Booth.

Vf OTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership existing
i ̂  between us the undersigned, Benjamin Burdekin,

John William Pye-Smith, Reginald Benson, and Benjamin
Thomas Burdekin, carrying on business as Solicitors, at
41, Norfolk-street, Sheffield, was dissolved on the 30th
day of April, 1887, so far as concerns the said John
William Pye-Smith by his retirement therefrom. All
debts due to or owing by the late partnership will be
received and paid by the remaining partners at their
office, 41, Norfolk-street, Sheffield.—Dated this 23rd day
of May, 1887.

Benj. Burdekin. Begd. Benson.
J. W. Pye-Smith. B. T. Burdekin.

"Vf OTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership hereto-
IA fore subsisting between us the undersigned, William

Cordwin and John Thomas Nundy, carrying on business
at Blakeney, in the county of Gloucester, as Brewers and
Maltsters, under the style or firm of Nnndy and Co., has
been dissolved, by mutual consent, as from the 7th day
of May, 1887. All debts due to and owing by the said
firm of Nundy and Co., will be received and paid by the
said John Thomas Nundy, who will in future carry on ihe
business on his own account.—Dated the 14th day of
May, 1887. William Cordwin.

John Thomas Nundy.

NOTICE is hereby given, that the Partnership hereto-
fore subsisting between the undersigned, carrying

on the business of Grocers, &c., at Wilton and Salisbury,
in the county of Wilts, under the style or firm of White
and Shepherd, has this day been dissolved by mutual
consent. The said John White will in future carry on
the business at Wilton, and receive all sums, &c., due to
and discharge all liabilities thereof, and the said William
Shepherd will in future carry on the Salisbury business
and receive all sums, &c., due to and discharge all
liabilities thereof.—Wilton, 7th May, 1887.

John White.
Wm. Shepherd.


