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four, become a new parish of the character con-
templated by that Act, and by the Act of the
sixth and seventh years of Your Majesty chapter
thirty-seven, and by the above-mentioned Act of
the thirty-second and thirty-third years of Your
Majesty chapter ninety-four. - • - • .

"And whereas it has been represented to us
and it appears to us to be expedient that the
boundaries of the said new parish of Saint Mark
Newport should be altered in the manner herein-
after mentioned. - •

" Now therefore with the consent of the Bight
Reverend Richard Bishop of the said diocese of
Llandaff (in testimony whereof he has signed
and sealed this scheme or representation) we, the
said Ecclesiastical Commissioners humbly repre-
sent recommend and propose that from and after
the day of the date of the publication in the
London Gazette of any Order of Your Majesty
in Council ratifying this scheme or representation
the boundaries of the said new parish of Saint
Mark Newport shall be altered so that there shall
be annexed to the same new parish, all that
portion of the said parish of Saint Woolos
(Newport) which is described in the First
Schedule hereunder written and is delineated and
set forth upon the map or plan hereunto appended
and is thereon coloured green, and that from and
after the day of the same date and without any
assurance in law other than such duly gazetted
Order the said portion of the said parish of Saint
Woolos (Newport) shall be included within and
shall become and be and form part of the said-new
parish of Saint Mark Newport .and also that from
and after the day of the same date of publication
in the London Gazette as aforesaid the boundaries
of the said new parish of Saint Mark Newport
shall be further altered so that there shall be
dissevered therefrom all that portion thereof which
is described in the Second Schedule hereunder
written and is delineated and set forth upon the
said map or plan hereunto annexed and is thereon
coloured pink and that from and after the day of
the same date and without any assurance in law
other than such duly gazetted Order the said
portion of the said new parish of Saint Mark
Newport so to be dissevered from such new parish
shall be restored to and included within and shall
again become and be and form part of the said
parish of Saint Woolos (Newport).

" And we further represent recommend and
propose that nothing herein contained shall
prevent us from representing recommending or
proposing any other measures relating to the
matters aforesaid or any of them in accordance
with the provisions of the hereinbefore mentioned
Acts or of any of them or of any other Act of
Parliament.

« The SCHEDULES to which the foregoing
Scheme or Representation has reference.

" THE FIEST SCHEDULE.
" The territory to be annexed to the new parish

of Saint Mark Newport in.the county of Mon-
rbouth and in the diocese of Llandaff being :—

" All that portion of the parish of Saint Woolos
(Newport) in the county and diocese aforesaid
which is bounded on the south by the district of
Saint John. the Baptist Newport in the same
county and diocese upon the north-west, upon the
norlh-east and upon part of the south-east by the
new parish of Saint Mark Newport aforesaid, and
upon the remaining part of the south-east by an
imaginary line commencing upon the boundary
which divides the last-named new parish from the
parish of Saint Woolos (Newport) aforesaid at the
point where the road called or known as Clyffard-
creecent joins Caerau-road and extending thence

south-westward along the middle of the .last-
mentioned road for a distance of four and a half
chains or thereabouts to its junction with Spencer-
road upon the boundary which divides the said
parish of Saint Woolou (Newport) from the
district of Saint John the Baptist Newport afore-
said.

"THE SECOND SCHEDULE.
"The territory to be dissevered from the said

new parish of Saint Mark Newport and to be
restored to the parish of Saint Woolos (Newport)
aforesaid being :—

"All that portion of the said new parish of
Saint Mark, Newport, which is bounded upon the .
south upon the east and upon the north by the
parish of Saint Woolos (Newport) aforesaid and
upon the remaining side that is to say upon the
west, by an imaginary line commencing upon the.
boundary which divides the said parish of Saint
Woolos (Newport) from the new parish of Saint
Mark, Newport aforesaid at a point at the eastern
end of the bridge over the line of the South Wales
division of the Great Western Railway which
bridge connects Clytha Park-road with Bridge-,
street the said point being opposite to the northern
end of the footway or roadway leading to the road
called or known as Albert-terrace and extending
thence southward for a distance of ten and a half
chains or thereabouts to and along the middle of
the said footway or roadway and along the middle
of the road called or known as Albert-terrace as.
aforesaid to the junction of the last-named road
with the road called, or known as Clyffard-crescent
aforesaid upon the boundary which divides the said
new-parish of Saint Mark Newport from the
.parish of Saint Woolos (Newport) aforesaid."

And whereas drafts of the said scheme or
representation have. been transmitted to the
patrons and to the incumbents of the cures.
affected by the arrangements which are contem-
plated by such scheme or representation and such
patrons and incumbents have respectively signified
their assent thereto.

And whereas the said scheme or representation
has been approved by Her Majesty in Council:
now, therefore, Her Majesty, by and with the
advice of Her said Council, is pleased hereby to
ratify the said scheme or representation, and to
order and direct that the same and every part
thereof shall be effectual in law immediately from
.and after^the time when this Order shall have
been duly published in the London Gazette pur-
suant to the said Acts ; and Her Majesty, by and
with the like advice, is pleased hereby to direct
that this Order be forthwith registered by the
Registrar of the said diocese of Llandaff.

A. W. FitzBoy.

AT the Court at Windsor, the 29th day of
November, 1898.

PRESENT,
The QUEEN's Most Excellent Majesty in Council/

HEREAS the Right Honourable Sir
Matthew White Ridley, Baronet, one of

Her Majesty's Principal Secretaries of State, after
giving to the Incumbents and the Churchwardens'
of the parishes hereinafter mentioned ten days'
previous notice of his intention to make such
representation, has, under the provisions of an Act
passed in the Session of Parliament held in the
sixteenth and seventeenth years of Her Majesty's
reign, intituled "An Act to amend the laws
" concerning the burial of the dead in England
" beyond the limits of the Metropolis, and t
"amend the Act concerning the burial of th


