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described should be constituted a separate district
in the manner which is hereinafter set forth.

" And whereas there is not at present within
the limits of the said proposed district any
consecrated church or chapel in use for the
purposes of Divine worship.

" And whereas we are satisfied that an
adequate and permanent maintenance for the
support of the Minister of the said proposed
district and when the said district shall have
become a new parish then for the support of the
Incumbent thereof will ba secured as irom the
date of the licensing or appointment of such
Minister or Incumbent by the payment of a sum
of not less than one hundred and fifty pounds
which will be annually provided out of the
moneys received by us the said Ecclesiastical
Commissioners under the provisions of the
Parish of Manchester Division Act. 1850.

" Now therefore with the consent of the
Right Reverend Edmund Arbuthnott, Bishop of
the said diocese of Manchester (in testimony
whereof he has signed and sealed this scheme),
we, the said Ecclesiastical Commissioners, humbly
recommend and propose that all that part of the
said parish of All Saints, Newton, which is more
particularly described in the schedule hereunder
written, and is delineated and set forth on the
map or plan hereunto annexed, shall upon and
from the day of the date of the publication in the
London Gazette of any Order of Your Majesty in
Council ratifying this scheme become and be
constituted a separate district for spiritual
purposes and that the same shall be named ' The
District of Saint Wilfrid, Newton Heath."

" And we further recommend and propose that
nothing herein contained shall prevent us from
recommending and proposing any other measures
relating to the matters aforesaid or any of them
in accordance with the provisions of the said
Acts or of any of them or of any other Act of
Parliament

" The SCHEDULE to which the foregoing
Scheme has reference.

11 The District of Saint Wilfrid, Newton Heath,
being all that part of the parish (sometime
district) of All Saints, Newton, within the original
limits of the parish of Manchester, in the county of
Lancaster, and in the diocese of Manchester,
which is bounded upon the west partly by the
parish of Saint Anne, Newton Heath, and partly
by the parish of Saint Augustine, Newton Heath,
upon the north by the parish of Saint Mary,
Moston, upon the east by the district of the Holy
Trinity, Failsworth, all in the said county and
diocese, and upon the remaining side, that is to
say, upon the south, by an imaginary line com-
mencing at the point where the boundary which
divides the said district of the Holy Trinity,
Failsworth, from the said parish of All Saints,
Newton, crosses the middle of the Rochdale Canal,
and extending thence south-westward along the
middle of the Rochdale Canal for a distance of
sixty-five chains or thereabouts to the boundary
which divides the said parish of All Saints,
Newton, from the said parish of Saint Anue,
Newton Heath."

And whereas drafts of the said scheme have,
in accordance with the provisions of the firstly
hereinbefore mentioned Act, been transmitted to
the patrons and to the Incumbent of the parish
out of which it is intended that the district
recommended in such scheme to be constituted
shall be taken, and such patrons and Incumbent
have respectively signified their assent to such
scheme.

And whereas the said scheme has been
approved at the Council held under the authority
of the said Commission : Now therefore The
Lord Chancellor, The Prime Minister, and The

Lord President being authorized in that behalf
by writing under His Majesty's Sigu Manual, do
hereby, by and with the advice of His Majesty's
Privy Council, on his Majesty's behalf, ratify the
said scheme, and order and direct that the same
and every part thereof shall be effectual in law
immediately from and after the time when this
Order shall have been duly published in the
London Gazette pursuant to the said Acts ; and
further, on his Majesty's behalf, by and with the
like advice, do hereby direct that this Order be
forthwith registered by the Registrar of the said
diocese of Manchester.

A. W. FitzBoy.

At the Court at St James's, the 4th day of
•April, 1906.

PRESENT,
LORD CHANCELLOR.

PRIME MINISTER. LORD PRESIDENT.
Lord Privy Seal.
Earl Carringtou.
Mr. Sinclair.

WHEREAS His Majesty was pleased, by His
Commission dated the second day of

March, one thousand nine hundred and six, to
nominate and appoint the Lord High Chancellor
of Great Britain, the Prime Minister, and the
Lord President of the Council, in His Majesty's
absence from His Realm in Foreign Parts, to
hold, on His Majesty's behalf, His Privy Council,
and to signify thereat His approval of any.
matter or thing whereunto they should be so
authorized by writing under His Majesty's Sign
Manual, and to do further on His behalf any
matter or thing for the purposes of the said Com-
mission whereunto they should be authorized in
manner aforesaid.

And whereas the Ecclesiastical Commissioners
for England have in pursuance of the Act
of the seventh and eighth years of Her late
Majesty Queen Victoria, chapter ninety-four, of
the Act of the thirteenth and fourteenth years of
Her said late Majesty, chapter ninety-four, and of
the Act of the thirty-second and thirty-third years
of Her said late Majesty, chapter ninety-four, duly
prepared and laid before His Majesty in Council
a scheme or representation bearing date the
first day of March, in the year one thousand
nine hundred and six, in the words following, that
is to say:—

" We, the Ecclesiastical Commissioners for
England; acting under the provisions of the Act
of the seventh and eighth years of Her late
Majesty Queen Victoria, chapter ninety-four, the
Act of the thirteenth and fourteenth years of Her
said late Majesty, chapter ninety-four, and the
Act of the thirty-second and thirty-third years of
Her said late Majesty, chapter ninety-four, have
prepared and now humbly lay before Your.
Majesty in Council. the following scheme or
representation for altering the boundaries of the
new parish of Christ Church, Herne Bay, hi the.
county of Kent and in the diocese of Canterbury.

" Whereas by the authority of an instrument
bearing date the twelfth day of January, in the
year one thousand eight hundred and forty-one,
a particular district was assigned to the conse-
crated church called Christ Church, Herne Bay,.
situate in the parish of Herne, in the said county
and diocese, and such particular district was
known as ' The Particular District of Christ
Church, Herne Bay.'

" And whereas by the authority of an instru-
ment bearing date the second day of November,
in the year one thousand nine hundred and five,
and being under our common seal and under the
hand and seal of the Right Honourable and
Most Reverend .Randall Thomas, Archbishop of


