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GOD save the KING.

At the Court at -Saint James's; the 7fch day of
May, 1910. - • "•

' . . . , ' • ' : . ' PRESENT,; .
The KING'S Most Excellent Majesty;in Council.

HIS Majesty being this day present in Council
was pleased to' mak^ the following

Declaration:—

" My Lords and Gentlemen-.- • • !

. .My "heart is too full for Me to address you
to-day in more than a few words. It is My
sorrowful duty to announce to you the death of
My dearly loved Father the King. In this
irreparable loss which has so suddenly fallen
upon Me and upon the whole Empire, I am
comforted by the feeling that I have the
sympathy of My future subjects, who will
mourn with Me for their beloved Sovereign,
whose own happiness was found in sharing and
promoting theirs. I have lost not only a
Father's love, but the affectionate and intimate
relations of a dear friend and adviser. No less
confident am I in the universal loving sympathy
which is assured to My dearest Mother in her
overwhelming grief.

Standing here a little more than nine years
ago, Our 'beloved King declared that as long as
there was breath in his body He would work for
the good and amelioration of His People. I am
sure that the opinion of the whole Nation will be
that this declaration has been fully carried out.

To endeavour to follow in His footsteps, and
at the same time to uphold the constitutional
government of these Realms, will be the earnest
object of My life. I am deeply sensible of the
very heavy responsibilities which have fallen
upon Me. I know that I can rely upon Parlia-
ment and upon the People of these Islands and of
My Dominions beyond the Seas for their help in
the discharge of these arduous duties, and for
their prayers that God will gjant Me strength
and guidance. I am encouraged by the know-
ledge that I have in My dear wife one who will
be a constant helpmate in every endeavour for
our people's .good;". •:' . •.. . , : : - , . - • • • .

Whereupon the Lords of the Council made it
their humble request to His Majesty-that His
Majesty's Most Gracious Declaration to Their
Lordships might be made public, which His
Majesty was pleased to Order accordingly.'

Almeric FiteRoy,
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