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TUESDAY, 5 MARCH, 1912.

Lord Chamberlain's Office,
St. James's Palace, S.W.,

March 5, 1912.
The KING has been pleased, on the nomina-

tion of Lord Colebrooke, the Captain, to
appoint Brigadier General Bertram Reveley
Mitford, C.B., D.S.O., to be one of His
Majesty's Body Guard of the Honourable
Corps of Gentlemen-at-Arms, in the room of
Lieutenant-Colonel William Angel Scott,
promoted.

At the Court at Buckingham Palace, the
29th day of February, 1912.

PRESENT,
The KING'S Most Excellent Majesty in Council.

WHEREAS the Ecclesiastical Commis-
sioners for England have, in pursuance

of the Act of the fifty-ninth year of His late
Majesty King George "the Third, chapter one
hundred and thirty-four; of the Act of the
second and third years of Her late Majesty
Queen Victoria, chapter forty-nine; of the Act
•of the eleventlh and twelfth years of Her said
late Majesty, chapter thirty-seven; and of the
Act of the nineteenth and twentieth years of
Her said late Majesty, chapter fifty-five, duly
prepared and laid before His Majesty in

Council a representation, bearing date the
fourteenth day of December, in the year one
thousand nine hundred and eleven, in the
words and figures following, that is to say: —

" We, the Ecclesiastical Commissioners for
England, in pursuance of the Act of the fifty-
ninth year of His late Majesty King George the
Third, chapter one hundred and thirty-four;
of 'the Act of the second and third years of
Her late Majesty Queen Victoria, chapter
forty-nine; of the Act of the eleventh and
twelfth years of Her said late Majesty, chapter
thirty-seven; and of the Act of the nineteenth
and twentieth years of Her said late Majesty,
chapter fifty-five, have prepared, and now
humbly lay before Your Majesty in Council,
the following representation as to the assign-
ment of a district chapelry to the consecrated
church of Saint Barnabas, York, situate in the
new parish (sometime particular district) of
Saint Paul, York, in the county of York and
in the diocese of York.

" Whereas it appears to us to be expedient
that a district chapelry should be assigned to
the said church of Saint Barnabas, York,
situate as aforesaid.

" Now, therefore, with the consent of the
Right Honourable and Most Reverend Cosmo
Gordon, Archbishop of York (testified by his
having signed and sealed this representation),
we, the said Ecclesiastical Commissioners,
humbly represent that it would, in our opinion,


