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fifteenth years of her said late Majesty, chapter
.. nineby-s&ven, and of the Act of the nineteenth
-and-twentieth ye'ars of Hertt$aid lafe Majesty,
-chapter ^fifty-five, duly prepared and .jl_aid
- before Hisi Majesty in Council a Representa-
: tion, bearing date the sixteenth day of January
-in the year one thousand nine hundred and
thirteen, in the words and figures following,
thatl is to say: —

" We, the Ecclesiastical Commissioners for
England, in pursuance of the Act of the eighth
and ninth years of Her late Majesty Queen
Victoria, chapter seventy, of the Act of the
fourteenth and fifteenth years of Her said late
Majesty, chapter ninety-seven, and of the Act
of the nineteenth and twentieth years of Her
said late Majesty, chapter fifty-five, have pre-
pared, and now humbly lay before Your
Majesty in Council, the following representa-
tion as to the assignment of a consolidated
chapelry to the consecrated church of Saint
Margaret, Thornbury, situate within the new
parish (sometime district chapelry) of Saint
Mary, Laister Dyke, in the county of York, and
in the diocese of Bipon.

" Whereas at certain extremities of the said
new parish of Saint Mary, Laister Dyke, and
of the parish of Calverley, in the said county
and diocese, which said extremities lie con-
tiguous one to another, and are described in
the Schedule hereunder written, there is col-
lected together a population which is situate
at a distance from the several churches of such
new parish and parish.

'' And whereas it appears to us to be expe-
dient that certain contiguous portions (being
the portions containing the population afore-
said) of the said new parish of Saint Mary,
Laister Dyke, and of the said parish of C'alyer-
ley, should be formed into a consolidated
chapelry for all ecclesiastical purposes, and that
the same should be assigned to the said church
of Saint Margaret, Thbrnbury, situate as
aforesaid.

" Now, therefore, with the consent of the
Right Reverend Thomas Wortley, Bishop of
Ripon, as such Bishop, and also as the patron,
in right of his See, of the 'vicarage of the said
parish of Calverley, and with the consents of
the Reverend Ernest Augustus Eardley-
Wilmot, of Saint Jude's Vicarage, South
Kensington, S.W., Clerk in -Holy Orders
and a Prebendary' of the Cathedral
Church of Wells, of the Reverend Robert
Baker Girdlestone, of Saxholme, Wimble-
don, in the county of Surrey, Clerk in
Holy Orders and an Honorary Canon
of the Cathedral Church of Christ, in Oxford,
of the Reverend Arthur Evelyn Barnes-Law-
rence, of Number 6, Church Terrace, Black-
heath, in the county of Kent, Clerk in Holy
Orders and an Honorary Canon of the Cathe-
dral Church of Southwark, of the Reverend
Edward Alexander Stuart, of The Precincts,
Canterbury, in the said county of Kent, Clerk
in Holy Orders and a Canon of the Cathedral
and Metropolitical Church of Christ, in Can-
terbury, and of the Right Reverend James
Denton, Bishop of Sodor and Man, as the
patrons of the vicarage of the said new parish
of Saint Mary, Laister Dyke (in testimony
whereof they, the said consenting parties, have
respectively signed and sealed this Represen-
tation), We, the said Ecclesiastical Commis-

sioners for England, humbly represent that 't
would, in our opinion, be expedient :that idl
those! c'oniaguous portions of jthe - said^-new

^parish of Saint - Mary, -Laister/Dyke, arid-of
the said parish of Calverley, which are de-
scribed in the Schedule hereunder written, all
which portions', together with the boundaries
thereof, are delineated and set forth on the
map or plan hereunto annexed, should be-
united and formed into one consolidated
chapelry for the said Church of Saint Mar-
garet, Thornbury, situate as aforesaid, and
that the same should be named ' The Consoli-
dated Chapelry of Saint Margaret, Thorn-
bury.'

" We therefore humbly pray that Your
Majesty will be graciously pleased to take the
premises into Your Royal consideration, and
to make such order in respect thereto as to
Your Majesty in Your Royal Wisdom shall
seem meet.

" The SCHEDULE to which the foregoing
representation has reference: -—

" The Consolidated Chapelry of Saint Mar-
garet, Thornbury, comprising—

" All those contiguous portions of the ne»v
parish (sometime district chapelry) of Saint
Mary, Laister Dyke, and of the parish of Cal-
verley, both in the county of York and in the
diocese of Ripon, which, taken together, are
bounded upon' the" north-west partly by the
new parish of "Saint John the Evangelist,
Greengates, and partly by the new parish of
Saint Luke," Eccles'hill, upon the west partly
by the new parish of" Saint Augustine, Under-
cliffe, Bradford, and partly by the new parish
of Saint! Clement, Bradford, all in the said
county and diocese, and upon the remaining
sides, that is to say, upon the south-west, upon
the south-east, and upon the east, by an
imaginary line commencing upon the boun-
dary which divides the said new parish of
Saint Clement, Bradford, from the said new
parish of Saint Mary, Laister Dyke, at the
junction of Killinghall- Road with Thornbury
Road,, and extending thence south-eastward
along the middle of Thornbury Road for a
distance of twenty chains or thereabouts to its
junction with Leeds Road, and extending
thence north-eastward along the middle of
Leeds Road for a distance of ten yards or
thereabouts to its junction with Thornbury
Street, and extending thence south-eastward
along the middle of Thornbury Street for .1
distance of eight chains or thereabouts to its
junction with Derby Road, and with the foot-
path leading into New Lane near its junction
with Dick Lane, and extending thence south-
eastward along the middle of such footpath for
a distance of ten chains or thereabouts to its
junction with New Lane, and extending
thence north-eastward along the middle of
New Lane for a distance of two chains or
thereabouts to its junction with Dick Lane.,
and extending thence south-westward along
the middle of Dick Lane for a distance of two
chains or thereabouts to the centre of the
bridge which carries such lane across the
Leeds, Bradford and Halifax Line of the
Great Northern Railway, and extending
thence north-eastward along the middle of
such line of railway for a distance of eighteen
chains and a half or thereabouts to the centre


