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names of the persons' who had been nominated
to us by the said contributors towards the cost
of providing a permanent church^ within and
for the said district as the persons to whom they
desired the whole right of patronage of the
same district to be assigned.

" And whereas the assignment of patronage
made by the said Order in Council should in
these circumstances have been recommended to
be made and should have been made to the
other five Patronage.- Trustees of the Church
Pastoral Aid Society only, that is to say, to the
said John Henry Buxton, Edward Hildred
Carlile, Edward Grose Hodge, Robert Charles
Joynt, and Hanmer William Webb Peploe.

" Now therefore, with the consent of the
Right Reverend Edmund Arbuthnotfc, Bishop
of Manchester, and with the consent of the said
John Henry Buxton, Edward Hildred Carlile,
Edward Grose Hodge, Robert Charles Joynt,
Hanmer William Webb Peploe, and Granville
Ronald Francis Smith (in testimony whereof
they, the said consenting parties, have respec-
tively signed and sealed this scheme), we,
the said Ecclesiastical Commissioners, humbly
recommend and propose that the whole right
of patronage of the said district of Saint
Jerome, Ardwick, and when such district shall
have become a new parish then of such new
parish, and the nomination of the Minister or
Incumbent thereof shall without any assurance
in the law other than this scheme and any
duly gazetted Orden of Your Majesty ratifying
the same and upon and from the date of the
publication of such Order in the London
Gazette be assigned to and be absolutely vested
in and shall and may be exercised by the said
John Henry Buxton, Edward Hildred Carlile,
Edward Grose Hodge, Robert Charles Joynt,
and Hanmer William Webb .Peploe, their
heirs and assigns for ever.

"And we further recommend and propose
that nothing herein contained shall prevent us
from recommending and proposing any other
measures relating to the matters aforesaid or
any of them in accordance with the provisions
of the said Act or of any other Act of Parlia-
ment."

And whereas the said scheme has been
approved by His Majesty in Council:

Now therefore, His Majesty, by and with
the advice of His said Council, is pleased
hereby to ratify the said Scheme, and to order
and direct that the same and every part thereof
shall be effectual in law immediately from and
after the time when this Order shall have been
duly published in the London Gazette pursuant
to the said Act. And His Majesty, by and
with the like advice, is pleased hereby to direct
that this Order be forthwith registered by the
Registrar of the said Diocese of Manchester.

Aim f tic FitzRoy.

At the Court at Buckingham Palace, the
19th day of December, 1913.

PRESENT,
The KING's Most Excellent Majesty in Council.

WHEREAS the Ecclesiastical Commis-
sioners for England have in pursuance

of the Act of the seventh and eighth years of
Her late Majesty Queen Victoria, chapter
ninety-four; of the Act of the thirteenth and
fourteenth years of Her said late Majesty,
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chapter ninety-four; and of the Act of the
thirty-second and thirty-third years of Her
said late Majesty, chapter ninety-four, duly
prepared and laid before His Majesty in
Council a Scheme or Representation, bearing
date the sixth day of November, in the year
one thousand nine hundred and thirteen, in the
words and figures following, that is to say: —

"We, the Ecclesiastical Commissioners for
England, acting under the provisions of the
Act of the seventh and eighth years of Her late
Majesty Queen Victoria, chapter ninety-four,
the Act of the thirteenth and fourteenth years,
of Her said late Majesty, chapter ninety-four,
and the Act of the thirty-second and thirty-
third years of Her said late Majesty, chapter
ninety-four, have prepared and now humbly lay
before Your Majesty in Council the following
Scheme or Kepresentation for altering the
boundaries of the new parish of the Holy
Trinity, Eltham, in the county of Kent arid in
the diocese of Southwark.

" Whereas by the authority of an instrument
bearing date the eighteenth day of November,
in the year one thousand eight hundred and
sixty-nine, and being under our common seal
and under the hand and seal of the Right
Reverend Thomas Legh, then Bishop of
Rochester, a certain part of the parish of
Eltham, in the said county of Kent, and at that
time in the diocese of Rochester, but now in
the said diocese of Southwark, was assigned as
a particular district to the consecrated Church
of the Holy Trinity, situate in the said parish
of Eltham, and such particular district was
called ' The Particular District of the Holy
Trinity, Eltham.'

" And whereas the said particular district o'f
the Holy Trinity, Eltham, has under the pro-
visions of the Act of the nineteenth and.
twentieth years of Her said late Majesty,
chapter one hundred and four, become a new
parish of the character contemplated by that
Act, by the Act of the sixth and seventh years
of Her said late Majesty, chapter thirty-seven
and by the above-mentioned Act of the thirty-
second and thirty-third years of Her said late
Majesty, chapter ninety-four.

" And whereas it has been represented to us,
and it appears to us to be expedient, that the
boundaries of the said new parish of the Holy
Trinity, Eltham, should be altered in the
manner which is hereinafter mentioned.

" Now, therefore, with the consent of the
Right Reverend Hubert Murray, • Bishop of
Southwark (in testimony whereof he has
signed and sealed this Scheme or Representa-
tion), we, the said. Ecclesiastical Commis-
sioners, humbly represent, recommend and
propose that from and after the day of the date
of the publication in the London Gazette of any
Order of Your Majesty in Council ratifying
this Scheme or Representation and without any
assurance in the law other than such duly
gazetted Order the boundaries of the said new
parish of the Holy Trinity, Eltham, shall be
altered so that all that portion of the said
parish of Eltham which is described in the
Schedule hereunder written and is delineated
and- set forth upon the map or plan hereunto
annexed and is thereon coloured pink, shall be
dissevered from such parish and shall be
annexed to and shall in future form part of
the said new parish of the Holv Trinitv*
Eltham.


