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FRIDAY, 27 FEBRUARY, 1914.

White/tall, February 26, 1914.
The KING has been pleased by Letters

Patent under the Great Seal of the United
Kingdom of Great Britain and Ireland, bear-
ing date the 18th instant, to appoint) the
Reverend John Edwin Watts-Ditchfield, D.D.,
Vicar of St. James-the-Less, Bethnal Green, to
the newly-founded Bishopric of Chelmsford.

Whitehall, February 26, 1914.
Thfe KING has been pleased by Letters

Patent under the Great Seal of the United
Kingdom of Great Britain and Ireland, bear-
ing date the 18th instant, to appoint the
Venerable Henry Bernard Hodgson, M.A.,
Archdeacon of Lindisfarne and Vicar of Ber-
wick-on-Tweed, to the newly-founded Bishopric
of St. Edmundsbury and Ipswich.

WILD BIRD (ENGLAND).

The Wild Birds Protection (County Borough
of Stockport) Order, 1914.

Dated 25th February, 1914.

In pursuance of the powers conferred on me
by the Wild Birds Protection Acts, 1880 to

1908, and upon application by the Council of
the County Borough of Stockport, I hereby
make the following Order: —

Title.

I. This Order may be cited as " The Wild
Birds Protection (County Borough of Stock-
port) Order, 1914."

BIRDS.

Close Time extended.

II. The time during which the killing or
taking of Wild Birds or any of them is pro-
hibited by the Act of 1880, shall be extended,
throughout the County Borough of Stockport,
so as to be between the 1st day of March and
the 13th day of August in any year.

Additions to the Schedule of the Act of 1880.

III. The Wild Birds Protection Act, 1880,
shall apply within the County Borough of
Stockport to the following species of Wild
Birds in the same manner as if those species
were included in the Schedule to the Act:—

Common Bunting, Reed Bunting, Chiffchaff,
Spotted Flycatcher, Heron, Kestrel, House
Martin, Sand Martin, Meadow Pipit (Tit-


