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TUESDAY, 17 OCTOBER, 1916.

Crown Office,
16th October, 1916.

%

MEMBEK returned to serve in the present
PARLIAMENT.

Tarliamenfary Borough of St. Pancras, West
Division.

Captain Richard Whieldon Barnett, in the
place of Captain Felix Cassel, K.C., who
has accepted the Office of Steward or Bailiff
of the Three Chiltern Hundreds of Stoke,
Deehorough and Burnham, in the county of
Buckingham.

Crown Office,
IQth October, 1916.

The KING- has been pleased, by Letters
Patent under the Great Seal, dated the 12th
day of October, 1916, to grant to Sir Thomas
Edward Scrutton, Knight, one of the Jus-
tices of the High Court of Justice, the Office
of one of the Lords Justices of Appeal.

Crown Office,
IQth October, 1916.

The KING has been pleased, by Lettera
Patent under the Great Seal, dated the 12th
day of October, 1916, to grant to Henry Alfred
McCardie, Esquire, the Office of one of the
Justices of His Majesty's High Court of
Justice.

Foreign Office (Foreign Trade Dept.),
October 17, 1916.

The following additions or corrections to the
lists published as a supplement to the London1

Gazette of 14th August, 1916, of persons; to
whom articles to be exported to China and
Siam may be consigned, are notified by order
of the Secretary of State for Foreign Affairs,
in accordance with tihe provisions of the Pro»
clamation relating to the exportation of


