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forward observing officer to his battery.
Accompanied by a signaller, he laid a line
across 300 yards of open ground under heavy
fire. He established communication and
maintained it throughout the day.

Temp. Lt. (temp. C'apt.) John Archibald
Cahill, R. Berks. R.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to
duty. He took command of his company and
successfully repelled a strong enemy counter-
attack. He set a magnificent example to his
men.

2nd Lt. Edmund Barry Cahusac, S. Staff.
R., Spec. Res., .attd. R.F.C.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to
duty. He carried out a successful artillery
observation on a hostile battery in very
adverse weather. He worked for two and a
half hours at a height of 1,500 to 3,000 feet
under very heavy fire. On another occasion,
whilst engaged on photography, he drove off
three hostile scouts and completed his work.

Lt. (actg. Capt.) Edward Conder, Glouc. R.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to

duty. He, without a guide, led his men to
their positions, and carried out a most suc-
cessful .attack on the enemy's trenches. He
set a splendid example of courage and
initiative.

2nd Lt. Gordon Ernest Cronk, S. Staff. R.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to

duty during a night attack on the enemy's
trenches. He directed the organisation and
despatch of bombing parties in the enemy's
trenches, and personally obtained touch with
the company on his right. He set a splendid
example to his men.

2nd Lt. (temp. Lt.) Edwin Darling, R.F. A.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to

duty. He carried out a dangerous recon-
naissance under very difficult conditions, and
obtained most valuable information. He
set a fine example of courage and determina-
tion.

2nd Lt. Robert Lenard Derry, E. Lan. R.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to

duty. He rendered most valuable assistance
to his Company Commander in posting and
reorganising the company. He brought in
several wounded men under heavy fire, and,
although himself wounded, refused to leave
his post.

* 2nd Lt. Eric Raymond Sandars Dods,
Ind. Army.

For conspicuous gallantry and ability in
leading his company across the open for 350
yards in the face of heavy fire. He showed
great coolness and determination in the
assault, and subsequently consolidated the
position with a small party under difficult
conditions.

Temp. Lt. Thomas Hugh Evans, R. Fus.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to

duty when in charge of a carrying party. As
a result of his organisation, ammunition
dumps were formed in the enemy lines within
one hour after the commencement of the
attack.

*2nd Lt. Thomas Innee Farrar, Devon. R.
For conspisuous gallantry and devotion to

duty. Although wounded in two places, he>
remained on duty and took his guns up to*
the captured trench, where he behaved witb>
the utmost gallantry, although he was again-
wounded in the hand.

Lt. Ralph Eric Friend, R.F.A.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to*

duty. He commanded the advanced section,
of his battery, which was 450 yards from the-
enemy front line, and, though exposed to>-
continuous and accurate fire, rendered great
assistance to our attack throughout the day.-

2nd Lt. (temp. Lt.) John Gibson Gargate,-
Durh. L.I., attd. Notts. & Derby. R.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion io
duty. He brought up a gun, and by his fire
considerably relieved a critical situation. Ort-
another occasion he was largely responsible*
for repelling a strong enemy bombing attack.,

Capt. Douglas Reginald Gawler, R. Scotl-
and R.F.C.

For consistent good work whilst carrying:
out artillery observation and for gallantry"
on many occasions. On one occasion he con-
tinued his observation work in spite of being:
attacked by several hostile machines and in*
spite of being under very heavy fire.

Temp. Lt. (actg. Capt.) William John Green,-
R. Berks. R.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to-
duty. He led his company with great dashn
into the enemy trench, inflicted many
casualties on the enemy, and personally
supervised the pushing forward of piquets*
500 yards ahead. He set a fine example to-
his men.

Lt. (temp. Capt.) Graham Hamilton Green-
well, Oxf. & Bucks. L.I.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to
duty. He kept his men well in hand when-
suddenly caught in a hostile barrage, and,
later, carried out the original plan with com-
plete success. He set a magnificent example*
to his men.

2nd Lt. Robert Hamilton, High. Cyclist Bn. „
attd. R.F.C.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to--'
duty as an observer. He carried out a suc-
cessful artillery observation on a hostile-
battery in very adverse weather. He worked""
for two and a half hours at a height of 1,500*
to 3,000 feet under very heavy fire. Orr
another occasion, whilst, engaged in photo-
graphy, he drove off three hostile scouts ano?.
completed his work.

2nd Lt. Claude Dennis Hampshire, R. Berks..
R.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to*
duty when in command of a raiding party.
He led his men with great dash, and cap-
tured several prisoners. The success of the-
raid was largely due to his good leading an of
the fearless example he set to all ranks of"
his command.

Captain Arthur Alan Hanbury Hanbury -
Sparrow, D.S.O., R. Berks. R.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to?

MILITABY CBOSS.


