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bravery in carrying in two wounded 'men
under heavy hostile shelling. He displayed
the utmost disregard for danger throughout
in carrying out his duties.

Temp. 2nd Lt. John Miller, High. L.I.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to

•duty. As intelligence officer, and after
being wounded in the leg, he made his way
through the barrage to the front, and re-
turned with valuable information. He con-
tinued his work until forced to withdraw.

2nd Lt. Neville Miller, R. War. R., Spec.
Ues.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to
duty. He reached the second objective, and
though badly wounded extricated his men
from a most dangerous position. He re-
mained, with his men for twelve hours until
brought in.

Lt. Robert Miller, Sco. Rif., Spec. Res.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to

duty. He led his men with great skill and
.showed a fin© example of courage under
.shell fire. He continually sent back useful
reports and succeeded in capturing four
field howitzers and several prisoners.

Capt. Stephen Douglas Mills, Bedf. R.
For conspicuous gallantry in action, when

he led his company with great bravery, con-
tinually encouraging and reorganising his
men, and although wounded he continued
in control until he had driven back a heavy
•counter-attack.

2nd Lt. Ian Byers Moir, Sea. Highrs.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to

duty. He was wounded early in the ad-
vance, but continued to lead his men with
great gallantry and dash. His action
throughout showed great coolness and reso-
lution.

•2nd Lt. Walter Moody, R.G.A., Spec. Res.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to

duty. As forward observation officer he
.succeeded, under great difficulties, in estab-
lishing communication with his battery and
sending back valuable information. He re-
peatedly went backwards and forwards
"through the heavy hostile barrage in- his
•efforts to maintain communication.

Temp. Lt. Bernard Joseph Moore, R.F.A.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to

•duty. On his own initiative he left his
observation post and went forward under
heavy machine-gun fire to obtain informa-
tion from an infantry brigade when the
situation had become obscure and critical.
His report was early and accurate, and of
very great assistance in meeting the situation.

2nd Lt. Charles Gwyn Noel Morgan, R.W.
3?us., Spec. Res.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to
duty whilst in charge of^a working party in
front of our positions. Though subjected to

severe rifle, machine gun, and grenade fire
he continued to work until his task was suc-
cessfully accomplished, setting the finest ex-
ample of personal gallantry and coolness
under the worst conditions.

Temp. 2nd Lt. Frederick Ernest Morgan,
S. Wales Bord.

For conspicuous gallantry and ability.
When his company commander was killed
he led the assault which captured the enemy
trench. Later, he organised parties to bring
in- the wounded. His conduct throughout
exhibited great bravery and judgment.

Lt. (temp. Capt.) Harold Newbery Morgan,
R. Lan. R.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to
duty. During the advance the situation
became most obscure. He went forward
over exposed, ground under heavy barrage
and reconnoitred the whole area, and suc-
ceeded in bringing back most important and
valuable information.

2nd Lt. Lewis Langharne Morgan, Welsh
R., attd. R.F.C.

For conspicuous gallantry arid devotion to
duty. He crossed the lines at a height of
under 100 feet, and destroyed a hostile kite
balloon. Previously he attacked a hostile
scout at close range and brought it down in
flames. He has shown great gallantry in
many combats.

R.
Temp. 2nd Lt. Harold Lisle Morley, E. Kent

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to
duty. After his comJpany had reached their
objective he led a bombing attack to his
flank against two enemy machine guns. His
prompt action resulted in the destruction of
the machine gun and the taking of forty
prisoners.

Temp. 2nd Lt. Arthur Augustus Morris,
North'd Fus.

For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to
duty. He patrolled for several hundred
yards beyond the final objective, and sent
back most valuable information. This
patrol was carried out under heavy artillery
barrage.

Temp. 2nd Lt. Edwin Walter Morrison, D.
of Corn. L.I.

For conspicuous gallantry in an attack
when he led his platoon with the greatest
courage although twice wounded. Eventu-
ally he retired after being wounded eight
times, but was anxious to return after his
wounds had been dressed.

2nd Lt. Edgar Alan Mortleman, R.F.A.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion.

At great personal risk he extinguished a fire
in an ammunition dump, thereby saving
much loss of life and material. Later, he dug
out buried mea until overcome by gas
fumes.

2nd Lt. William Albert Murley, R.G.A.
For conspicuous gallantry and devotion to

duty. When acting as observation officer he
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