
3014 THE LONDON GAZETTE, 4 MARCH, 1919.

. wion Fund and may add to it a sum de-
"clucted from the Tuition Fund, such de-
duction not to •exceed .£10' per centum
in any 'year. The proceeds of any Advow-
sons. which, may be sold by the College
and any property which the President and Fel-
lows hold in trust for the purchase of advow-
soiis may, if the President and Fellows think
fit, be added to the capital of this Fund. The
capital shall be invested from time to time in
any securities in v/hich Trust Funds may
legally be invested. The income of the Fund,
including the sums paid to it yearly from the
corporate revenues and from the Tuition F:und,
shall be applicable tK> the payment of pen-
sion ; No' pension shall be payable O'Ut of the
capital of the Fund; and any pension of an
earlier date &hall be payable1 in priority to any
pension of a later date." Atad in 'Clause 3 of
the same Statute:—" The President and Fel-
lows may also if they think fit, grant to any
person who has served the College as Bursar
for thirty years, or • or a less period if he re-
tires on account of sickness or infirmity, a pen-
sion which shall in no case exceed £200 a
year."

And whereas in Statute XVI, Clause 2, it
is enacted :—" In the year 1908, and in every
succeeding year, the President and Fellows
shall contribute the sum of £600 towards the
emoluments of the Sibthorpian Professor of
Rural Economy, or if they shall elect the said
Professor to an ordinary Fellowship in the Col-
lege, then so long as the Professor shall be a
Fellow of the College, they shall contribute
£400 a year to ithe emoluments of the Profes-
sor, in addition to> the emoluments of his Fel-
lowship."

'' So soon as the amount of the corporate
revenues of the Collage will permit, after satis-
fying the several charges end payments im-
posed or authorised by these Statutes, includ-
ing the augmentation of the number of Open
Scholarships to twelve, the said corporate
revenues shall be further charged with the pay-
ment of an annual sum of £250, which shall
be paid to the University, and shall be applied
to -such purposes connected with the Profes-
soriate, or otherwise with the advancement O'f
learning, science and research within the Uni-
versity as the University with the consent of
the College, may determine."

And whereas it appears to> us the President
and 'Fellows of the said College that it is desir-
able that the said Statutes shall be altered and
amended in manner hereinafter appearing : —

Now We,'the President and Fellows of the
said College, in exercise of the powers vested in
us under and by virtue of the 54th section of
the Universities of Oxford and Cambridge Act,
1877, do, by this present instrument under our
Seal, alter and amend the Statutes of the said
College as hereinbefore set out in manner fol-
lowing, that is to say : —

In. Statute XV, "Clause 1, by adding at the
end of the Clause the words " If and so long as
the income of the Pension Fund shall exceed
£1,500 a year the whole or any part of the
income remaining after payment of the pensions
chargeable upon the fund may be transferred
at tihe discretion of the College to the Tuition
Fund ; but such transference shall only be made
at a stated General Meeting of the College."

In Clause 3 of the same Statute by substitut-
ing for the word " thirty " the word " twenty,"
.and by omitting the words " which shall in no
case exceed £200 a year/" and by substi-

tuting for them the words " payable out of
Corporate revenue which in no case shall exceed
in H mount £10 a year for each year of service."

In Statute XVI, Clause 2, by substituting
for the figures " £600 " the figures " £800,"
and by substituting for the figures " £400 "
the figures " £600," and in the second para-
graph of the same Clause by substituting for the
figures " £250 " the figures " £300," and by
omitting, the remainder of the Clause following
the figures " £250," and by substituting the
words " which shall be paid to the University
towards the stipend of the Professor of
Forestry, or if the Professor shall be a Fellow
of the College, they shall pay £100 to the Uni-
versity towards the stipend of the Professor."

Given under our Common Seal this
thirteenth day of December, 1018.

Board of Green Clrrth,
Buckingham Palfice, 8.W. 1,

1st March, 1919.
• The KING has been pleased to appoint the
Honourable Georg-j' Frederick Stanley,
C.M.G., M.P., to be Comptroller of Mis
Majesty's Household, in the room of Sir
Edwin Cornwall, Bart., M.P., resigned, v,o
date 28th February, 1919.

3rd March, 1919.-
The Prince of Wales has been pleased to

appoint Captain, Lord Claud Hamilton, D'.S.O.,
M.V.O., and Captain The Honourable Piers
Walter ILiegh, to be Equerries-in-Ordinary to
His Royal Highness.

BRITISH NATIONALITY AND .STATUS
OF ALIENS AjCTS, 1914 AND 1918.

In the Matter of Berthold Louis August Jahu.
Revocation of Certificate of Naturalization.
Whereas a Certificate of Naturalization was

-n-antecl in the United Kingdom during blie
present war to Berthold Louis August J-ahii,
who at the date of the grant of the certificate
was the subject of a country which was then at
war with His Majesty,

And whereas tlie question whether it is de-
sirable that the certificate should be revoked
has been referred to the Certificates of
Naturalization (Revocation) Committee, con-
stituted under Section 7 of the British Nation-
ality and Status of Aliens Act, 1914, .and
whereas that question-has been answered by the
Committee in the afniaiiative,

Now, therefore, by this Order made .11
pursuance of sub-section (1) of Section 3 of the
British Nationality and Status of Aliens Act,
1918, I revoke the said certificate and I direct
such' revocation to have effect from the dale
hereof.

Edward Shwtt,
One of His Majesty's Principal

'Secretaries of State.
Whitehall,

2?-rd February, 1919.


