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and in accordance with paragraph (o) of the
said Agreement, the Agreement will con-
sequently cease to operate after the 30th
September, 1922.

In witness whereof the Official Seal of the
Minister of Agriculture and
Fisheries is hereunto affixed this

L. S. » thirtieth day of August, nineteen
hundred and twenty-two.

B. J. Thompson,
Assistant Secretary.

SUPER TAX, 1922-23.

Notice is hereby given, that under the pro-
visions of the Income Tax Acts, it is incum-
bent upon every individual whose ..statutory
income for the year ended the fifth" day of
April, 1922', exceeded two thousand pounds,
to give notice thereof to the Special Commis-
sioners of Income Tax before the 30th day of
September, 1922.

Every such individual, therefore, who hasi
not already given the required notice, or who
has not received a form of return for the year
1922-23 from the Special Commissioners of
Income Tax, should before that date communi-
cate, in writing, with their Clerk at York
House, 23, Bangsway, London, W.C. 2, from
whom the form of return may be obtained.

Dated this 1st day of September, 1922.

F. A. Barrett,
Secretary.

Inland Revenue,
Somerset House,

London.

INCOME TAX.

Whereas it has become necessary to renew
the list of persons to supply vacancies amongst
the Commissioners appointed to act in the divi-
sion of Royston, in the county of Cambridge,
as Commissioners for the general purposes of
the Acts of Parliament relating to Income Tax
and Inhabited House Duties: Now we, two of
the Commissioners of Inland Revenue, in pur-
suance of the powers vested in us in that behalf,
do hereby convene a Meeting of the Land Tax
Commissioners having jurisdiction with regard
to Land Tax within, the division aforesaid,
being respectively qualified to act as such Com-
missioners, to be holden at the Town Hall,
Royston, on Friday, the 6th day of October,
1922, at 10.30 o'clock in the forenoon, for the
purpose of choosing fit and proper persons to
be Commissioners to supply vacancies amongst
the Commissioners for the general purposes of
the aforesaid Acts for the division of Royston
aforesaid.

F. A. Barrett.
C. Gordon. Spry.

Inland Revenue,
Somerset House, London.

29th August, 1922'.

PATENTS AND DESIGNS ACTS, 1907 AND
1919.

Application for Restoration of Lapsed Patent
under Section 20.

Notice is hereby given, that Edward .Schur-
mann has made application for the restoration
of the Patent granted to him for an invention
entitled " Improvements relating to a method
of and means for preventing the formation of
carbon monoxide in cupola furnaces,"
numbered 11073 of 1913, and bearing date the
10th day of May, 1913, which expired on the
10th day of May, 1917, owing to the non-
payment of the prescribed Renewal Fee.

Any person may give notice of Opposition to
the restoration by leaving Patents Form No. 17
at the Patent Office, 25, Southampton Build-
ings, London, W.C. 2, on or before the 30Eh
day of October, 1:922.

W. TEMPLE FRANKS,
Comptroller-General.

PATENTS AND DESIGNS ACTS, 1907 AND
.1919.

Application for Restoration of Lapsed Patent
under Section 20'.

Notice is hereby given, that Ralph Henry
R-osenfeld and Fred Thomas Roberts have
made application, for the restoration of the
Patent granted to them for an invention en-
titled " Improvements in methods and mould-
ing devices for making rubber articles,"
numbered 4623 of 1914, and bearing date the
23rd day of February, 1914, which expired on
the 23rd day of February, 1922, owing; to the
non-payment of the prescribed Renewal Fee.

Any person may give notice of Opposition to
the restoration by leaving Patents Form No. 17
at the Patent 'Office, 25, 'Southampton Build-
ings, London, W.C. 2, on or before the 30th
day of October, 1)922.

W. TEMPLE FRANKS,
Comptroller-General.

8PBOL£L ACTS (EXTENSION OF TIME)
ACT, 1915.

WAR EMERGENCY LAWS (CON-
TINUANCE) ACT, 1920.

BY virtue and in pursuance of the pro-
visions of the above named Acts, the

Minister of Transport hereby orders, that the
period within which the Wilts and Berks Canal
Company are required, by Section 28 of the
Swindon Corporation (Wilts and Berks Canal
Abandonment) Act, 1914, to sell the lands
.acquired by them for the purposes of the Wilts
and Berks Canal, so far as such lands have not
already been sold by the said Company or
otherwise disposed of, under the said Act of
1914, shall be further1 extended for one year
from the gist day of July, 1922.

Dated this 29th day .of August, 1922.

H. H. Piffffott,
An Assistant Secretary,

13* Ministry of Transport. :


