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Order ") under the Electricity (Supply) Acts,
1882 to 1926, for the following purposes (that
is to say) :—

To authorise the transfer (subject to the
approval of the Electricity Commissioners) of
the undertaking authorised by the Exmouth
Electricity Special Order, 1923 (hereinafter re-
ferred to as " the principal Order ") and the
powers of the principal Order to a company
registered or to be registered under the Com-
panies Acts, 1908 to 1928, and to constitute
such company the undertakers for the purposes
of the principal Order.

Printed copies of the draft Order as applied
for and of the Order when made may be
obtained at the Electricity Works, Marpool
Hill, Exmouth, and at the offices of the under-
signed Parliamentary Agents at a price not
exceeding two shillings for each' copy.

Copies of the draft Order have been de-
posited for public inspection at the office of
the Clerk of the Peace for the County of
Devon at The Castle, Exeter, Devon, and at
the office of the Exmouth Urban District
Council at Exmouth, Devon.

And notice is hereby also given that every
local authority, company or person desirous of
bringing before the Electricity Commissioners
any objections respecting the application must
do so by letter sent by registered post
addressed to the Secretary, Electricity Com-
mission, Savoy Court, Strand, London,
W.C. 2, and despatched on or before the 26th
day of March, 1929, and that a copy of any
such objections must at the same time be
forwarded to The Electric Supply Corporation
Limited or to the undersigned.

Dated the 22nd day of February, 1929.

DYSON BELL AND Co., 19, Abingdon
Street, Westminster, S.W. 1, Parlia-

(121) mentary agents.

Electricity Commission.—1929.

WEST HANTS ELECTRICITY
(EXTENSION) (SPECIAL ORDER).

NOTICE is hereby given that West Hamp-
shire Electricity Company Limited

(hereinafter called " the Company") whose
registered office is situate at 25, Victoria
Street, in the City pf Westminster, have
applied to the Electricity Commissioners under
the Electricity (Supply) Acts, 1882 to 1926, for
a Special Order (hereinafter called " the
Order") for all or some of the following
objects (that is to say):—

1. To extend the area of supply under the
West Hants Electricity Special Order, 1928
(hereinafter referred to as " the Order of
1928") and the West Hants Electricity
(Extension) Special Order, 1928, so as to in-
clude therein the rural district of Alresford
and the rural district of Droxford (except the
parish of Hambledon) and the parishes of
Stoke Park, Fair Oak, Owslebury, Morestead,
Avington, Itchen Abbas and Martyr Worthy,
in the rural district of Winchester all in the
County of Southampton, hereinafter referred
to as " the added area."

2. To authorise the Undertakers to generate,
store, distribute, sell and supply electrical

energy for all or any public or private pur-
poses as denned in the said Acts and to exer-
cise all powers usually conferred on distribu-
tors of electricity within the added area.

3. To incorporate with the Order all or some
of the provisions contained in the Schedule to
the Electric Lighting (Clauses) Act, 1899, with
or without modifications and to extend and
make applicable to the added area with or
without modification all or some of the pro-
visions of the Order of 1928.

4. To make provisions as to the price which
may be charged by the Undertakers for elec-
tricity supplied in the added area.

5. To confer upon the Undertakers the powers
or some of the powers contained in the Elec-
tricity (Supply) Acts, 1882 to 1926, and the
enactments incorporated therewith and to alter
vary or extinguish all rights and privileges
which would or might interfere with any of
the objects of the Order, and to confer other
rights and privileges.

6. To authorise the Company to break up in
the added area streets and parts of streets not
repairable by the local authority and railways.

A copy of the draft Order and an Ordnance
Map shewing the proposed added area and the
streets in which it is proposed that electric
lines shall be laid down within a specified time
have been deposited for public inspection at
the offices of the following: —

The Clerk of the Peace for the County of
Southampton, The Castle, Winchester.

The Rural District Council of Alresford,
East Street, Alresford.

The Rural District Council of Droxford,.
The Square, Bishop's Waltham.

The Rural District Council of Winchester,
7. St. Thomas Street, Winchester.

Any authority, company, body or person de-
sirous of bringing before the Electricity Com-
missioners any objection respecting the appli-
cation must do so by letter sent by registered
post addressed to the Secretary, Electricity
Commission, Savoy Court, Strand, London,
W.C. 2, and despatched on or before the 25th
day of March, 1929, and a copy of such objec-
tion must also be forwarded to the under-
mentioned Parliamentary Agents.

Printed copies of the draft Order as applied
for and of the Order when made can be
obtained at the price of two shillings each
from H. G. Pearson, Esq., The Square,
Bishop's Waltham, and at the offices of the
undersigned Parliamentary Agents.

Dated this 21st day of February, 1929.
DYSON, BELL AND Co., 19, Abingdon

Street, Westminster, S.W. 1, Parlia-
(122) mentary agents.

Electricity Commission—1929.

RUNCORN URBAN AND RUNCORN
RURAL ELECTRICITY (EXTENSION).

NOTICE is hereby given that the Mersey
Power Company Limited whose regis-

tered office is at Colonial House, Water Street,
Liverpool ('hereinafter referred to as " the
Applicants ") have applied to the Electricity


