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Whitehall, December 2, 1929.

The KING has been pleased, by-.Warrant
under His Majesty's Royal Sign Manual,
bearing date the 25th ultimo, to appoint the
Reverend Edwin Arthur Paxton, M.A., Rector
of Gamston with Eaton, to the Living of St.
Paul, Derby, in the county and Diocese of
Derby, vacant by the cession of the Reverend
John Alfred Burness, B.A.

Whitehall, December 2, 1929.

The KING has been pleased, by Warrant
under His Majesty's Royal Sign Manual,
bearing date the 25th ultimo, to appoint the
Reverend Harold William Pinchbeck, B.A., to
the Living of Saint James, Codnor with'
Loscoe, in the county and Diocese of Derby,
vacant by the cession of the Reverend Samuel
Elder, M.A.

ABBOT MEMORIAL SCHOOL,
GATESHEAD.

Resignation of Certificate.

The Secretary of State for the Home
Department hereby gives notice that the
Managers of the Abbot Memorial School,
Gateshead, have resigned the Certificate granted
under the Industrial Schools Act, 1888, in
respect of the School.

This School will cease to be a Certified School
on the 20th May, 1930.

Whitehall,
2nd December, 1929.

The Secretary of State for the Home Depart-
ment gives notice that there will shortly be a
vacancy for a Medical Referee under the
Workmen's Compensation Act, 1925, for the
Dundee district of the Sheriffdom of Forfar.
Applications for the post from duly qualified
medical practitioners should be addressed to
the Private Secretary, Scottish Office, White-
hall, S.W. 1, and should reach him not later
than 24th December, 1929.

Whitehall,
30th November, 1929.

The Home Secretary gives notice that in
pursuance of Section 2 (1) of the Employment
of Women, Young Persons and Children Act,
1920, he has made an Order authorising the
employment on two day-shifts of women of 18
years of age and over in attending warp
knitting machines at the works of Messrs.
M. C. Foister, Clay and Ward, Limited,
Coronation-road, Derby, subject to the condi-
tions that a worker shall not be employed in
the afternoon shift in consecutive weeks and
that suitable cloakroom and messroom -accom-
modation and w.ashing facilities shall be
provided.

Whitehall,
29th November, 1929.

The .Home Secretary gives notice that in
pursuance of Section 2 (1) of the Employment
of Women, Young Persons and Children Act,
1920, he has made an Order authorising the
employment on two day-shifts of women of 18
years of age and over in washing
and . calendering knitted goods at the
works of The Derwent Hosiery Company
Limited, Castle Factory, Belper, subject to the
conditions that a worker shall not be employed
in the afternoon shift in consecutive weeks;
that suitable protective footwear and cloak-
room and messroom accommodation shall be
provided, and that the Secretary of State may
at any time require the occupiers to make such
special arrangements for the conveyance of
workers living at a distance or otherwise for
the welfare of such workers as may be necessary
to prevent hardship.

Whitehall,
29th November, 1929.

The Home Secretary gives notice that in
pursuance of Section 2 (1) of the Employment
of Women, Young Persons and Children Act,
1920, he has made an Or.der authorising the
employment on two day-shifts of women of 18
and young persons of 16 years of age and
over in pirn winding of rayon at the works of
Messrs. Cheadle Textiles Limited, Tape Street,
Cheadle, Staffordshire, subject to the conditions
that a worker shall not be employed :n the
afternoon shift in consecutive weeks; that
suitable cloakroom and messroom accommoda-
tion and washing facilities shall be provided,
and that additional daily thermometer read-
ings shall be taken and recorded if atmospheric
humidity is artificially produced.

Whitehall,
29th November, 1929.

The Home Secretary gives notice that in
pursuance of Section 2 (1) of the Employment
of Women, Young Persons and Children Act,
1920, he has made an Order authorising the
employment on two day-shifts, of women of
18 and young persons of 16 years of age and
over in the Pudding Department at the works
of Messrs. I. H. Lavery and Company,
Limited, Red Cat Lane, Burscough Bridge,
Lancashire, subject to the conditions that a
worker shall not be employed in the afternoon
shift in consecutive weeks; that suitable pro-
tective clothing, cloakroom and messroom
accommodation, washing facilities and facili-
ties for sitting shall be provided; that a worker
shall not be allowed to lift, carry or move any-
thing so heavy as to be likely to cause her
injury; that a responsible forewoman shall he
appointed on each shift and that'the Secre'tary
of State may at any time require the occupiers
to make such special arrangements for the con-
veyance of workers living at a distance or
otherwise for the welfare of such workers as
may be necessary to prevent hardship.

Whitehall,
2nd December, 1929.


