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above mentioned short title and of which, the.
principal subject matters are:—

The conso.lidation of the Local and Private
Acts and of the Orders confirmed or approved
by Parliament or made by a Government
Department now in force in -the Borough or
relating to the Corporation and their several
undertakings and properties; The repeal of
such Acts and Orders with exceptions and the
re-enactment thereof with amendments and
extensions; Continuance of Corporation's
water, electricity, tramway and omnibus,
aquarium and markets undertakings and their
sea defence works, seaside improvements,
Pavilion Estate, public buildings, racecourse,
parks, recreation grounds, burial grounds,
lands and other property and further powers
in regard thereto;

New adit and winding shaft in parish of
Falmer in rural district of Newhaven; Con-
struction &c. in urban district of Shoreham-
by-Sea and parish of Old Shoreham in rural
district of Steyning West of Adits Nos. 1, 2
and 3 authorised by Brighton Corporation
Water Act 1896; Pumping and appropriation
of waters (including the waters known as the
Spring Dyke); Laying down, construction, &c.
of mains, pipes and works authorised by
Brighton Corporation Act 1900 on in and under
the road connecting the Corporation's generat-
ing station in urban district of Southwick
with the highway between Brighton and New
Shoreham and acquisition of easements and
rights of way in connection therewith; Pro-
tection of water supplies and prevention of
pollution; Stand pipes; Supply for motor cars,
garages, &c., and refrigerating, water soften-
ing and mechanical power works and appa-
ratus and to public institutions &c.; Bulk
supplies; Guarantees by Newhaven Rural
District Council; Other provisions relating to
water undertaking;

Power to abandon tramways; Working and
other agreements as to tramways and public
service vehicles with Hove Corporation and
other authorities bodies &c.; Leasing of public
service vehicles &c.; Other .provisions as to
tramway and omnibus undertaking;

Re-enactment with alterations of existing
provisions relating to extension of electricity
limits to include parts of borough of Hove,
parts of urban districts • of Po.rtslade-by-Sea
and Shoreham-by-Sea and parishes of Old
Shoreham and Lancing in rural district of
Steyning West and provisions relating thereto;
Rights of purchase by other local authorities;
Electricity sub-stations; Other provisions re-
lating to electricity undertaking;

Provisions as to Corporation's generating
station in urban district of Southwick; Con-
struction of wharf, sub-way and other works
in urban districts of Southwick and Portslade-
by-Sea and borough of Hove authorised by
Brighton Corporation Acts 1900 and 1903; Pro-
visions relating to Shoreham Harbour; Other
provisions relating to generating ' station,
wharf, sub-way and works aforesaid, and
exemption thereof from purchase and other
provisions of Electricity (Supply) Acts;

Additional sea defence works in the
Borough; Extension of powers of East Sussex
County Council Act 1909; Other powers relat-
ing to sea defence works and seaside improve-
ments ;

Aquarium undertaking and powers with
respect thereto;

Pavilion Estate, libraries, museums, art
galleries, and further powers relating thereto;

Burial grounds and disused burial grounds
known as the Dyke Road Burial Grounds and
the Queen's Road Burial Ground and powers
relating thereto including powers as to removal
of tombstones; Continuance of Corporation as
Burial Board for the Borough;

Markets; Street markets; Slaughter houses;
Prohibition of slaughtering in private
slaughter houses; Closure of markets and
slaughter houses; Other provisions relating to
markets undertaking and slaughter houses;
Cold storage accommodation;

Town Hall and other public buildings, race-
course, parks, recreation grounds &c., and
further powers relating thereto including
powers as to parks and recreation and pleasure
grounds outside the Borough; Special pro-
.visions as to Preston Park;

Enclosed places and privileged houses,
Management Committees thereof, and pro-
visions relating thereto; Taking over by Cor-
poration by consent of enclosed places or parts
thereof and maintenance as a public park or
pleasure ground;

Compulsory acquisition of lands, and ease-
ments for water undertaking in said parish
of Palmer and of parts of sea beach and lands
between high and low water mark partly in
the Borough and partly in the parish of Tels-
combe in the rural' district of Newhaven;
Special provisions as to compensation; Set-off;
Modifications of Lands Clauses Acts; Power
to develop lands, erect buildings, &c.; and
other provisions relating to lands and
buildings;

Provisions and powers (including new pro-
visions and new powers) as to streets, develop-
ment of estates, frontage lines and improve-
ment lines of streets, buildings, forecourts,
hoardings, structures, scaffolding, projections,
platforms, banners, illuminating and other
signs, elevations of buildings, amenities of the
Borough, sewers, drains, sanitary conveniences,
infectious disease, lodging houses, human
food, slaughtering of animals, other sanitary
matters, hackney carriages, public convey-
ances, boats, bathing machines, bathing, beach,
drivers, porters, watermen, boatmen &c.,
capstans, vehicular traffic, police matters, pre-
vention of noise, silencers for internal com-
bustion engines, petroleum spirit licences,
advertising of. the Borough and information
bureaux;

Employment agencies in the Borough and
licensing and regulation thereof;

Borrowing powers; Mortgages; Stock;
Bonds; Sinking, loans, consolidated loans,
accident, all risks insurance and other funds;
Revenue of and expenditure on undertakings;
Other financial provisions;

Stopping up of roads in Borough; Tem-
porary closing of, breaking up and other inter-
ference with roads, bridges, works, &c., within
and beyond the Borough; Attachment of
brackets to buildings; Entry on and into
lands, houses and other premises;

Agreements with, powers to and obligations
on local, road and other authorities, Sewers
'Board, water and electricity consumers,
owners, occupiers and other persons;


