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Re SARAH EDITH COOKE, Deceased.
Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925.

NOTICE is hereby given that all creditors and
other persons having any claims or demands

against the estate of Sarah Edith Cooke, late of
The Moot House, Aldridge, in the county of
Stafford, Spinster, deceased (who died intestate
on the 6th day of August, 1934, and to whose
estate letters of administration were granted out
of the Principal Probate Registry of the Probate
Division of His Majesty's High Court of Justice
on the 25th day of January, 1935, to John George
Cooke, of Glen Lodge, Buchanan Road, Walsall,
in the said county of Stafford, Bachelor of
Medicine, and Ellen Pearman Hepburn, of The
Moot House, Aldridge aforesaid) ? are hereby
required to send particulars, in writing, of their
claims or demands to us, the undersigned, the
Solicitors for the said administrators, on or before
the 14th day of October, 1935, after which date
the said administrators will proceed to distribute
the assets of the said deceased amongst the persons
entitled thereto, having regard only to the claims
and demands of which they shall then have had
notice; and will not be liable for the assets of the
said deceased, or any part thereof, so distributed,
to any person or persons of whose claims or
demands they shall not then have had notice.—
Dated this 9th day of August, 1935.

NICKLIN and OOTTERELL, Bridge Street,
'Walsall, Solicitors for the said Adminis-

(137) trators.

HERBERT POOLE SANDREY, Deceased.

NOTICE is hereby given pursuant to the Trustee
Act, 1925, that all persons having any claims

or demands upon or against the estate of Herbert
Poole S'andrey, late of Thurlibeer, Launcells, in
the county of Cornwall, "Yeoman, deceased (who
died on the 27th day of December, 1934, and
whose Will (with Codicil) was proved by William
Richard Sandrey and Charles Jewell, the executors
therein named, on the 1st day of February, 1935,
in the Principal Probate Registry), are hereby
required to send in the particulars of their debts
or claims to the undersigned, Solicitors for the
said executors, on or before the 17th day of
October, 1935; and notice is hereby also given that
after that day the said executors will proceed to
distribute the assets of the said Herbert Poole
Sandrey, deceased, amongst the parties entitled
thereto, having regard only to the claims of which
they shall then have had notice; and that they
will not be responsible for the assets, or any part
thereof, so distributed, to. any person of whose
debt or claim they shall not then have had notice.
—Dated this 8th day of August, 1935.

PETER PETER and SONS, Holsworthy,
(150) Devon, Solicitors for the said Executors.

Re MADELEINE ZIEGLER DB LOES or
SORREZE, Deceased.

Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925.

NOTICE is hereby given that all creditors and
other persons having any claims or demands

against the estate of Madeleine Ziegler de Lpe's
(nee Guibert), sometimes known as Madeleine
Guibert or Sorreze and formerly Madeleine
Behrend, late of Cabellou, near Concarneau,
France, and formerly of 8, Rue Delaborde, Paris,
deceased (who died on the 1st day of June, 1932,
and letters of administration of whose estate
were granted by the Principal Registry of the
Probate Division of His Majesty's High Court of
Justice on the 21st day of March, 1935, to
Frederick Charles Russia Sneath, as Attorney for
Marie Alexandrine Guibert, the Mother of the de-
ceased), are hereby required to send the particu-
lars, in writing, of their claims or demands to
the undersigned, the Solicitors for the said
administrator, on or before the 24th day of
October, 1935, after which date the said adminis-
trator will proceed to distribute the assets of the
said deceased amongst the persons entitled
thereto, having regard only to the debts, claims
and demands of which he shall then have had

notice; and he will not be liable for the assets of
the said deceased, or any part thereof, so dis-
tributed, to any person or persons of whose claims
or demands he shall not then have had notice.—
Dated this 8th day of August, 1935.

WATERHOUSE and CO., 1, New Court,
(158) Lincolns Inn, Carey Street, W.C.2.

Re CHARLES WILLIAM SCULLARD, Deceased.
Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925.

NOTICE is hereby given that all creditors and
other persons having any debts, claims or

demands against the estate of Charles William
Scullard, late of Scullard's Hotel, Above Bar
Street, Southampton, in the county of Hants,
deceased (who died on the 3rd day of February,
1935, and whose Will was proved in the Principal
Registry of the Probate Division of His Majesty's
High Court of Justice on the 7th day of August,
1935, by Mary Lawrence Scullard and Edward
Gale Sanders, the executors therein named), are
hereby required to send in the particulars of their
debts, claims or demands to us, the undersigned,
the Solicitors for the said executors, on or before
the 1st day of November, 1935, after which date
the said executors will proceed to distribute the
assets of the said deceased amongst the persons
entitled thereto, haying regard only to the claims
and demands of which they shall then have had
notice; and they will not be liable for the assets of
the said deceased, or any part thereof, so dis-
tributed, to any person or persons of whosa debts,
claims or demands they shall not then have had
notice.—Dated this 10th day of August, 1935.

CHARLES ANSELL EMANUEL and
EMANUEL, 16, Portland Terrace, South-

(126) ampton, Solicitors for the said Executors.

SARAH OWEN, Deceased.
Pursuant to the Trustee Act, 1925.

NOTICE is hereby given that all creditors and
persons having any claims or demands against

the estate of Sarah Owen, late of 19, Chetwynd
End, Newport, in the county of Salop, Widow,
deceased (who died on the 19th day of January,
•1935, and to whose estate letters of administration
were granted to Sarah Owen on the 27th day of
May, 1935, by the Principal Probate Registry of
the Probate Division of the High Court of
Justice), are hereby required to send in the par-
ticulars of their claims and demands to the under-
signed Solicitors, on or before the 19th day of
October, 1935; and notice is hereby also given
that after that day the said administratrix will
proceed to distribute the assets of the deceased
among the parties entitled thereto, having regard
only to the claims of which the said administratrix
shall then have notice; and that she will not be
liable for the assets, or any part thereof, so dis-
tributed, to any person of whose debt or claim
she shall not then have 'had notice.—Dated this
9th day of August, 1935.

HODGES HARRISS and ELLIOTT, Newport,
(124) Salop, Solicitors for the Administratrix.

ARTHUR HENRY SWANN, Deceased.

ALL persons having claims against the estate
of Arthur Henry Swann, late of 126, Weston.

Park, Crouch End, in the county of Middlesex
(who died on the 20th day of May, 1935, and
letters of administration of whose estate were
granted by the Principal Probate Registry on the
8th day of August, 1935, to Doris Ivy S.wann, of
Stevington, in the county of Bedford, Wife of
Arthur Edmund, Swann), are required to send
particulars thereof, in writing, to the under-
signed, on or before the 18th October, 1935, after
which date the administratrix will proceed to dis-
tribute the assets, having regard only to the
claims of which she shall then have had notice.—
Dated this 9th day of August, 1935.

SANDERSON LEE and CO., Basildon House,
7-11, Moprgate, E.C.2, Solicitors for the

(110) said Administratrix!


