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NOTICE is hereby given that the Partnership-
heretofore subsisting between Bertie Clapham and
John Ronald Henderson carrying on business as
Solicitors at 3, Saint Vedast Street, France of Wales
Road, Norwich, under the style or firm of
CLAPHAM & -HENDERSON, has been dissolved as
from the 31st day of October, 1957, so far as con-
cerns the said John Ronald Henderson who retires
from the said firm. All debts due to and owing by
the said late firm wiJJ be received and paid respec-
tively by the said Bertie Clapham and by Lloyd
Brian Summers who will carry on the said business
in partnership under the same style as heretofore.—
Dated this 31st day of October, 1957.

fl. CLAPHAM.
J. R. HENDERSON.

(444) L. B. SUMMERS.

(NOTICE is hereby given that the Partnership
heretofore subsisting 'between Edward William
Snelling and Albert James Thomas carrying on busi-
ness as Retail Butchers at No. 31, Brighton Road,
Worthing, in the county of Sussex, under the style
or firm of "A. SNELLING", has been, dissolved
as from the 1st day of February, 1957, so far as
concerns the said William Snelling who retires from
the said firm. All debts due to and owing by the
said late firm will be received and paid respectively
by the said Albert James Thomas who will continue
to carry on the said business under the style or firm
of " A. J. Thomas ".—Dated this 24th day of October
1957.

INYE and DONNE, 10, High Street, Shoreham,
Solicitors for A. E. W. Snelling.

IMALCOLM.WILSON and COBBY, 74, Goring
(437) Road, Worthing, Solicitors for A. J. Thomas.

NOTICE is hereby given that the Partnership here-
tofore subsisting between Florence Queenie Cartwright
and Margaret Mary Evelyn Stillman carrying on
business known as the NEW TABARIN CLUB at
242, Harrow Road, Paddington, has been dissolved
as from the 25th day of October, 1957, so far as
concerns the said Florence Queenie Cartwright who
retired from the said firm.—Dated the 25th day of
October, 1957.

FLORENCE Q. CARTWRIGHT.
(294) MARGARET M. E. STILLMAN.

LOWE.—The kin, .of FREDERICK LOWE late of
14, Livingstone Mansions, Queen's Club Gardens,
Fulham, London, W.,14, who idied at Banstead
Hospital, Button, Surrey, on 12ltih May, J957, are
cited to apply within eight days to the (Principal
Probate 'Registry, Somerset House, Strand, London
W.C.2. (Estate about £3'5Q.)

B. 'LONG, Register.
Treasury Solicitor <B.V.), 3>, Birdcage Walk, St.

James's Park, London, S.W./L

ABELS.—The kin. of ISAIAC ABELS late of 20
Doggetts Way, St. Albans, Hertfordshire, who died
at 'Si. Albans City Hospital, St. Ailbans, Hertford-
shire, oo 7th December, .1956, are cited to apply
within eight days to ithe Principal Probate Registry,
Somerset House, Strand, London, WJC.2. (Estate
about £325.)

B. LONG, Registrar.
Treasury Solicitor (B.V.), 3», Birdcage Walk, St.

James's IPark, London, S.W.I..

GIBSON.—The kin of lALBERT GIBSON late of
26, Meldon Gardens, Gateshead, in the county of
Durham, who died at Bensham General Hospital,
Gateshead 8, in the county of Durham, on 19th
January, 1957, are icited to apply wiihin eight days
to the Principal Probate Registry, Somerset House,
Strand, London, W.C.2. (Estate about £500.)

B. LONG, iRegistrar.
Treasury Solicitor (B.V.), 3', Birdcage Walk, St.

James's Park, London, S.W.L

ALLEN.—The -kin ol AILTCE MlAiRY ALLEN
(Spinster) late of 12, King Edward Road, Rochester,
Kent, who died at Milton Regis Hospital, Sitting-
foourne, Kent, on 14th March, 1943, are cited to
apply within eight days to the Principal Probate
Registry, Somerset House, Strand, London, W.C.2.
(Estate about £450.)

B. LONG, Registrar.
Treasury Solicitor (B.V.), 3>, Birdcage Walk, St.

James's Park, London, S.WJL

D.IXON—The kin of NELLIE DIXON (Spinster)
late of 7, Chester Street, Newcastle-upon-Tyne,
who died at the (Royal Victoria Infirmary, Queen
Victoria Road, Newcastle-upon-Tyne 1, on llth
November, 11956, are cited ito apply within eight
days to -the Principal Probate (Registry, Somerset
House, Strand, London, W.C.2. (Estate about
£1,200.)

B. LONG, Registrar.
Treasury Solicitor (B.V.), 3, Birdcage Walk, St.

James's Park, London, S.W.'l.

FLEETWOiOD.—MABEL FLEETWOOD formerly
of 43, Crescent Street, Kensington, London, die
mother of ALFRED ELEETCWOOD otherwise
ALTRR'ED J1OYCE otherwise ALFRED GEORGE
JOYCE late of 26, Loveday Street, Birmingham 4,
who died at the General Hospital, Birmingham, on
19th May, ;l!957, is cited1 to apply within- eight days
to >the /Principal Probate Registry, Somerset House,
Strand, London, W.C.2. .(Estate aibout £600.)

B. LONG, Registrar.
Treasury Solicitor (B.V.), 3', Birdcage Walk, St.

James's Park, London, S.W.L

LITTLE.—The kin (if any) who are entitled to
share and all other persons having or claiming to
have any interest in the estate of VICTOR JAMES
LITTLE late of 41', Highfield Aivenue, Fareham,
Hants, who died 'there on 6th July, 1956, are cited
to apply within eight .days :to the Principal Probate
(Registry, Somerset House, Strand, London, W.C.2.
(Estate about £120.)

B. LONG, Registrar.
Treasury Solicitor (B.V.), 3', Birdcage Walk, St.

James's Park, London, S.WJL

REEVES.—The kin of HENRY WILLIAM
iREEVES late of 12, George Street, Chatham, Kent,
who died at St. Bartholomew's. Hospital, Rochester,
Kent, on 8th September, .1956, are cited to apply
within eight day® to the Principal Probate Registry,
Somerset House, Strand, London, W.C.2. (Estate
about £280.)

B. LONG, Registrar.
Treasury Solicitor (iB.'V.), 3', Birdcage Walk, St.

James's Park, London', S.W.I.

I, VEJRA CAIRTWIRIQHT, of 29, Abercorn Place,
St Johns Wood, 1N.W.8, in- the county of London,
Widow, a citizen of the United! Kingdom and
Colonies by birth, heretofore called and known by
tine name of Vera Kahn, hereby give notice that I
have renounced and abandoned line surname of Kahn
and that 1 have assumed and intend henceforth on
all occasions whatsoever and at all times to sign
and use and to be called and known by the surname
of Cartwrighit in lieu of and in substitution for my
former surname of Kahn. And I also hereby give
notice that such change of name is formally declared
and evidenced by a Deed Poll under my hand and
seal dated the 14tih day of October, 1957, and duly
executed and attested and that sudh Deed Poll was
enrolled in the Central Office of 'the Supreme Court
of Judicature on the 21st day of October, 1957.

VERA CAiRrFWiRBGHT, formerly Vera Kahn.
(036)

(NOTICE: is hereby given that by a Deed Poll dated
the 4th 'October, 1957, and enrolled in tihe Supreme
Court of Judicature on 24th October, 1957. ROY
ALLAN JAIM-IEiSON PARKER, of 52, 'Delagoa
Road, in the city of Liverpool, an Infant and citizen
of the United Kingdom and Colonies by birth,
abandoned the surname of Carter and also assumed
the additional Christian name of Jamieson.—Dated
the 25tih day of October, 1957.

HERBERT GREEN and CO., 21-23, Old Hall
Street, Liverpool 3-, Solicitors for the said Roy
Allan Jamieson Parker formerly Roy Allan

(2111) Carter.

•NOTICE is hereby given tihat by a Deed Poll dialed
the 26th day of October, 1957', and duly enrolled in
the Supreme Court of Judicature on the 29th day
of 'October, 1957, I, TORFRIDA JOY (ELSA
MAXWELL 'JONES, of 29, Park Square, in the city
of Leeds, Spinster, a citizen of the United Kingdom
and Colonies by birth, renounced and abandoned the
surname of Telling.—Dated this 30th day of
October, 1957.

TORFRIDA D1OY IELSA MAXWELL (JONES,
(091) formerly Torfrida Joy Elsa Maxwell Telling..


