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A.C. QUILT LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to Section 293 of the
Companies .Act 1948, that a Meeting of the Creditors of
the above-named Company will be held at Myers & Co.,
(Chartered Accountants), 248A Chingford Mount Road,
Chingford E4 on Friday, the 14th December 1973, at 3.30
o'clock in the afternoon, for -the purposes mentioned in
Sections 294 and 295 of the said Act-^Dalted 16th Novem-
ber 1973.

By Order of the Board.

(60) N. Praesoody, Secretary

VEGANTUNE LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that a Meeting of the Creditors
of ithe above-named Company will be held ait The White
Hart Hotel, Spalding, Lines, on <the 6th December 1973
at 10.30 o'clock in the forenoon for the purposes men-
tioned in Sections 293, 294 and 295 of the Companies Act
1948.—Dated 16th November 1973.

By Order of the Board.

(81) /. Sismey, Director

WRIDEL CONSTRUCTION LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that there will be a Meeting of the
Creditors of the above Company on- Monday the 10th
December 1973 at 2.30 o'clock hi the afternoon in Burn-
ham Park Hall (Brftwell Room), Burnham, Bucks, for the
purposes set out in Sections 293 and 294 of the Companies
Act 1948.

By Order of the Board.

(92) P. G. Wright, Director

BAMFIBLD & .GARDNER LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to Section 293 of the
Companies Act 1948, that a Meeting of the Creditors of
the above-named Company will be held at 143s Victoria
Street, St. ALbanis on Monday the 10th December 1973 at
10.30 o'clock in the forenoon for the purpose of having
a full statement of the position of the Company's affairs,
together with a 'List of 'the Creditors of (the Company and
the estimated amount of their claims, laid before them, and
for the purpose, if thought fit, of nominating a Liquidator
and of appointing a Committee of Inspection.—Dated 20th
November 1973.

By Order of the Board.

(93) L. Bamfield, Director

WELDON SHOPFITTING & JOINERY CO. LTD.

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to Section 293 of the
Companies Act 1948, that a Meeting of the Creditors of
the above-named Company will be held at 19 Eastcheap,
London EJC3 on Monday the 10th December 1973 at 11.30
o'clock in •the forenoon for the purpose mentioned in
Section 294 et seq of the said Act.—Dated 21st November
1973.

By Order of the Board.

(189) Peter H. Markham, Director

R.H.R. FRESH FOODS LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to Section 293 of the
Companies Act 1948, •that a Meeting of the Creditors of
the above-named Company will be head at the Law Society
Rooms, Campo Lane, Sheffield 1 on Wednesday the 12ith
December 1973 at 12 o'clock noon for 'Che purposes men-
tioned in Sections 294 and 295 of the said Act.—Dated
20th November 1973.

By Order of the Board.

NOTICES TO CREDITORS

WYBERN ENTERPRISES LTD.

Notice is hereby given that the Creditors of the above-
mentioned Company are required on or before the 3rd
January 1974 to send their names and addresses, with par-
ticulars 'of their debits or claims, to die undersigned Victor
Ernest Grimwood, of McCabe & Ford, Central Chambers,
76 High Street, Sitttingbourne, Kent, the Liquidator of the
Company, and if so required by notice in writing from the
said Liquidator either personally or by itheir Solicitors, to
come in and prove their debts or claims alt such time and
place as shall be specified in such notice and in default
thereof, they will be excluded' froijti the benefit of, any
distribution made before such debts are proven.—'Dated
21st November 1973.

(61) V. E. Grimwood, Liquidator

PETER MACK LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that the Creditors of the above-
named Company are required, on or before the 1.4th
December 1973, to send itheir names and addresses, with
particulars of their debts or claims, and the names and
addresses of -their Solicitors (if any), to the undersigned,
Stanley Charles Parlett of 1 Union Crescent, Cecil Square,
Margate, Kent, CT9 INT, the Oquidaitor of the said Com-
pany: and, if so required by notice, in writing by the said
Liquidator, are, by their Solicitors, or personally, to come
in and prove itheir said debts or claims at such time and
place as shall be specified in such notice, or in default
thereof they will be excluded from the benefit of any
distribution made before such debts are proved. This notice
is purely formal and all known Creditors have been, or
will be paid in full.—Dated 21st November 1973.

(68) S. C. Parlett, Liquidator

KNOWLSON LIMITED

Notice is hereby given -that the Creditors of the above-
named Company are required ion or before the 171th
December 1973 to send their names and addresses, with
particulars of itiheir debts or claims, and -the -names and
addresses of their solicitors (if any) Ito the undersigned,
John Derek Bee of 46 Whltegate Drive, Blackpool, 'the
Liquidator of the said Company, and if so required by
notice in writing by the said Liquidator are, by mew
solicitors or personally, to come in and prove itheir said
debits or claims at such tfime and place as shall be specified
in such notice, or in default thereof they will be excluded
from the benefit of any distribution made before such
debts are proved.—Dated 22nd November 1973.

(95) /. D. Bee, Liquidator

UNDERWOODS OF PUDSEY LIMITED

Notice is hereby given (that the Creditors of the above-
named Company are required on or before the 31st Dec-
ember 1973 to send in their names and addresses, with
particulars of their debts or claims, to Hhe undersigned,
F. Lennon of Temporal, Lennon & Co., 21 Queen Square,
Leeds 2, the Liquidator of the Company, and if so required
by notice in writing by Ithe said Liquidator either person-
ally or by 'their solicitors to come fin arid prove their said
debts or claims at-such time and, place as, shall be specified
hi such notice or in default thereof they'-will be excluded
from the benefit.of any distribution made before such
debts are proven.—Dated 20th November 1973.

(190) M. C. Rogers, Director (98) F. Lennon, Liquidator


