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any creditor or contributory of the said Company desirous
to support or oppose the making of an Order on the said
Petition may appear at the time of hearing in person or
by his counsel for that purpose; and a copy of the Petition
will be furnished by the undersigned to any creditor or
contributory of the said Company requiring such copy
on payment of the regulated charge for the same.

Titmuss, Sainer & Webb, 2 Serjeant's Inn, London
(166) EIC4Y 1'LT, Solicitors for the Petitioner.

NOTE: Any person who intends to appear on the hearing
of the said Petition must serve on or send by post to the
above-named notice in writing of his intention so to do.
The notice must state the name and address of the person
or, if a firm, the name and address of the firm and must
be signed by the person or firm or Ms or their solicitor
(if any) and must be served or, if posted, must be sent by
post in sufficient time to reach the above-named not later
than 4 o'clock in the afternoon of the 26th April 1974.

RESOLUTIONS FOR WINDING-UP

TUFTON ARMS HOTEL

At an Extraordinary General Meeting of the above-named
Company, duly convened and held at Cransmere, Oannerch
Road West, Rhos-on-Sea, Goiwyn Bay on the 25th March
March 1974, the following Special Resolution was duly
passed:

"That the Company be wound up voluntarily, and Chat
Arthur Edge of 1 Ridgefield, Manchetser 2 be and he is
hereby appointed Liquidator for the purposes of such
w5nding-up."

(SO) E. Bennison, Director

F. W. A. GOULDEN LIMITED

At an Extraordinary General Meeting of the Members of
the above-named Company, duly convened, and held alt
218 Harley Shute Road, St. Leonards-on-Sea, 'Sussex, on
the 30th March .1974, ithe following Special Resolution was
duly-passed:

"That the Company be wound up voluntarily • and that
Norman Herbert Frederick Howe of 7/9 Wellington Square,
Hastings, (Sussex, be and is hereby appointed Liquidator
for the purposes of such winding-up."

(54) F. W. A. Goulden, Chairman

LULLYWHITE FROWD SPORTS GOODS LIMITED

At an Extraordinary General Meeting of the above-named
Company, duly convened, and held ait 9 Poittman Towers,
George Street, (London Wl on ithe 25th March 1974, the
following Special Resolution was duly passed:.

"Thalt the Company be wound up Voluntarily, and that
Drummond Ernest Abrams of 134 High Street, Tonbridge,
Kent, be and he Ss hereby appointed Liquidator for the
purposes of such winding-up."

(55) D. H. Davies, Chairman

SHEPHERD AND GUPPY LIMITED

At an Extraordinary General Meeting of the Members of
the above-named Company, duly convened, and held ait 42
Westby Road, Bournemouth on (the 29th March 1974, the
following Special Resolution was duly passed :

"That the Company be wound up voluntarily and that
Leighton Howard Guppy of 42 Westby Road, Bourne-
mouth, be and is hereby appointed Liquidator for the pur-
poses of the winding-up."

AUTO REPLACEMENTS (HECKMONDWIKE)
LIMITED

At an Extraordinary General Meeting of Ithe members of
the above-named Company, duly convened and held alt
Barclays -Bank (Chambers, Cleckheaton in the County of
York on 3rd April 1974, the following Extraordinary
Resolution was duly passed'• . . .

"That ft has been proved to the satisfaction of this
meeting that the Company cannot, by reason of its liabili-
ties, continue its business, and Ithat it is advisable to wind
up the same, and accordingly that ithe Company be wound
up voluntarily, and that Jeffrey Atkinson of Barclays. Bank
House, Market 'Street, Dewsbury, Chartered Accountant,
be and he Is hereby nominated Liquidator for ithe purposes
of the winding-up."

(66) A. Wadsworth, Chairman

W. F. CLAXTON LIMITED

At an Extraordinary General Meeting of <the above-named
Company, duly convened, and held at Moss Lane, Hale,
Cheshire, on the 25th March 1974, the following Special
Resolution was duly passed:

"That 'the .Company be wound up voluntarily, and Ithat
Peter 'Moore Stafford of Spicer and Pegler, 12 Booth
Street, Manchester M60 2ED, be and he is hereby appointed
Liquidator for the purposes of such winding-up."

(69) ' ' ' C. 'M. Hadfield, Director and Chairman

DAWKINS FUELS LIMITED

At an Extraordinary General Meeting of the Members of
•the above-named Company, duly convened, and held at
Avon House, 360/366 Oxford Street, London WIN 9HA
on the ,18th March 1974, the following Special Resolution
was duly passed:

"That ithe Company be wound up voluntarily and that
Ralph Harold 'Moss of Avon House, 360/366 Oxford
Street, London WIN 9HA be and is hereby appointed
Liquidator for the purposes of such winding-up."

(71) G. E. Prosser, Chairman and Director

R. J. BOYLES & SON LIMITED

At an Extraordinary General Meeting of the above-named
Company, duly convened, and held at 326 Streaftham High
Road, London SW16 6HH on Monday, 1st April 1974, the
subjoined Special Resolution was duly passed:

"Thait the Company be wound up voluntarily and that
Peter Reginald Sheppard of 326 Streatham High Road,
London SW16 6HH 'be .and he is hereby appointed Liqui-
dator for (the purposes of such winding-up." - . . . .

(73) P. Boyles, Chairman

CASTFINE LIMITED

At an Extraordinary General Meeting of the above-named
Company, duly convened, and held at 49 Welbeck Street,
London W1M THE on .the 28th March 1974, ithe subjoined
Extraordinary Resolution was duly passed:

"That it has been proved to the satisfaction of .this meet-
ing that the Company cannot by -reason of its lilaMMes
continue its business, and that it is advisable to wind up
the same, and accordingly that the (Company be wound up
voluntarily, and Michael Elliott, FjQA., of 49 Welbeck
Street, London WtM 7HE" be and he is hereby appointed
Liquidator 'for the purposes of such winding-up."

(76) ' • Maurice D. Lever

(64) L, H. Guppy, Chairman

MASSINGHA'M AIRFIELD FARMING COMPANY .
LIMITED . " - ' . .

At an Extraordinary General Meeting'of ithe Members of
the above-named (Company, duly convened, and held at
Hall Farm, Fring, Norfolk on ithe 22nd March '1974, the


