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Hardstandingeast of Walthamstow Avenue and to the rear of the
Comet Discount Store (206). Part of width of Walthamstow
Avenue adjoining the Esso Garage, Walthamstow Avenue
(206A). Half width of Walthamstow Avenue north-west of the
Comet Discount Store (206B). Part of hardstanding east of
Walthamstow Avenue and to the rear of the the Card and Gift
Centre (206C). Part of car parking area east of Walthamstow
Avenue, and south of the Card and Gift. Centre and north of the
B and Q Superstore (206D). Part of forecourt to premises known
as LRC Products Ltd, Walthamstow Avenue (207B). Part of
access road to the Greaves Pumping Station, south of the LRC
Products Ltd (208). Grassland south of the access road to
Greaves Pumping Station (208A). Part of rear yard to premises
known as LRC Products Ltd, Walthamstow Avenue (208B). Part
width of Walthamstow Avenue south of the premises known as
LRC Products Ltd, Walthamsow Avenue (208C). Grassland
south of LRC Products Ltd, Walthamstow Avenue (209 and
209A). Grassland at the rear of the premises known as Shadbolt
Engineering Works and LRC Products Ltd, Walthamstow
Avenue (210, 210A and 21 OB). Grassland and part of the Ching
culvert west of Folly Lane together with the adjoining half widths
of Folly Lane and Walthamstow Avenue (211). Grassland west of
Folly Lane and north of the Ching Culvert (211A). Grassland to
the north and south of the Ching culvert and west of Folly Lane
(21 IB). Grassland and part of the Ching culvert, west of Folly
Lane (211C). Part of forecourt to premises known as the Mobil
Self Service Station, Walthamstow Avenue (212 and 212A). Half
width of Folly Lane adjoining the Mobil Self Service Station,
Walthamstow Avenue (212B) Grassland and part of the Ching
culvert south-west of Walthamstow Avenue (213 and 213A).
Grassland and part of hardstanding north-east of the caravan site
off Folly Lane and south-west of Walthamstow Avenue (214 and
214A). Grassland south-west of Walthamstow Avenue and east
of the caravan site off folly Lane (2IS and 2ISA). Grassland
south-west of Walthamstow Avenue and south-east of the
caravan site off Folly Lane (216 and 216A). Part of hardstanding
north-east of Walthamstow Avenue and to the rear of the
premises known as the B and Q Superstore (217). Car parking
areas and access road forming part of the Hastingwood Trading
Estate (218, 219, 220 and 221). Grassland between the
Hastingwood Trading Estate and the Lee Diversion (222, 223,
224 and 22S). Part of the Lee Diversion and grassland east and
west of the Lee Diversion (226 an 227). Grassland to property
known as the Greaves Pumping Station north-west of the
aqueduct (228). Grassland north-west of the aqueduct and south-
east of the River lee Diversion (229). Grassland adjacent to, an
part of the aqueduct north-west of, the Greaves Pumping Station
(230). Grassland adjacent to, and to part of the aqueduct north
of, the Greaves Pumping Station (231). Part of access road and
grassland to the Greaves Pumping Station and to the Banbury
Reservoir Sailing Centre (232). Grassland east and west of the
River Lee Diversion and the aqueduct, and parts of the
Diversion and the aqueduct all east of the Hastingwood Trading
Easte and north of the Greaves Pumping Station (233).
Grassland and access road east of the Greaves Pumping Station
and west of Folly Lane (234 and 235). Part of verge on the east
of Harbet Road (236 and 237). Shrubland formng part of the Lee
Valley Regional Park to the east of Harbet Road (236A). Part of
hardstanding east of Harbert Road (237A). Part of forecourt to
premises known as the Queensway and Ultimate Warehouse
together with the half width of the adjoining access road (238).
Part of forecourt to premises known as Valley House, Harbet
Road together with the half widths of the adjoining access roads
(239). Part of forecourt to premises known as Heals Distribution
Centre, Harbet Road together with the half widths of the
adjoining access roads (240). Part of forecourt to premises
occupied by MK. Electrics Limited, Harbet Road together with
the half widths of the adjoining access roads (241). Part of Harbet
road north of the Hastingwood Trading Estate (242). Part of car
park to Lee Valley Trading Estate north-east of Harbet Road
(242A). Part of forecourt to premises occupied by State Room
Stonehill Furniture, together with the adjoining half width of
access road (243). Part of hardstanding and car parking area to
the site known as the Hastingwood Trading Estate (244, 244A
and 2344B).

SCHEDULE 2
In the London Borough ofEnfield

Part of car park south of Angel Road, west of Cross Street and
north of Raynham Road (S9B).

In the London Borough of Waltham Forest
Shrubland and trees forming part of the Lee Valley Regional

Park south of Angel Road and east of the Queensway and
Ultimate Warehouse (193A).

SCHEDULE 3
In the London Borough ofEnfield

Parts of access roads, grass and Shrubland and hardstanding in
north-west area of Gas Works site south of Albany Road (142 A).

SCHEDULE 4
In the London Borough ofEnfield

Parts of access roads, grass and shrubland and hardstanding in
north-west area of Gas Works south of Albany Road (142B).
15th October 1987. (16 SI)

ACQUISITION OF LAND ACT 1981

The A 406 London North Circular Trunk Road
(Improvement between Silver Street and Hall Lane)

Compulsory Purchase Order (No. ) 198
Pymmes Park Open Space
Kenmnghall Open Space

The Secretary of State for Transport has prepared this draft
compulsory purchase Order which he proposes to make. If made
it will authorise the purchase of land which forms part of an open
space as defined in the Acquisition of Land Act 1981, that is, land
laid out as a public garden or used for the purposes of public
recreation or a disused burial ground. This land is described in
the First Schedule to this notice and is shown coloured pink on
the map referred to in paragraph 4 below.

The Order will be subject to special parliamentary procedure
unless the Secretary of State for the Environment gives a
certificate under section 19(1) of the Act. He has been asked by
the Secretary of State for Transport to certify under section 19( 1)
(a) that he is satisfied that other land has been or will be given in
exchange for the open space, which is not less in area and is
equally advantageous to any persons entitled to rights of
common or other rights and to the public, and that the land given
in exchange has been or will be vested in the persons in whom the
open space was vested, subject to the like rights, trusts and
incidents as attach to the open space. The land proposed to be
given in exchange is described in the second Schedule hereto and
is shown coloured green on the map referred to in paragraph 4
below.

The Secretary of State is required to give formal notice of his
intention to issue a certificate before he reaches a decision, to
give an opportunity for objections to be made. He hereby gives
such notice. Any representations or objections in relation to this
proposal should be made in writing and addressed to the
Department of the Environment, Room 2543, Millbank Tower,
21-24 Millbank, London SW1P 4QU, before 19th November
1987, quoting the reference GLP/5011/10/1.

Maps showing the open space proposed to be purchased and
the land proposed to be given in exchange may be seen, without
payment, at the offices of the Department of Transport, Room
C7/06,2 Marsham Street, London SW1P 3EB and at the London
Borough of Enfield, the Civic Centre, Silver Street, Enfield;
Edmonton Library, Fore Street, Edmonton; the London Borough
of Waltham Forest, the Town Hall, Forest Road, Walthamstow
London E.ll; the Municipal Offices, Ridgeway, Chingford;
London E.4; the Angel Community Centre, Angel Road,
Edmonton, London N.I8; and South Chingford Branch Library,
Hall Lane, Chingford, London E.4, at all reasonable hours.

The Secretary of State for the Environment may, if he
considers it expedient, hold a public local inquiry into the matter.

M. M. Badcock, A Principal in the Department of the
Environment. Ref: T9042/28R/0219.

FIRST SCHEDULE
A total of 11,215 square metres of land comprising the

following:
(i) 9,865 square metres of land forming part of Pymmes Park,

shown on the plan numbered GLRT 79/36/5011/54/1-2 and
comprising grassland, trees, paths, and part of Pymme's Bropk,
along the southern boundary of the Park adjacent to Sterling
Way; and

(ii) two areas of respectively 1,075 and 275 square metres of
grassland shown on the plan numbered GLRT 79/36/5011/54/1-
3 and forming part of the Kenninghall Open Space, lying on the
southern boundary of the open space.

SECOND SCHEDULE
A total of 11,215 square metres of land shown on the plan

numbered GLRT 79/36/5011/54/1-3 and currently comprising
access roads, grass and shrubland and hardstanding in the north-
west area of the Gas Works site, south of Albany Road and east
of Kimberley Road/Ladysmith Road.
15th October 1987. (17 SI)


