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and on the north-east of Amberden Avenue, N3 (6). Part of
grassland fronting and on the west of the North Circular Road
(A406), and on the south-west of East End Road, N3 comprising
part of an open space (7). Parts of grassland on the west of the North
Circular Road, (A406), and adjacent to Basing Way, N3 comprising
part of an open space (7A). Part of embankment, including part of
structure and supports of footbridge (8). Part of footway and part
width of the North Circular Road (A406) fronting No. 5 North
Circular Road, N3 (9). All interests (other than those of the Crown)
in part of footway and part width of the North Circular Road (A406)
fronting Nos. 5 to 9 (inclusive) North Circular Road, N3 (10,11,12,
13,14 and IS). Parts of car park, gardens, paved forecourts and sign
of Manor Cottage Public House, East End Road, N2 and adjoining
half width of Briarfield Avenue (16). The right to construct and
maintain a retaining wall upon land being parts of car park and
garden of the Manor Cottage Public House, East End Road, N2 and
the right to construct and maintain the foundations for said
retaining wall in the said land (16A). Parts of paved forecourts and
gardens of the Manor Cottage Public House, East End Road, N2
(17). All interests (other than those of the Crown) in parts of
footway, bus shelter, bus stop and part width of the North Circular
Road (A406) fronting No. 10 North Circular Road, N3 (18). All
interests (other than those of the Crown) in part of footway and part
width of the North Circular Road (A406) fronting No. 11 North
Circular Road, N3 (19). All interests (other than those of the Crown)
in parts of footway, grass verge and part width of the North Circular
Road (A406) fronting No. 12 North Circular Road, N3 (20). Parts
of footway, grass verge, posts and part width of the North Circular
Road (A406) adjoining No. 28 Briarfield Avenue, N3 and accessway
between No. 12 North Circular Road and rear of No. 28 Briarfield
Avenue (21). Rough land and earth embankment on the north-east
of the North Circular Road (A406), N2 between the railway
embankment and Briarfield Avenue adjoining Briar Close, N2 and
half width of Briarfield Avenue (22). The right to construct and
maintain a retaining wall on rough land adjoining Briar Close, N2
and the right to construct and maintain the foundations for said
retaining wall in the said land (22A). Rough land adjoining railway
embankment and Briar Close, N2 (22B). The right to construct and
maintain a retaining wall on parts of footway and roadway forming
part of turning head on Briar Close, N2 and the right to construct
and maintain the foundation for said retaining wall in the said land
(22C). Rough land adjoining railway embankment and north of
Briar Close, N2 (22D). Parts of footway, grass verge, posts and part
width of the North Circular Road (A406) adjoining No. 77 Briarfield
Avenue, N3 (23). Parts of footway, grass verge, posts and part width
of the North Circular Road (A406) adjoining No. 77 Briarfield
Avenue, N3 and Nos. 14 to 28 North Circular Road, N3 and width
of Rosemary Avenue (24). Part of rough land on the south-east of
the North Circular Road (A406), N2 adjoining Briar Close between
railway embankment and Briarfield Avenue (25) (in unknown
ownership). Parts of rough land and earth embankment on the
south-east of the North Circular Road (A406), N2, between railway
embankment and Briarfield Avenue (26 and 27). Rough land and
embankment adjoining bridge over Northern Line (No HB35)
North Circular Road (A406), N3 (28 and 28A). The right to
construct and maintain a bridge over part of rough land, railway
embankment, tracks and installations adjoining bridge over
Northern Line (No HB3S) North Circular Road (A404), N3 (28B).
Rough land on the south-east of the North Circular Road (A406),
N3 adjoining railway embankment (28C). Parts of rough land and
earth embankment adjoining bridge over Northern Line (No HB3S)
and on the north-west of the North Circular Road (A406) N3,
comprising part of an open space (29 and 29A). Earth embankment
and rough land between railway embankment and Long Lane,
adjoining and to the south-east of the North Circular Road, (A406)
N2, comprising part of an open space (30). Rough land adjoining
railway embankment and Manor Cottages Approach, N2
comprising part of an open space (30A). The right to construct and
maintain a retaining wall on part of rough land adjoining earth
embankment and Manor Cottages Approach, N2 comprising part of
an open space and the right to construct and maintain the
foundations for said retaining wall in the said land (30B). Rough
land adjoining Manor Cottages Approach, N2 comprising part of an
open space (30C). Part of passageway to the rear of 284 to 290 Long
Lane, N2 (31). House, front and back gardens known as 284 Long
Lane, N2 (32). Maisonette, front and back gardens known as
282/282A Long Lane, N2 (33). Rough land, shrub land, earth
embankment and part of public footpath leading from North
Circular Road to Tarling Road and adjoining to and on the south-
east of the North Circular Road (A406) between Long Lane and
High Road, N2 comprising part of an open space (34).

The right to construct and maintain a retaining wall on part of

rough land and shrub land adjoining Long Lane, N.2, comprising
part of an open space and the right to construct and maintain the
foundations for said retaining wall in the said land (34A). The right
to construct and maintain a retaining wall on part of allotment
gardens on the south-east of the North Circular Road, (A406) N.2,
and the right to construct and maintain the foundations for the said
retaining wall in the said land (34B). Part of earth embankment on
the south-east of the North Circular Road, (A406), N.2, comprising
pan of an open space (34C). The right to construct and maintain a
retaining wall on rough land and scrub land on the south-east of the
North Circular Road, (A406), N.2, comprising part of an open space
and the right to construct and maintain the foundations for the said
retaining wall in the said land (34D). The right to construct and
maintain a retaining wall in part of allotment gardens adjoining
public footpath from the North Circular Road, (A406), to Tarling
Road N.2, and the right to construct and maintain the foundations
for said retaining wall in the said land (34E). The right to construct
and maintain a retaining wall in part of rough land and scrub land
on the south-east of the North Circular Road, (A406) N.2,
comprising part of an open space, and the right to construct and
maintain the foundations for said retaining wall in the said land
(34F). Garage, shed, greenhouse and parts of garden of No. 4
Pointalls Close, N.3, (35, 35A and 35B). Part of footpath between 3
and 4 Pointtalls Close N.3, (36 and 36A) (in unknown ownership).
Part of front garden of No. 3 Pointalls Close, N.3 (37). Part of
footpath adjoining Avondale Road (38). Part of land adjoining
footpath, Avondale Road, N.3 (38A). Part of site of electricity sub-
station adjoining Avondale Road, N.3 (39). Part of garden of Barnet
Mortuary and disinfecting station, North Circular Road, (A406),
N.3 (40). Part of playing fields of Tudor Primary School, North
Circular Road, N.3, (41 and 41A). Part of allotment gardens
adjoining public footpath between North Circular Road, (A406)
and Tarling Road, N2. (42,42 A and 43). Part of allotment gardens
and rough land adjoining public footpath between North Circular
Road (A406) and Tarling Road N.2 (43A). Rough land and shrub
land on the south-east of the North Circular Road, (A406), N.2,
comprising part of an open space (44). The right to construct and
maintain a retaining wall in part of rough land and scrub land on the
south-east of the North Circular Road, (A406), N.2, comprising part
of an open space, and the right to construct and maintain the
foundations for said retaining wall in the said land (44A and 44B).
Part of garden allotments on west of High Road, N.2, comprising
part of an open space (44C). Rough land on west of High Road, N.2,
comprising part of an open space (44D). Rough land and shrub
adjoining High Road, N.2, comprising part of an open space (45).
Rough land on west of High Road, N.2, comprising part of an open
space (45 A). The right to construct and maintain a retaining wall on
rough land adjoining and to the west of High Road, N.2, comprising
part of an open space and the right to construct and maintain the
foundations for said retaining wall in the said land (45B and 45D).
Rough land and part of playground on west of High Street, N.2,
(45C). Rough land adjoining 373 High Road, N.2, on west of High
Road, N.2 (45E). Rough land and shrub land adjoining the High
Road, N.2 (45F). The right to construct and maintain a retaining
wall in part of rough land adjoining west of High Road, N.2, and the
right to construct and maintain the foundations for the said
retaining wall in the said land (45G). All interests (other than those
of the Crown) in parts of accessway and front garden of 354 High
Road, N.2, (46). All interests (other than those of the Crown) in
house, garage, front and back gardens known as 4 Brookdale, North
Circular Road, N.2 (47). All interests (other than those of the
Crown) in ornamental garden, advertisement hoarding and rough
land comprising part of site of site of 356—360 High Road N.2 (48).
All interests (other than those of the Crown) in house, front garden
and parts of back garden and accessway known 362 High Road, N.2
(49). All interest (other than those of the Crown) in maisonett, front
and back gardens, known as 2-2A Brookdale, North Circular Road,
(A406) N.2, (50). All interests (other than those of the Crown) in
ornamental gardens, part of store yard, advertisement hoardings
and half width of Strawberry Vale, adjoining 364-370 High Road,
N.2, (51). Flat, car showroom and part of forecourt known as AFG
Finchley, 1-1A Brookdale, North Circular Road, (A406) N.2, (52).
The right to construct and maintain a retaining wall in part of AFG
Finchley forecourt adjoining 397-401 High Road, N.2, and the right
to construct and maintain the foundations for the said retaining wall
in the said land (52 A). Part of forecourt known as AFG Finchley, 1-
1A Brookdale, North Circular Road, (A406) and adjoining 397-401
High Road, N.I2 (52B). Part of forecourt and accessway adjoining
407 High Road N.I2 (53). The right to construct and maintain a
retaining wall in part of forecourt and accessway adjoinging 407
High Road, N.I2, and the right to construct and maintain the
foundations for said retaining wall in the said land (53A).
Temporary car parking, advertisement hoardings and site of 372-380


