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State Intelligence
PRIVY COUNCIL OFFICE

UNIVERSITIES OF OXFORD AND CAMBRIDGE ACT 1923

A Statute made by the Governing Body of the University of
Cambridge on 2nd April 1993, amending Statute E has been
submitted for the approval of Her Majesty in Council, and notice of
its having been so submitted is published in accordance with the
provisions of the Universities of Oxford and Cambridge Act 1923.

The purpose of this Statute is to award prizes from the R.A.
Nicholson Fund for distinction in the study of Arabic and Persian,
not only to students of distinction of both languages taken together,
but also to students of one of the two taken alone, also to make the
income of the Fund available for the encouragement of the study of
Arabic and Persian in the University. (6 SI)

BURIAL ACT 1853

Notice is hereby given that representations have been made to Her
Majesty in Council by the Secretary of State for the Environment
that burials should be discontinued in the following places of burial
and that Her Majesty in Council was pleased on 31st March 1993 to
order that such representations to be taken into consideration by a
Committee of the Privy Council on 9th June 1993.

(1) The Churchyard of St. Mary the Virgin, Langley Marish,
Berkshire.

(2) St. Stephen's Churchyard, Grane, Rossendale,-Lancashire.
(4SI)

HOME OFFICE

Home Office, Queen Anne's Gate,
London SW1H9AT.

The QUEEN has been pleased by Warrant under Her Majesty's Royal
Sign Manual, bearing date 19th March 1993 to appoint Sir Michael
Jeremiah Colman Bt, to be First Church Estate Commissioner in the
room of Sir Douglas Arthur Lovelock KCB. Sir Michael Colman's
appointment will date from 1st April 1993. (1 SI)

THE WELSH OFFICE
Y SWYDDFA GYMREIG

TOWN AND COUNTRY PLANNING ACT 1990

The diversion of Highways (Ystradowen, Cowbridge) South
Glamorgan) Order 199

The Secretary of State for Wales hereby gives notice that he proposes
to make an Order under section 248 of the Town and Country
Planning Act 1990 to authorise the diversion of the highway
described in the Schedule to this notice to facilitate the movement of
traffic on and in the interests of the safety of the users of the main
highway, which is to be constructed in accordance with planning
permission granted on appeal on 23rd July 1991.

The Order requires the provision of a new highway which shall be
the diversion, and which shall be maintainable at the public expense
and for which the highway authority will be South Glamorgan
County Council.

During the 28 days from 14th April 1993, copies of the Order and
annexed plan may be inspected free of charge during normal office
hours at the offices of The Vale of Glamorgan Borough Council,
Holton Road, Barry or may be obtained free of charge from the
address, and quoting the reference shown below.

With the above mentioned period of 28 days any person may by
notice to the Welsh Office, Highways Directorate Roads
Administration Division, Government Buildings, Ty Glas Road,
Llanishen, Cadiff CF4 SPL, (quoting reference ZC510-5-7-14),
object to the making of the Order. In the preparation of an objection
it should be borne in mind that the substance of any objection or
representation may be communicated to other people who may be
affected by it.

R. D. Chaffey, Roads Administration Division Welsh Office

SCHEDULE

(All distances are approximate)

The highway to be stopped up is at Ystradowen, Cowbridge in the
County of South Glamorgan. It is that irregular shaped length of un-
named highway immediately to the west of the property known as
Ty Gof which extends from a point 10 metres north of its junction
with Cowbridge Road (A4222) in a general northerly direction for a
distance of 41 metres, having a maximum width of 4 metres and a
total area of 131 square metres. (486)


