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them with their proxies. Unless they surrender their security, secured
Creditors must give particulars of their security and its value if they
wish to vote at the Meeting.

By Order of the Board.
(835) R. Goss, Director/Secretary

charge, at 306 Portland Road, Hove, East Sussex BN3 SLP, between
10 a.m. and 4 p.m., on the 2 business days preceding the date of the
Meeting stated above.

By Order of the Board.
(158) L. R. Goble, Director

CHALLS UK LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Booth White, 3-5 Rickmansworth Road, Watford
WD1 7JH, on 1st June 1995, at 3 p.m., for the purposes mentioned
in sections 99 to 101 of the said Act. Creditors wishing to vote at the
Meeting must lodge their proxy, together with a full statement of
account, at the Registered Office, 3-5 Rickmansworth Road,
Watford WD17JH, not later than 12 noon on the preceding business
day. For the purposes of voting, a secured Creditor is required
(unless he surrenders his security) to lodge at 3-5 Rickmansworth
Road, Watford WD1 7JH, before the Meeting, a statement giving
particulars of his security, the date when it was given and the value at
which it is assessed. Notice is also hereby given, pursuant to section
98(2)(a) of the Insolvency Act 1986, that P. W. J. Hartigan, of 3-5
Rickmansworth Road, Watford WD1 7JH, is qualified to act as an
Insolvency Practitioner in relation to the above Company and will
furnish Creditors, free of charge, with such information concerning
the above Company's affairs as they may reasonably require.

By Order of the Board.
G. Burchell, Director

17th May 1995. (836)

CROWNSOM LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at 141 Great Charles Street, Birmingham B3 3LG, on
Thursday, 1st June 1995, at 3 p.m., for the purposes mentioned in
sections 99,100 and 101 of the said Act. Creditors should forward a
statement of their claim by 12 noon on Wednesday, 31st May 1995,
to Henry Edward Hayes and James Anthony McCann, of Poppleton
& Appleby, 141 Great Charles Street, Birmingham B3 3LG, who
will, free of charge, supply to those whose claims have been lodged
in writing by the prescribed time on that day such information
concerning the Company's affairs as they may reasonably require.

A. Z. Szpakowski, Director
17th May 1995. (837)

TELE-LINK MARKETING & SALES LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at 141 Great Charles Street, Birmingham B3 3LG, on
Thursday, 1st June 1995, at 3 p.m., for the purposes mentioned in
sections 99,100 and 101 of the said Act. Creditors should forward a
statement of their claim by 12 noon on Wednesday, 31st May 1995,
to Henry Edward Hayes and James Anthony McCann, of Poppleton
& Appleby, 141 Great Charles Street, Birmingham B3 3LG, who
will, free of charge, supply to those whose claims have been lodged
in writing by the prescribed time on that day such information
concerning the Company's affairs as they may reasonably require.

A. Z. Szpakowski, Director
17th May 1995. (838)

GOPOL ELECTRICAL LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at The Courtlands Hotel, 19-27 The Drive, Hove BN3
3JE, on 5th June 1995, at 3 p.m., for the purposes mentioned in
sections 99 to 101 of the said Act. Creditors wishing to vote at the
Meeting must lodge their proxy, together with a full statement of
account, at the Registered Office, 306 Portland Road, Hove, East
Sussex BN3 5LP, not later than 12 noon on 4th June 1995. For the
purposes of voting, a Secured Creditor is required (unless he
surrenders his security) to lodge at 306 Portland Road, Hove, East
Sussex BN3 5LP, before the Meeting, a statement giving particulars
of his security, the date when it was given and the value at which it
is assessed. Notice is further given that a list of the names and
addresses of the Company's Creditors may be inspected, free of

WEST AGGREGATES LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Clareville House, 26-27 Oxendon Street, London
SW1Y 4EP, on 6th June 1995, at 11.30 a.m., for the purposes
mentioned in sections 99 to 101 of the said Act. Creditors wishing
to vote at the Meeting must lodge their proxy, together with a full
statement of account at the registered office, Clareville House,
26-27 Oxendon Street, London SW1Y 4EP, not later than 12 noon
on 5th June 1995. For the purposes of voting, a secured Creditor is
required (unless he surrenders his security) to lodge at Clareville
House, 26-27 Oxendon Street, London SW1Y 4EP, before the
Meeting, a statement giving particulars of his security, the date when
it was given and the value at which is is assessed. Stephen Blandford
Ryman and Nicholas Hugh O'Reilly of Rothman Pantall & Co.,
Clareville House, 26-27 Oxendon Street, London SW1Y 4EP, are
persons qualified to act as Insolvency Practitioners in relation to the
Company and they will furnish Creditors, free of charge, with such
information as to the Company's affairs as the Creditors may
reasonably require until 5th June 1995.

By Order of the Board.
(155) R. J. West, Director

EUROPEAN ELECTRONIC BUSINESS CENTRES LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Rothman Pantall, Clareville House, 26 Oxendon
Street, London SW1Y 4EP, on 14th June 1995, at 11 a.m., for the
purposes mentioned in sections 99 to 101 of the said Act. Creditors
wishing to vote at the Meeting must lodge their proxy, together with
a full statement of account at the registered office, Clareville House,
26-27 Oxendon Street, London SW1Y 4EP, not later than 12 noon
on 13th June 1995. For the purposes of voting, a secured Creditor
is required (unless he surrenders his security) to lodge at Clareville
House, 26-27 Oxendon Street, London SW1Y 4EP, before the
Meeting, a statement giving particulars of his security, the date when
it was given and the value at which is is assessed. Stephen Blandford
Ryman and Nicholas Hugh O'Reilly of Rothman Pantall & Co.,
Clareville House, 26-27 Oxendon Street, London SW1Y 4EP, are
persons qualified to act as Insolvency Practitioners in relation to the
Company and they will furnish Creditors, free of charge, with such
information as to the Company's affairs as the Creditors may
reasonably require until 13th June 1995.

By Order of the Board.
(152) M. G. Gosling. Director

GREENVIEW DEVELOPMENTS LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at 39 Doughty Street, London WC1N 2LF, on 30th May
1995, at 11.30a.m., for the purposes mentioned in sections 99 to 101
of the said Act. Creditors wishing to vote at the Meeting must lodge
their proxy, together with a full statement of account at the
registered office, 39 Doughty Street, London WC1N 2LF, not later
than 12 noon on 29th May 1995. For the purposes of voting, a
secured Creditor is required (unless he surrenders his security), to
lodge at 39 Doughty Street, London WC1N 2LF, before the
Meeting, a statement giving particulars of his security, the date when
it was given and the value at which it is assessed. Notice is further
given that a list of the names and addresses of the Company's
Creditors may be inspected, free of charge, at 39 Doughty Street,
London WC1N 2LF, between 10 a.m. and 4 p.m. on the two business
days preceding the date of the Meeting stated above.

By Order of the Board.

051) P. Harrison. Director


