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PARTNERSHIPS

The Peter Allan Company (a Finn), 45 Towngate, Ossett, West
Yorkshire, would be pleased to advise that Janet Mary Anderson has
from 4th March 1996 retired from the Partnership of THE PETER
ALLAN COMPANY. Allan Anderson will continue to trade as The
Peter Allan Company as a Sole Trader. (274)

DISSOLUTIONS

Notice is given that the Partnership hitherto subsisting between
David Paxton Worthy and John Whorlton Lowe, carrying on
business as Solicitors under the firm name of SNOWBALL,
WORTHY & LOWE has been dissolved as from the date of this
notice. All debts due to and owing by the said late firm will be
received and paid respectively by John Whorlton Lowe who will
carry on the said business under the firm name of Snowball, Worthy
& Lowe.

4th April 1996.

D. P. Worthy
J. W. Lowe

(264)

Notice is given that the Partnership hitherto subsisting between
Michaela June Perry and James Arthur Perry, carrying on business
as a Fruit and Vegetable Retailer under the style or firm name of
PERRY'S, has been dissolved as from 1st February 1996 so far as
concerns Michaela June Perry, who retired from that said firm. All
debts due to and owing by the said late firm will be received and paid
respectively by James Arthur Perry, who will continue to carry on
the said business under the style or firm name Perry's.
(271) M. J. Perry

Notice is hereby given that the Partnership heretofore existing
between us, the undersigned Surinder Kumar Bij and Kamala Devi
Bij and Mohanjit Singh Bhatia and Vijay Bhatia, carrying on
business at Unit IS, Barratt Industrial Park, Park Avenue, Southall,
Middlesex UB1 3AF, under the name of M&S VEG AND FRUIT
(U.K.), has been dissolved by mutual consent as from 21st February
1996, so far as concerns Surinder Kumar Bij and Kamala Devi Bij,
who retire from the firm, and all debts due to and owing from the

said late firm will be received and paid by the said continuing
Partners, who will continue to carry on the said business under the
same style or firm.

S. K. Bij
K. D. Bij
M. S. Bhatia

(275) V. Bhatia

Notice is given that the Partnership formerly subsisting between us,
the undersigned Richard Dale and Peter Christopher Ritchings,
carrying on business as Motor Service Engineers at Units 2 and 3,
Western Road Industrial Estate, Western Road, Stratford-upon-
Avon, Warwickshire, under the name of D & R MOTOR
SERVICES, has been dissolved by mutual consent on 5th April 1996
and that all debts due to and owing by the late firm will be received
and paid jointly by the said Richard Dale and Peter Christopher
Ritchings jointly, and that Peter Christopher Ritchings will continue
to carry on the business under the same name.

R. Dale
P. C. Ritchings

6th April 1996. (328)

MISCELLANEOUS

J. H. FRYER LIMITED STAFF PENSION SCHEME

THE TRUSTEE ACT 1925, SECTION 27

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 27 of the Trustee Act
1925, that the J. H. Fryer Limited Staff Pension Scheme ("The
Scheme") established by J H Fryer Limited, formerly of Great
Northern Road, Derby, is winding-up.

Any person who has a claim against, entitlement under, or interest
in the Scheme (including, for the avoidance of doubt, any part-time
employees of that Company) is hereby required to provide written
particulars to Eversheds Pension Trustees Limited, 11 St. James
Court, Friar Gate, Derby DEI 1ST (ref. RGLD) on or before 19th
July 1996. After this date the Trustees will proceed to distribute the
assets of the Scheme amongst the persons entitled to them, having
regard only to claims of which they have prior written notice and will
not be liable for the assets of the Scheme or any part of them so
distributed to any person of whose claim or demand the Trustees had
not then had notice.

Eversheds Pension Trustees Limited
17th April 1996. (362)


