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Park, Crawley, West Sussex RH10 6AG, not later than noon on the
business day before. Notice is also hereby given, pursuant to section
98(2)(a) of the Insolvency Act 1986, that Graham P. Petersen, of
Ward Mackenzie, 5-6 The Courtyard, East Park, Crawley, West
Sussex RH10 6AG, is a person qualified to act as an Insolvency
Practitioner in relation to the above Company, who will, during the
period before the day of the Meeting, furnish Creditors, free of
charge, with such information concerning the Company's affairs as
they may reasonably require.

T. S. J. Smith, Director

3rd December 1997. (207)

JOHNSON ELECTRICAL & INSTRUMENTATION
LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at 27 The Downs, Altrincham, Cheshire WAI4 2QD, on
16th December 1997, at 10.30 a.m., for the purposes mentioned in
sections 99 to 101 of the said Act. One of the matters that may be the
subject of Resolutions at the Meeting is the terms on which the Joint
Liquidators are to be remunerated. In addition the Meeting will be
called upon to approve the costs of preparing the statement of affairs
and covening the Meeting. Pursuant to section 98(2) of the Act, lists
of the names and addresses of the Company's Creditors will be
available, free of charge, at the offices of Lines Henry, 27 The
Downs, Altrincham, Cheshire WAI4 2QD, on the two business days
falling before the day of the Meeting.

A. Johnson, Director

16th December 1997. (210)

GELDA FASHIONS LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Rutland House, 44 Masons Hill, Bromley, Kent
BR2 9EQ, on 15th December 1997, at 10.15 a.m., for the purposes
mentioned in sections 99 to 101 of the said Act. A list of the names
and addresses of the Company's Creditors will be available for
inspection, free of charge, at Rutland House, 44 Masons Hill,
Bromley, Kent BR2 9EQ, during the two business days preceding the
above Meeting.

By Order of the Board.
H. Uzun, Director

28th November 1997. (212)

DEALERSTONE LTD.

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at 27 The Downs, Altrincham, Cheshire WAI4 2QD, on
18th December 1997, at 11.30 a.m., for the purposes mentioned in
sections 99 to 101 of the said Act. One of the matters that may be the
subject of resolutions at the Meeting is the terms on which the joint
Liquidators are to be remunerated. In addition the Meeting will be
called upon to approve the costs of preparing the Statement of
Affairs and convening the Meeting. Pursuant of Section 98(2) of the
Act, lists of names and addresses of the Company's Creditors will be
available, free of charge, at the offices of Lines Henry, 27 The
Downs, Altrincham, Cheshire WAI4 2QD, on the two business days
falling before the day of the Meeting.

P. J. On, Director
27th November 1997. (215)

STANDENS (TONBRIDGE) LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Mackenzie House, Coach and Horses Passage, The
Pantiles, Tunbridge Wells, Kent, on Wednesday, 17th December
1997, at 11.30 a.m., for the purposes provided for in sections 99 to
101 of the said Act. For the purposes of voting, proof of debt and
Proxy forms intended to be used at the Meeting must be lodged at
the registered office of the Company, now situated at the offices of
Ward Mackenzie, 5-6 The Courtyard, East Park, Crawley, West
Sussex RH10 6AG, not later than noon on the business day before.
Notice is also hereby given, pursuant to section 98(2)(a) of the
Insolvency Act 1986, that Graham P. Petersen, of Ward Mackenzie,

5-6 The Courtyard, East Park, Crawley, West Sussex RH10 6AG, is
qualified to act as an Insolvency Practitioner in relation to the above
Company and will, during the period before the day of the Meeting,
furnish Creditors with such information concerning the Company's
affairs as they may reasonably require.

G. King, Director
2nd December 1997. (220)

STOKE PACKAGING SOLUTIONS LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that Meetings of Members and of the Creditors of the above-
named Company will be held at Church Steps House, Queensway,
Halesowen, West Midlands B63 4AB, on 16th December 1997 at 2
p.m. and 2.30 p.m., for the purposes mentioned in sections 100 and
101 of the said Act. David T. Greensill, of Mayfields, Church Steps
House, Queensway, Halesowen, West Midlands B63 4AB, is a
person qualified to act as an Insolvency Practitioner in relation to the
Company who will, during the period before the day of the Meeting,
furnish Creditors, free of charge, with such information concerning
the Company's affairs as they may reasonably require.

By Order of the Board.
M. Traini

1st December 1997. (326)

CONTRA REALISATIONS LIMITED
(formerly known as Kel-Like International Limited)

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 98 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a Meeting of the Creditors of the above-named Company
will be held at Pannel House, 6 Queen Street, Leeds LSI 2TW, on
Friday, 12th December 1997 at 2.p.m., for the purposes mentioned
in sections 99 to 101 of the said Act. Creditors wishing to vote at the
Meeting must lodge their proxy, together with a full statement of
account at the registered office, 78 Hatton Garden, London EC1N
8JA not later than 12 noon on 11 th December 1997. For the purposes
of voting, a secured Creditor is required (unless he surrenders his
security) to lodge at 78 Hatton Garden, London EC IN 8JA before
the Meeting, a statement giving particulars of his security, the date
when it was given and the value at which it is assessed. Notice is
further given that a list of the names and addresses of the Company's
Creditors may be inspected, free of charge, at 78 Hatton Garden,
London EC IN 8JA between 10 a.m. and 4 p.m. on the two business
days preceding the date of the Meeting stated above.

By Order of the Board.
G. Sparla, Director

(327)

M M MANN LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, that in accordance with Rule 4.127 of the
Insolvency Rules 1986, that a General Meeting of Creditors of the
above-named Company will be held at the offices of Cork Gully,
Temple Court, 35 Bull Street, Birmingham B4 6JT, on 9th January
1998 , at 10 a.m., for the purposes of obtaining approval of the
Liquidator's remuneration and finalisation of this matter. Subject to
Insolvency Rule 4.60/6.86 requires us to have regard to the
convenience of the Creditors when convening any General Meeting.
In our experience Creditors seldom attend such Meetings and this
Meeting is therefore being convened in our own office in order to
minimise costs. Should any Creditor wishing to attend the Meeting
consider that the proposed venue is inconvenient, we will reconvene
the Meeting at an alternative venue to be agreed. Any request to
reconvene the Meeting should be made within the next seven days so
that we may ensure all Creditors are aware of the revised
arrangements.

S. J. Taylor, Joint Liquidator
3rd December 1997. (325)

G W MANAGEMENT LIMITED

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 48 of the Insolvency Act
1986, that a General Meeting of the unsecured Creditors of the
above-named Company will be held at 8 Baker Street, London
W1M IDA, on 19th December 1997, at 11 a.m., for the purpose of
having a report laid before the Meeting and of hearing any
explanation that may be given by the Administrative Receivers.


